
¾" x 2" Nipple 150 No Bid No Bid $2.40 No Bid No Bid $1.78 No Bid No Bid $1.88 No Bid $2.53 $2.64 $1.62

¾" x 3" Nipple 1000 No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid No Bid $1.88 No Bid No Bid $2.12 No Bid $2.73 $2.98 $1.76

¾" x 4" Nipple 500 No Bid No Bid $3.39 No Bid No Bid $2.47 No Bid No Bid $2.65 No Bid $3.27 $3.73 $2.20

¾" x 6" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid $4.79 No Bid No Bid $3.42 No Bid No Bid $3.74 No Bid $4.52 $5.27 $3.22

¾" x 8" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $5.99 No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid $9.80 No Bid $5.38

¾" x 10" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid $9.27 No Bid No Bid $6.78 No Bid No Bid $7.24 No Bid $9.89 $6.19 $6.23

3/4" 90° 50 No Bid No Bid $2.78 No Bid No Bid $1.92 No Bid No Bid $2.22 No Bid $2.94 $2.86 $2.21

1" x 2" Nipple 2,000 No Bid No Bid $3.58 No Bid No Bid $2.68 No Bid No Bid $2.79 No Bid $3.81 $3.93 $2.32

1" x 4" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid $4.69 No Bid No Bid $3.57 No Bid No Bid $3.68 No Bid $4.53 $4.90 $3.17

1" x 5" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid $5.52 No Bid No Bid $4.18 No Bid No Bid $4.31 No Bid $5.32 $6.07 $3.71

1" x 6" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid $6.56 No Bid No Bid $5.80 No Bid No Bid $5.12 No Bid $6.46 $7.22 $4.41

1" x 8" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid $10.67 No Bid No Bid $8.07 No Bid No Bid $8.33 No Bid $8.23 No Bid $7.18

1" 90° 750 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid No Bid $3.40 No Bid No Bid $3.87 No Bid $5.75 $4.99 $3.72

1-1/4" x 1" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid $9.76 No Bid No Bid $6.98 No Bid No Bid $7.81 No Bid $10.68 $49.70 $7.78

1-1/2" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid $10.47 No Bid No Bid $7.20 No Bid No Bid $8.39 No Bid $11.47 $10.79 $8.37

1-1/2" x 1" 90° 100 No Bid No Bid $13.76 No Bid No Bid $9.66 No Bid No Bid $11.33 No Bid $13.79 $14.18 $10.60

2" Plug 25 No Bid No Bid $5.67 No Bid No Bid $3.99 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $6.71 $2.56 $4.52

2" x 1-1/2" 90° 10 No Bid No Bid $19.95 No Bid No Bid $14.10 No Bid No Bid $15.95 No Bid $7.22 $20.54 $15.90

2" x 3/4" Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid $17.59 No Bid No Bid $12.79 No Bid No Bid $14.06 No Bid $25.65 No Bid $14.04

Pipe Thread Sealant                                                           

Blue Monster - PTFE #76005                     
25 No Bid No Bid $16.86 No Bid No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $22.38 No Bid $25.41 $18.12 $21.10

Pipe Thread Sealant Tape                                                            

Blue Monster - PTFE #70885
100 No Bid No Bid $4.33 No Bid No Bid $3.15 No Bid No Bid $4.23 No Bid $4.59 $6.25 $3.31

Excess Flow Valve Series 700 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.76 $90.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.49

Cast Iron Meter Bar With Cast Integral Swivels 

#6620-FCDG-1x1  OEMO Outlet Union w/ Flat 

Gasket               

500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.54 $42.00 No Bid $48.23 No Bid $47.21 No Bid No Bid

IRBY

BLACK IRON FITTINGS

EXCESS FLOW VALVES

CAST IRON METER BAR

No Bid$29.25 $15.25No Bid $11.23No Bid$8.00No Bid

A.Y. MCDONALD

Pipe Thread Sealant Tape                                                            

Blue Monster - PTFE #70826
25 No Bid

ED YOUNGTRI-STATE METER G&C SUPPLY

No Bid$10.62No Bid No Bid
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1-1/2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17190 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Line Stop Fitting #H-171155 15 No Bid No Bid $199.31 No Bid No Bid $168.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17190 25 No Bid No Bid $224.14 No Bid No Bid $103.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Line Stop Fitting Bottom Out #H-17160 25 No Bid No Bid $225.42 No Bid No Bid $190.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4" X 3" Line Stop Fitting #H-17260 5 No Bid No Bid $3,323.12 No Bid No Bid $2,526.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4" Line Stop Fitting Bottom Out #H-17260 10 No Bid No Bid $1,248.34 No Bid No Bid $1,095.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

R-275/AC-250/Sonix IQ 250 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $271.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

R-415/AL-425/Sonix IQ 425                           400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $419.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AL-800/Sonix 880 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,276.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Valve Box Frame & Top 100 No Bid No Bid $199.38 No Bid No Bid $212.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $258.89

Fisher HSR - ¾" x 1" conn.                                                       

3/16" orifice, 5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
1,000 $103.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher 627-R - ¾" conn.                                                                        

¼" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring
500 $209.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid $227.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher CS400IR - 1-1/2" conn.                   

1/4" orifice,    1 - 2 psig spring
15 $366.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

American SR113 - 3/4" x 1" conn.            

5/16" orifice, 1.8 - 2.0 psig spring
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

¾" Tap Tee - #H-18102 500 No Bid No Bid $37.34 No Bid No Bid $34.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3/4" x 3 Nipple Thread x Weld, Seamless 

Heavy wall
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.41 No Bid No Bid $4.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.29

1" Cap, weld 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.06 No Bid No Bid $15.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.77

2" Tee, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.75 No Bid No Bid $34.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.17

2" 45°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid $13.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.48

2" 90°, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.60 No Bid No Bid $14.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.96

2" 4-hole Flange 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.20 No Bid No Bid $23.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.30

2" 4-hole Flange, Blind 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.05 No Bid No Bid $18.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.60

2" 4-hole Flange Kit 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.87

LINE STOP FITTINGS

GAS REGULATORS

TAP TEES

GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS

VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP

WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS
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4" 45°, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid $34.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.95

4" 90°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid $34.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.26

4" x 2" Reducer, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.88 No Bid No Bid $36.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.93

6" x 4" Reducer, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.15 No Bid No Bid $62.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $61.57

6" Cap, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 No Bid No Bid $54.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.55

6" Tee, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.28 No Bid No Bid $127.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $122.46

6" 45°, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.08 No Bid No Bid $61.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.92

6" 90°, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.00 No Bid No Bid $75.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.73

3/4" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid $174.63 No Bid No Bid $119.00 No Bid No Bid $158.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.09

2" Valve - Weld x Weld 100 No Bid No Bid $278.98 No Bid No Bid $191.00 $267.00 No Bid $200.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $209.46

4" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid $879.30 No Bid No Bid $635.00 $739.00 No Bid $669.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $714.00

6" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid No Bid $1,480.05 No Bid No Bid $1,125.00 $2,262.00 No Bid $1,145.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,221.50

Dresser ¾" Style 90 Self-locking 

Compression End Cap
50 No Bid No Bid $25.49 No Bid No Bid $29.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.39

Romet RM1500 Hub Configuration,       

Adem-PTZ
15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,776.26 No Bid No Bid $3,004.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Rotary Gas Meter (2M) Counter-drive 

version
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,762.36 No Bid No Bid $2,068.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rotary Gas Meter (3M) Counter-drive 

version
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,821.18 No Bid No Bid $2,309.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rotary Gas Meter (5M) Counter-drive 

version
2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,374.12 No Bid No Bid $2,974.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Barrel Locks 1000 No Bid No Bid $6.58 No Bid No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.40

Barrel Lock Key - Blue 10 No Bid No Bid $96.20 No Bid No Bid $63.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.11

Master Lock #3 - Keyed 3210 100 No Bid No Bid $11.98 No Bid No Bid $11.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.48

3/4" Meter Valve 750 No Bid No Bid $46.22 No Bid No Bid $34.00 No Bid No Bid $34.75 $16.70 No Bid No Bid $37.88

3/4" Meter Valve, Insulated 50 No Bid No Bid $58.98 No Bid No Bid $41.50 No Bid No Bid $43.45 $22.30 No Bid No Bid $47.34

BARREL LOCKS

METER VALVES

WELD VALVES 

GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS

ROTARY GAS METER SETS

WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS (CONTINUED)
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Pulsimatic Transmitter 1 Pulse/Revolution 

#300-2P-1+301-0013
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $365.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PULSIMATIC TRANSMITTERS

BIDDER DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - VENDOR BID MATERIAL AS PACKAGE, NOT ITEMS

LOW BIDDER

BIDDER DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - VENDOR ADDED TERMS & CONDITIONS

BIDDER DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - IMPORT MATERIALS (NON-DOMESTIC)


