BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT JUNE 27, 2024 @ 2:00PM

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES

* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
Brenntag Mid-South Sodium Silicofluoride $1.39
1405 Highway 136 West Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Henderson, KY 42420 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% $2.79
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Carus Chemical Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
315 5th Street Sodium Phosphate $2.94
Peru, IL 61354 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Core Chem, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
4320 Greenway Drive Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Knoxville, TN 37918-2111 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.1742
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications, or Lacks Formal Qualifications For Plant Use




GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT JUNE 27, 2024 @ 2:00PM

* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
Evoqua Water Technologies Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
2650 Tallevast Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Sarasota, FL 34243-3912 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid

Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide $3.65
Pencco, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
PO Box 600 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
San Felipe, TX 77473 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
USALCO, LLC Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
2601 Cannery Avenue Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Baltimore, MD 21226 Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.38
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications, or Lacks Formal Qualifications For Plant Use




BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT JUNE 27, 2024 @ 2:00PM

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES

* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
SNF, INC. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
1 Chemical Plant Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Riceboro, GA 31323 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.46
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Norit Americas Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3200 University Ave. Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Marshall, TX 75670 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF $1.25
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Cedar Chem Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
105 Plantation ave Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Cedartown Ga 30125 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.40
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications, or Lacks Formal Qualifications For Plant Use




GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT JUNE 27, 2024 @ 2:00PM

* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
Minteck Resources Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3725 Pentaqon Blvd. Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Suite 100 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
Beavercreek, OH 45431 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $120.00
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Dycho Company Sodium Silicofluoride $1.24
412 Meridian st Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Niota, TN 37826 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% $3.22
High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.16
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide $2.90
Aulick Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
111 Patton ct Sodium Phosphate $2.6120
Nicholasville, KY 40356 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF $1.33
Bleach, 12.5% $2.9130
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide $3.40

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications, or Lacks Formal Qualifications For Plant Use.




GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
ARQ Purifications Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
8051 E. Maplewood Ave. Suite 120 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Greenwood Village, CO 80111 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF $1.26
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Morton Salt Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
444 West Lake Street Suite 2900 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Chicago, IL 60606 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.199
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid
Shannon Chemicals Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
P.O. Box 376 Sodium Phosphate $4.17
Malvern, PA 19355 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate- Bioxide No Bid

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications, or Lacks Formal Qualifications For Plant Use.




