CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS

3/4" Coupling . .

Ford #CA4-830NL 100 No Bid $29.45 $22.27 No Bid $20.71 $20.70 $22.50 $20.28
3/4" x 1" Coupling . .

Ford #C44-340NL 20 No Bid $32.45 $25.87 No Bid $24.07 $24.06 $26.20 $23.56
3/4" Meter Valve . .

Ford #B43.232W-O-NL 100 No Bid $74.95 $54.92 No Bid $51.09 $51.08 $55.80 $50.02
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . .

Ford 444 2330 ONL 100 No Bid $70.15 $52.47 No Bid $48.84 $48.83 $53.00 $47.83
3/4" Meter Coupling 25 No Bid $48.50 $11.89 No Bid $11.05 $11.04 $12.00 $10.80
Ford #C38-23-2-NL
3/4" Meter Coupling 100 No Bid $37.20 $14.39 No Bid $13.39 $13.38 $14.50 $13.10
Ford #C38-23-3-NL
3/4" Female Adapter 25 No Bid $25.85 $19.23 No Bid $17.89 $17.88 $19.50 $17.51
Ford #C14-33Q-NL

3/4" Swivel, 90 Bend 10 No Bid $57.25 $28.07 No Bid $26.11 $26.10 $28.50 $25.56
Ford #L104-33S-NL
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee . .
Ford #T4443330-NL 100 No Bid $67.65 $53.87 No Bid $50.11 $50.10 $54.50 $49.07
3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Pack Joint Wye . .
Ford #v-44-2430NL 25 No Bid $57.90 $46.08 No Bid $42.86 $42.85 $46.50 $41.97
1" Male Adapter . .
Ford #084.440-NL 75 No Bid $28.50 $26.65 No Bid $20.14 $20.13 $21.75 $19.71
1" Meter Valve . .
Ford #B43.340W.O-NL 25 No Bid $136.60 $101.12 No Bid $94.06 $94.05 $102.50 $92.12
1" Meter Coupling . .
Ford 503844 DL 10 No Bid $52.85 $17.76 No Bid $16.53 $16.52 $18.00 $16.19
1" Coupling . .
Ford #044 440-NL 200 No Bid $32.10 $25.47 No Bid $23.69 $23.68 $25.60 $23.19
1" Swivel, 90° Bend 10 No Bid $73.55 $40.44 No Bid $37.62 $37.61 $50.75 $36.84
Ford #L104-44S-NL
1" Swivel, 45° Bend 10 No Bid $77.80 $46.68 No Bid $43.40 $43.39 $47.25 $42.50
Ford #LA04-44S-NL
1" Curb Stop - IP x Comp . .
Ford #BALAAIW-ONL 50 No Bid $148.80 $111.45 No Bid $103.66 $103.65 $112.50 $101.52
1" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . .
Ford #BAAA4IW O-NL 25 No Bid $165.50 $123.97 No Bid $115.31 $115.30 $118.50 $112.95
3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $4.30 $4.03 No Bid $3.49 $3.69 $3.75 $8.02
2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $13.00 $13.04 No Bid $11.28 $11.91 $12.05 $25.24




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS CONT.
2" Male Coupling 25 No Bid $219.25 $173.00 No Bid $115.54 $151.53 $165.00 $148.44
Ford #C77-77-NL

Fi}g"g'gﬁ'??fﬁi 50 No Bid $114.80 $86.40 No Bid $80.37 $80.36 $87.00 $78.72

2" x 3" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $13.00 $15.14 No Bid $9.12 $11.97 $12.40 $18.88

2" x 6" Brass Nipple 50 No Bid $25.00 $27.38 No Bid $17.82 $23.14 $24.00 $36.38

2" x 12" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $49.50 $54.00 No Bid $35.11 $45.60 $47.25 $73.31

2" Brass 45° 10 No Bid $27.00 $27.40 No Bid $23.69 $25.04 $25.50 $48.44

2" Brass Coupling 10 No Bid $22.00 $21.48 No Bid $18.56 $19.61 $20.00 $29.50

T e atter 250 No Bid $255.75 $110.04 No Bid $111.88 $105.15 $110.00 $103.01

5/8" x 3/4" Meter Setter -
Sampling Station 50 No Bid $520.00 No Bid No Bid $717.13 $621.51 $515.00 $646.57
McDonald #710-203NNJSx72x780

ebonald e 25 No Bid $1,068.00 No Bid No Bid $1,473.66 $1,277.13 $1,060.00 $1,489.06

i’;‘rdi?:rg‘ig’g'gnsﬁf 75 No Bid $76.15 $59.00 No Bid $54.88 $54.87 $59.25 $53.76

Flc; }SZL"SQ%%‘.’Z-Zt.‘,L"L 25 No Bid $100.20 $69.74 No Bid $72.16 $72.15 $78.00 $70.68

TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES

Srx s Senioe Sadde i Ve P as No Bid $89.40 $91.70 No Bid $84.48 $109.96 No Bid $84.66

O e s e . ! 10 No Bid $76.90 $80.04 No Bid $73.71 $95.93 No Bid $73.87

O e s o - ! 5 No Bid $90.85 $91.70 No Bid $84.48 $109.96 No Bid $84.66
L e e © 5 No Bid $108.00 $110.73 No Bid $102.00 $132.77 No Bid $102.22
12 X 3 Sovioe Sadde . © 10 No Bid $125.70 $115.22 No Bid $106.14 $138.13 No Bid $106.36
¢ #'\ggifg%%gglil”g 15 No Bid $345.00 $400.36 No Bid $417.09 $375.84 $350.00 $400.00

6" Alpha Coupling 25 No Bid $451.00 $510.59 No Bid $495.34 $456.27 $455.00 $522.55

#ALPHA-A-7.00




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES CONT.
10" Alpha Coupling . i
#ALPHA-A-11.20 15 No Bid $740.00 $837.12 No Bid $812.10 $748.06 $750.00 $856.71
8" x 7-1/2" Cl MJ Sleeve 5 No Bid $95.00 $104.50 No Bid $92.89 $87.08 $98.00 $98.80
8" x 12" Cl MJ Sleeve 5 No Bid $155.00 $173.25 No Bid $154.00 $144.37 $162.00 $163.80
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
4" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $16.70 No Bid No Bid $17.76 $19.29 No Bid $16.16
6" x 18" x 20" 75 No Bid $26.00 No Bid No Bid $27.76 $30.16 No Bid $29.47
18" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid $41.76 $45.38 No Bid $40.38
VALVE BOX /VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve Box Frame & Top 25 No Bid $169.00 $223.30 No Bid $179.00 $227.77 No Bid $166.00
#JB-8006
2" Cl Riser Square Valve Box . . . .
16 x 14 - #A8455200 150 No Bid $139.00 No Bid No Bid $65.50 $130.00 No Bid $111.00
COPPER - TYPE K
3/4" Copper - 60' Coil 1,500 ft. No Bid $5.65 $6.14 No Bid $5.75 $6.47 $5.60 $7.35
1" Copper - 60" Coil 600 ft. No Bid $7.45 $4.93 No Bid $7.60 $8.60 $7.21 $9.76
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
2" Threaded In-line Valve 10 No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid $424.65 No Bid No Bid $462.45
Mueller #A-2362-8
6" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated 10 No Bid $210.00 No Bid No Bid $311.06 $349.93 $330.00 $144.74
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC/CO00 w/| - No Bid $55.00 $83.28 No Bid $59.75 $73.06 $63.00 $58.07
Accessories
6" MJ Accessory Kit 50 No Bid $28.75 $36.38 No Bid $30.32 $34.10 $33.00 $31.52
6" Transition Gasket 25 No Bid $10.00 $8.20 No Bid $8.75 $7.70 $8.25 $7.54




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS CONT.
8" MJ 90° 3 No Bid $153.00 $167.40 No Bid $152.54 $171.60 $160.00 $165.05
8"x 8"x 6" MJ Tee 3 No Bid $188.00 $206.04 No Bid $187.74 $211.20 $198.00 $202.44
8" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated 4 No Bid $221.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $324.93 No Bid $180.20
2" Brass Gate Valve 25 No Bid No Bid $260.87 No Bid $37.82 No Bid $390.00 $169.65
Hammond 645
2" Meter Flange Kit 20 No Bid $74.00 $96.63 No Bid $76.46 $38.31 $80.00 $82.00
INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS
1/2" X 18" X 20" 50 No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid $33.02 $37.13 $91.00 $32.47
1-1/2" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $58.00 No Bid No Bid $53.98 $60.72 $149.00 $52.51
3"x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $112.00 No Bid No Bid $105.00 $118.12 $289.00 $100.49
WATER METERS
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter - iPERL 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $325.65 No Bid
5/8" x 3/4" Water Meter - Ally 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $639.95 No Bid
1" Water Meter 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $447.05 No Bid
2" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,815.05 No Bid
4" Sensus OMNI C2 Water Meter 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,783.05 No Bid
Fire Hydrant Meter 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,663.05 No Bid
Sensus 520M Smart Point 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $173.05 No Bid
prdpditdiviua 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.60 No Bid
S@Zfeufp‘ri’fﬂﬁﬁ E’SZW?S/' 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.05 No Bid
Senii??if_ol',\,’”;'c')rfr(ifiggepsi) 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $793.00 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

WATER METERS CONT.

Sens‘zffit‘fi_cl)/'\z",!\';,;rte(%s_‘i;% s 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $828.00 No Bid
sensus SMP%'rtp(ﬁiZ‘gz SSi)ensor Kit 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $908.00 No Bid
Sensus Smart Gateway Wall Mount 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $374.00 No Bid
MUNICIPEX

3/4" Municipex 600 ft No Bid $0.78 $0.95 No Bid $0.84 $0.76 $0.82 $1.00
1" Municipex 1,000 ft No Bid $1.20 $1.42 No Bid $1.26 $1.15 $1.23 $1.50
2" Municipx 600 ft No Bid $7.49 $8.82 No Bid $7.79 $7.11 $7.60 $9.00
PVC AND DUCTILE IRON WATER PIPE
2" PVC Water Pipe 1,000 ft. No Bid 1.45 No Bid No Bid $1.39 $1.26 $1.40 $1.49
4" PVC Water Pipe 500 ft. No Bid 4.85 No Bid No Bid $4.68 $4.20 $4.58 $4.74
8" PVC Water Pipe 400 ft. No Bid 16.9 No Bid No Bid $15.96 $14.90 $16.22 $17.12

REPAIR CLAMPS
Zix Azl Cuels Same - Pvelel 10 No Bid $100.60 $92.86 No Bid $87.78 $87.62 $106.00 $85.70

X e o - PVC 5 No Bid $204.40 $168.29 No Bid $159.07 $230.96 $280.00 $155.15

L e T - Ve 2 No Bid $238.80 $177.16 No Bid $167.45 $267.44 $324.00 $163.49

BT e P - 10 No Bid $76.00 $72.10 No Bid $68.16 $79.65 $91.00 $66.53

T S amP - ¢! 50 No Bid $90.35 $75.15 No Bid $71.04 $95.87 $110.00 $69.27

O e e 5 No Bid $243.35 $194.19 No Bid $183.55 $254.92 $321.00 $179.14
O e Samp - 10 No Bid $108.10 $85.66 No Bid $80.97 $112.44 $129.00 $79.01
o d“ig‘gg;;%rgp ~Cl 5 No Bid $285.75 $213.73 No Bid $202.02 $203.32 $347.00 $197.13
2"5(?2";5(27(2’22555’_‘6%;”9 5 No Bid $35.00 $43.60 No Bid $22.00 No Bid $68.00 $33.15




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box & Lid 250 No Bid $62.15 $70.32 No Bid $52.85 $53.12 $58.00 $51.89
Water Meter Box Lid Only 300 No Bid $25.30 $32.00 No Bid $17.25 $20.83 $19.00 $18.78
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hydrj;f 'E\;'lf;y #129-T, 15 No Bid $3,029.00 $2,978.48 No Bid $2,792.33 $2,830.00 No Bid $3,027.84
INSERTION VALVES -
INSTALLATION SERVICES
4" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Normal
4" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Emergency
6" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Normal
6" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Emergency
8" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Normal
8" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,890.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Emergency
10" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Normal
10 Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Emergency
12" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Normal
12" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Installation Services - Emergency
INSERTION VALVES
4" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,713.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,897.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,268.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,090.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Insertion Valve PVC/DI 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,090.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTYS)
DATE: September 27,2023 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline
MARKER SIGNS
Marker Sign - Natural Gas 100 No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $8.73 No Bid $47.49
Marker Sign - Natural Gas Valve 50 No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $10.21 No Bid $47.49
Marker Sign - Water Main 100 No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $8.73 No Bid $47.49
Marker Sign - Water Valve 100 No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $8.73 No Bid $47.49
Marker Sign - Sanitary Sewer 100 No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $8.73 No Bid $47.49
Manhole
U-Channel Post, #2, Green, 8 ft. 250 No Bid No Bid $18.31 No Bid No Bid $25.43 No Bid $11.50
MISCELLANEOUS WATER MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR MATERIALS
3/4" x 3-1/2" T-Bolt w/ Nut 750 No Bid $2.35 $2.90 No Bid $2.23 $2.05 $2.35 $1.99
Sl x 3-1/2" A”tiﬁ&taﬂo” T-Bolt - W/ 49 No Bid $3.65 $4.50 No Bid $3.71 $3.42 $4.00 $3.33
3/4" x 4-1/2" Eye Bolt w/ Nut 500 No Bid $4.50 $4.65 No Bid $2.95 $3.96 $4.15 $3.50
3/4" x 10 ft. All Thread Rod 50 No Bid $2.50 $44.30 No Bid $3.25 $3.54 $45.00 $2.65
s Tg;i?jﬁg ES? Hex 100 No Bid $1.50 $2.70 No Bid $1.77 $2.06 $2.40 $1.30
3/4" Heavy Hex Nuts 750 No Bid $0.50 $0.64 No Bid $0.66 $0.43 $0.50 $0.50
3/4" Heavy Flat Washers 750 No Bid $0.40 $0.40 No Bid $0.30 $0.27 $0.32 $0.30
Duc Lugs 100 No Bid $3.75 $6.75 No Bid $3.24 $5.16 $3.45 $5.46
5/8" x 2-1/2" Hex Head Bolt w/ Nut 100 No Bid $0.90 $1.30 No Bid $0.89 $1.81 $0.78 $0.98

TIE BID AT $7.45 - AWARDED TO CORE & MAIN AT $100.60

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS




