
¾" x 2" Nipple 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.82 No Bid $1.59

¾" x 3" Nipple 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.06 No Bid $1.79

¾" x 4" Nipple 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.58 No Bid $2.23

¾" x 6" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65 No Bid $3.15

1" x CL Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.47 No Bid $2.15

1" x 2" Nipple 1,250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.72 No Bid $2.35

1" Plug 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.53 No Bid $1.53

1" 90° 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.42 No Bid $3.44

1-1/2" x 2" Nipple 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.20 No Bid $3.32

1-1/2" x 6" Nipple 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.98 No Bid $5.82

1-1/2" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.20 No Bid $7.44

1-1/2" x 1" 90° 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.30 No Bid $9.76

2" x 3" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.01 No Bid $4.80

2" x 4" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.96 No Bid $5.82

2" x 6" Nipple 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.48 No Bid $7.85

2" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.10 No Bid $12.82

2" Plug 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.04

2" Tee 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.98 No Bid $18.45

2" x 1-1/2" 90° 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.35 No Bid $14.15

2" x 1-1/2" Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.89 No Bid $10.91

Pipe Thread Sealant                                                           

Blue Monster - PTFE #76005                     
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.25 No Bid $29.64

Pipe Thread Sealant Tape                                                            

Blue Monster - PTFE #70885
100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.35 No Bid $5.78

SOUTHERN PIPE MT DEASON

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    JULY 17, 2023     TIME:   2:00 P.M.

IRBYCONSOLIDATED PIPEEXPERITEC TRI-STATE METERDESCRIPTION

BLACK IRON FITTINGS

KEROTEST
EQUIPMENT 

CONTROLS
G&C SUPPLY ED YOUNG SALES
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CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)
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IRBYCONSOLIDATED PIPEEXPERITEC TRI-STATE METERDESCRIPTION KEROTEST
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CONTROLS
G&C SUPPLY ED YOUNG SALES

Pipe Thread Sealant Tape                                                            

Blue Monster - PTFE #70826
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.11 No Bid $15.86

Sensus Smart Gateway 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $339.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dwyer Pressure Transducer For Smart 

Gateway - 0-150 psi
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $209.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sensus SentryPoint CPTP100 Cathodic 

Protection Test Point
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $471.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Excess Flow Valve Series 700 800 No Bid $97.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.18 $89.88 No Bid $103.93

Excess Flow Valve Series 1800 50 No Bid $97.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.18 $89.88 No Bid $95.50

Cast Iron Meter Bar With Cast Integral Swivels 

#6620-FCDG-1x1 OEMO                                      

Outlet Union w/ Flat Gasket               

500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.44 $45.00 No Bid $44.44

2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17190 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.10 No Bid $144.94

4" x 3" Line Stop Fitting #H-17260 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,221.00 No Bid $2,857.91

6" Line Stop Fitting #H-17280 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,658.00 No Bid $1,948.22

R-275/AC-250/Sonix IQ 250 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $267.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid

R-415/AL-425/Sonix IQ 425                           200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $413.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid

AC-630/Sonix 600 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,177.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

AL-800/Sonix 880 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,274.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Valve Box Frame & Top 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $209.00 No Bid $217.78

EXCESS FLOW VALVES

BLACK IRON FITTINGS - CONTINUED

GAS AMI EQUIPMENT

CAST IRON METER BAR

LINE STOP FITTINGS

GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS

VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP
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CONTROLS
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¾" Steel Gas Pipe 40,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid $7.08

¾" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 400 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.18 No Bid $14.80

1" Steel Gas Pipe 1,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.46 No Bid $8.14

1" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 800 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.89 No Bid $15.86

2" Steel Gas Pipe 25,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.26 No Bid $7.18

2" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 800 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.18 No Bid $15.45

4" Steel Gas Pipe 5,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.81 No Bid $10.38

4" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.63 No Bid $13.56

6" Steel Gas Pipe 1,200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.54 No Bid $15.02

6" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.08 No Bid $19.89

8" Steel Gas Pipe 600 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.89 No Bid $19.63

8" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.78 No Bid $26.61

Fisher HSR - ¾" x 1" conn.                                                       

3/16" orifice, 5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
1,000 $78.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher 627-R - ¾" conn.                                                                 

¼" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring
800 $179.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher 627-R - 2" conn.                                  

¼" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring                                            
10 $605.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher S-202H - 2" conn.                                                                   

3/8" orifice, 1.5 - 3.25 psig spring
15 $456.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

¾" Tap Tee - #H-18102 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.50 No Bid $38.34

¾" x 1" Tap Tees - #H-18102 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.50 No Bid $50.30

¾" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.56 No Bid $16.04

STEEL GAS PIPE- CONTRACT

GAS REGULATORS

TAP TEES

WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS
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1" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.56 No Bid $16.04

2" Cap, weld 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.83 No Bid $21.03

2" Tee, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00 No Bid $34.76

2" 45°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.30 No Bid $13.80

2" 90°, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.50 No Bid $14.64

2" 4-hole Flange 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.40 No Bid $23.84

2" 4-hole Flange Kit 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.75 No Bid $14.60

2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.00 No Bid $536.59

3" Flange Kit 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.90 No Bid $17.93

4" Cap, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.10 No Bid $31.95

4" 45°, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.15 No Bid $31.67

4" 90°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.60 No Bid $35.05

4" Tee, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.10 No Bid $75.02

4" x 3" Reducer, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.20 No Bid $78.55

4" x 2" Tee , weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.05 No Bid $78.55

6" x 4" Tee, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.00 No Bid $153.14

6" 45°, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.01 No Bid $61.78

6" 90°, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.02 No Bid $76.57

6" Cap, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.80 No Bid $82.51

8" x 6" Reducer, weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.60 No Bid $82.42

2" Valve - Weld x Weld 75 No Bid $198.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $361.00 $239.00 $200.80

WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS - CONTINUED

WELD VALVES
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4" Valve - Weld x Weld 15 No Bid $169.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $789.00 $704.00 $675.50

6" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid $1,152.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,698.00 $2,024.00 $1,152.90

8" Valve - Weld x Weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,211.00 $3,335.00 $1,542.78

Dresser ¾" Style 90 Self-locking 

Compression End Cap
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.95 No Bid $31.06

2M/3M Rotary Meter Set 10 No Bid $3,404.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,800.00 No Bid $3,406.11

5M Rotary Meter Set 5 No Bid $3,901.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,850.00 No Bid $3,512.68

TAPECOAT 20 rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid $37.14

Roskote, R28 10 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 No Bid $65.83

WELD VALVES - CONTINUED

BIDDER DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

LOW BIDDER

TAPECOAT

ROTARY GAS METER SETS

GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS

5


