
Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

3/4" Coupling                                                           

Ford #C44-33Q-NL
300 No Bid $27.45 No Bid $18.77 $21.50 No Bid No Bid $20.65 $19.63

3/4" Meter Valve                                              

Ford #B43-232W-Q-NL
100 No Bid $69.90 No Bid $46.32 $53.03 No Bid No Bid $51.00 $48.46

3/4" Meter Coupling                   

Ford #C38-23-3-NL
100 No Bid $34.45 No Bid $12.14 $13.91 No Bid No Bid $13.35 $13.25

3/4" Male Adapter                      

Ford #C84-33Q-NL
100 No Bid $22.50 No Bid $15.41 $17.66 No Bid No Bid $17.00 $16.13

3/4" Meter Adapter A-23-NL 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.64 $12.19 No Bid No Bid $11.75 $11.14

3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp                              

Ford #B44-233W-Q-NL
100 No Bid $65.45 No Bid $44.29 $50.71 No Bid No Bid $48.75 $46.31

3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee                                                 

Ford #T444-333Q-NL
100 No Bid $63.15 No Bid $45.44 $52.02 No Bid No Bid $50.00 $47.53

3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Pack Joint Wye  

Ford #Y-44-243Q-NL
25 No Bid $54.00 No Bid $38.86 $44.49 No Bid No Bid $42.75 $40.63

 1"  Coupling                                                                   

Ford #C44-44Q-NL
50 No Bid $29.95 No Bid $21.48 $24.60 No Bid No Bid $23.55 $22.46

1" Meter Valve                                                             

Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL
25 No Bid $127.45 No Bid $85.30 $97.64 No Bid No Bid $94.00 $93.32

1" Meter Coupling                                  

Ford #C38-44-2-NL
10 No Bid $48.95 No Bid $14.99 $17.16 No Bid No Bid $19.15 $18.23

1" Curb Stop - IP x Comp                

Ford #B41-444W-Q-NL
50 No Bid $137.70 No Bid $94.02 $107.60 No Bid No Bid $103.25 $98.27

1" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp       

Ford #B44-444W-Q-NL
50 No Bid $153.15 No Bid $104.58 $119.70 No Bid No Bid $115.00 $109.33

3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid $4.78 No Bid No Bid $3.55 $3.62

1-1/2"  x 1" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $9.60 No Bid No Bid $10.45 No Bid No Bid $7.75 $7.89

2"  x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid $15.46 No Bid No Bid $11.50 $11.98

2" Pack Joint Male Coupling          

Ford #C77-77-NL
10 No Bid $202.85 No Bid $134.45 $157.31 No Bid No Bid $151.00 $125.32

2" Male Adapter                                  

Ford #C84-77-NL
25 No Bid $107.00 No Bid $72.89 $83.44 No Bid No Bid $80.00 $77.82

2" Coupling                                         

Ford #C44-77Q-NL
25 No Bid $142.50 No Bid $97.05 $111.08 No Bid No Bid $107.00 $101.45

2" x 6" Brass Nipple 50 No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid $21.50 No Bid No Bid $23.00 $24.04

2" Brass 90° 25 No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid $25.84 No Bid No Bid $22.00 $22.21

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS 



Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

2" Brass 45° 10 No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid $28.43 No Bid No Bid $24.25 $24.49

2" Brass Coupling 10 No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid $22.27 No Bid No Bid $19.00 $19.03

2" Brass Tee 10 No Bid $37.00 No Bid No Bid $35.78 No Bid No Bid $30.50 $30.78

3/4" x 7" Meter Resetter                                            

Ford #V42-7W-NL
200 No Bid $142.45 No Bid $94.89 $113.55 No Bid No Bid $137.00 $135.61

5/8" x 3/4" Meter Resetter             

#717-240WX
100 No Bid $152.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $106.50 $105.53

3/4" Corporation Stop                                                          

Ford #FB100-3-Q-NL
75 No Bid $71.00 No Bid $49.77 $56.97 No Bid No Bid $54.75 $52.01

1" Corporation Stop                       

Ford #FB100-4-Q-NL
25 No Bid $93.45 No Bid $65.44 $74.90 No Bid No Bid $72.00 $68.40

6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC                                    

Ford #FC202-669-CC3
15 No Bid $83.00 No Bid $74.15 $93.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.42

6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC                                      

Ford #FC202-669-CC3
5 No Bid $83.00 No Bid $74.15 $93.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.23

6" x 2" Service Saddle - CI                                      

Ford #FC202-760-IP7
5 No Bid $99.00 No Bid $80.01 $98.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.76

8" x 2" Service Saddle - CI                            

Ford #FC202-979-IP7
5 No Bid $115.00 No Bid $91.42 $113.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.13

16" X 3/4" Service Saddle - CI       

Ford #FC202-1840-CC3
2 No Bid $195.00 No Bid $135.52 $167.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.21

16" X 2" Service Saddle - CI       

Ford #FC202-1840-IP7
2 No Bid $210.00 No Bid $149.92 $185.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.31

6" Macro Coupling                           

#261-0760831
25 No Bid $330.00 No Bid No Bid $388.15 No Bid No Bid $348.00 $396.60

10" Macro Coupling                           

#261-1190831
5 No Bid $485.00 No Bid No Bid $568.56 No Bid No Bid $511.00 $593.16

12" Macro Coupling                               

#261-1380831
5 No Bid $570.00 No Bid No Bid $669.16 No Bid No Bid $601.00 $698.11

6" Alpha Coupling                      

#ALPHA-A-7.00
25 No Bid $431.00 No Bid $466.20 $507.09 No Bid No Bid $455.00 $471.52

8" Alpha Coupling                           

#ALPHA-A-9.10
15 No Bid $557.00 No Bid $602.13 $654.93 No Bid No Bid $588.00 $608.34

12" Alpha Coupling                  

#ALPHA-A-13.30
10 No Bid $833.00 No Bid $899.86 $978.76 No Bid No Bid $879.00 $928.27

20" x 15" CI MJ Sleeve 2 No Bid $799.00 No Bid No Bid $805.66 No Bid No Bid $798.00 $743.24

BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS CONT.

TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES



Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

4" X 18" X 20" 100 No Bid $16.00 No Bid $17.34 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.89

6" x 18" x 20" 100 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $27.55 $38.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.50

12" x 18" x 20" 100 No Bid $36.00 No Bid $39.79 $55.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.87

18" x 18" x 20" 100 No Bid $38.00 No Bid $41.83 $58.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.69

Valve Box Frame & Top             #JB-

8006
25 No Bid $135.00 No Bid $144.33 $171.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $148.95

3/4" Copper - 60' Coil 1,500 ft. No Bid $6.95 No Bid No Bid $6.19 No Bid No Bid $5.55 $7.18

6" MJ In-line Valve                     

Mueller #A-2361-23
10 No Bid $701.00 No Bid $364.37 $838.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid $813.84

6" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated 10 No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid $226.96 No Bid No Bid $250.00 $124.39

6" MJ Tee 5 No Bid $161.00 No Bid $142.00 $167.57 No Bid No Bid $160.00 $149.32

6" Megalug Retainer for PVC/C900 

w/ Accessories
40 No Bid $60.00 No Bid $68.45 $65.47 No Bid No Bid $71.00 $58.10

6" MJ Accessory Kit 50 No Bid $32.00 No Bid $28.41 $33.52 No Bid No Bid $32.00 $26.38

6" Transition Gasket 25 No Bid $7.95 No Bid No Bid $9.21 No Bid No Bid $7.25 $7.37

8" Megalug Retainer for PVC/C900 

w/ Accessories
10 No Bid $83.00 No Bid $92.34 $88.32 No Bid No Bid $96.00 $78.42

10" MJ In-line Valve               

Mueller #A-2361-23
2 No Bid $1,743.00 No Bid $1,911.93 $2,083.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,020.98

10" Megalug Retainer for 

PVC/C900 w/ Accessories
10 No Bid $145.00 No Bid $160.79 $153.78 No Bid No Bid $166.00 $136.55

10" Transition Gasket 10 No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid $15.12 No Bid No Bid $12.00 $12.09

20" Megalug Retainer for Ductile 

Iron w/ Accessories
4 No Bid $373.00 No Bid $433.43 $418.63 No Bid No Bid $494.00 $384.85

VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS

CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER

VALVE BOX / VALVE BOX FRAME

COPPER - TYPE K



Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

1" X 18" X 20" 100 No Bid $34.80 No Bid No Bid $35.78 No Bid No Bid $100.50 $37.72

2" X 18" X 20" 100 No Bid $69.60 No Bid No Bid $69.57 No Bid No Bid $98.00 $75.45

3" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $102.00 No Bid No Bid $100.60 No Bid No Bid $297.00 $113.86

5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter - iPerl 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $308.00 No Bid

5/8" x 3/4" Water Meter - Ally 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $610.00 No Bid

1" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 No Bid

2" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,082.00 No Bid

Sensus 520M Smart Point 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid

Sensus iPerl Cable                                  

#SM50535200001
250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.52 No Bid

Sensus 520X/520M                  

Meter Pit Housing
250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.48 No Bid

Sensus OMNI Pressure           

Sensor Kit - 1" Port (0-150 psi)
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $753.00 No Bid

Sensus OMNI Pressure         

Sensor Kit-1-1/2" Port (0-150 psi)
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $785.00 No Bid

Sensus OMNI Pressure Sensor Kit - 

2" Port (0-150 psi)
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $904.00 No Bid

Sensus Smart Gateway Wall Mount 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $364.00 No Bid

3/4" Municipex 1,000 ft No Bid $0.80 No Bid $0.74 $0.90 No Bid No Bid $0.83 $0.77

1" Municipex 600 ft No Bid $1.20 No Bid $1.11 $1.35 No Bid No Bid $1.25 $1.14

2" Municipx 600 ft No Bid $7.50 No Bid $6.89 $8.50 No Bid No Bid $7.78 $7.04

2" PVC Water Pipe 1,500 ft. No Bid $1.75 No Bid $1.46 $1.76 No Bid No Bid $1.44 $1.59

INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS

WATER METERS

MUNICIPEX

PVC AND DUCTILE IRON  WATER PIPE



Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

4" PVC Water Pipe 500 ft. No Bid $5.80 No Bid $4.90 $5.90 No Bid No Bid $4.82 $4.92

6" PVC Water Pipe 500 ft. No Bid $12.25 No Bid $10.23 $11.73 No Bid No Bid $10.17 $10.20

8" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $20.55 No Bid $17.17 $19.67 No Bid No Bid $17.06 $18.58

2" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp -

PVC/CI Ford #F1-263-75
5 No Bid $60.00 No Bid $59.14 $65.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.90

2" x 12" Full Circle Clamp -       

PVC/CI Ford #F1-263-12
10 No Bid $106.00 No Bid $85.84 $93.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.66

6" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp       

PVC Ford #F1-696-75
5 No Bid $93.00 No Bid $74.85 $99.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.59

4" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp - CI   

Ford #F1-514-75
10 No Bid $81.00 No Bid $66.47 $84.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.08

6" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp - CI   

Ford #F1-724-75
25 No Bid $95.00 No Bid $69.57 $102.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.09

6" x 12" Full Circle Clamp -  CI     

Ford #F1-724-125
10 No Bid $152.00 No Bid $111.31 $163.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $122.32

3/4" x 3" Patch Clamp                          

S-B #245-010503-000
5 No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid $7.71 No Bid No Bid $33.00 $26.31

1" x 3" Patch Clamp                           

S-B #245-013203-000
5 No Bid $7.00 No Bid No Bid $8.43 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $27.85

2" x 3" Patch Clamp                                

S-B #245-023803-000
10 No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid $10.16 No Bid No Bid $52.00 $31.93

2" x 6" Patch Clamp                              

S-B #245-023806-000
10 No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid $18.40 No Bid No Bid $74.00 $59.33

1" Galv. Comp. Coupling                    

S-B #522-13200-003
5 No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $14.02 No Bid No Bid $35.00 $16.13

1-1/2" Galv. Comp. Coupling               

S-B #522-19000-003
5 No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid $20.62 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $23.73

Water Meter Box & Lid 300 No Bid $52.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid $37.00 $65.39

Water Meter Box Lid Only 250 No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid $23.58 No Bid No Bid $19.00 $26.09

Fire Hydrant M&H #129-T,                  

42" Bury
15 No Bid $2,575.00 No Bid $2,454.00 $2,641.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,911.80

REPAIR CLAMPS 

WATER METER BOX

FIRE HYDRANTS

PVC AND DUCTILE IRON  WATER PIPE CONT.



Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CITCO Water Fortiline

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    August 12, 2022 @ 2:00 P.M.

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

TIE BID AT $105.00 - AWARDED TO CORE & MAIN AT $100.60


