
BLACK IRON FITTINGS

¾" x 2" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 No Bid No Bid $1.74 No Bid

¾" x 3" Nipple 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.32 No Bid No Bid $1.96 No Bid

¾" x 4" Nipple 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.90 No Bid No Bid $2.44 No Bid

¾" x 6" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 No Bid No Bid $3.44 No Bid

3/4" Plug 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $1.49 No Bid

1" x 2" Nipple 1,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.08 No Bid No Bid $2.58 No Bid

1" Plug 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid

1" 90° 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.70 No Bid No Bid $3.38 No Bid

Leak Detector - Gallon Oatey 30212 Blue 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.50 No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid

Pipe Thread Sealant                                                           

Blue Monster - PTFE #76005                     
24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.98 No Bid No Bid $17.25 No Bid

Pipe Thread Sealant Tape                                                            

Blue Monster - PTFE #70885
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.84 No Bid No Bid $3.21 No Bid

GAS AMI EQUIPMENT

Sensus 700GM SmartPoint Transceiver 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid

Sensus 600GM SmartPoint Transceiver 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid

Sensus 500GM SmartPoint Transceiver 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid

Sensus Smart Gateway 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $329.93 No Bid No Bid

Dwyer Pressure Transducer For Smart 

Gateway - 0-150 psi
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $196.46 No Bid No Bid

Sensus SentryPoint CPTP100 Cathodic 

Protection Test Point
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $413.95 No Bid No Bid

EXCESS FLOW VALVES

Excess Flow Valve Series 700 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.82 $89.89 No Bid

Excess Flow Valve Series 1800 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.82 $89.89 No Bid
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GAS REPAIR CLAMPS

2" x 7" Full Circle Clamp                            

Mueller #500-07-0235
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.79 No Bid

CAST IRON METER BAR

Cast Iron Meter Bar With Cast Integral Swivels 

#6620-FCDG-1x1 OEMO                                      

Outlet Union w/ Flat Gasket               

700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.39 No Bid No Bid

LINE STOP FITTINGS

2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17160 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $181.00 No Bid

4" Line Stop Fitting #H-17260 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $996.00 No Bid

6" Line Stop Fitting #H-17280 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,658.00 No Bid

GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS

R-275/AC-250/Sonix IQ 250 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.51 No Bid No Bid

R-415/AL-425/Sonix IQ 425                           200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $313.95 No Bid No Bid

AC-630/Sonix 600 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,151.42 No Bid No Bid

AL-800/Sonix 880 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,249.07 No Bid No Bid

VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP

Valve Box Frame & Top 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $199.89 No Bid No Bid $210.00 No Bid

STEEL GAS PIPE- Contract

¾" Steel Gas Pipe 25,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.78 No Bid

¾" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 800 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.21 No Bid

1" Steel Gas Pipe 1,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.02 No Bid

1" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 800 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.23 No Bid

2" Steel Gas Pipe 25,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.98 No Bid

2" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 800 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.01 No Bid

4" Steel Gas Pipe 2,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.80 No Bid
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STEEL GAS PIPE- CONTRACT - CONT.

4" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.78 No Bid

6" Steel Gas Pipe 600 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.05 No Bid

6" Steel Gas Pipe - Powercrete 200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.59 No Bid

GAS REGULATORS

Fisher HSR - ¾" x 1" conn.                                                       

3/16" orifice, 5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
1,000 $94.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.99 $37.33 No Bid No Bid

Fisher 627-R - ¾" conn.                                                                 

¼" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring
800 $194.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $173.92 No Bid No Bid

Fisher 627-R - 2" conn.                                  

¼" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring                                            
10 $339.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fisher CS400 - 2" conn.                                                                   

¼" orifice, 2.0" - 5.5" psig spring
5 $385.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $449.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid

American SR113 - ¾" x 1" conn.                    

5/16" orifice, 1.8 - 2.0 psig spring
50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TAP TEES

¾" Tap Tee - #H-18102 1,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.68 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid

¾" x 1" Tap Tees - #H-18102 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.85 No Bid No Bid $52.66 No Bid

2" Tap Tee - #H-17650 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.40 No Bid No Bid $206.68 No Bid

WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS

¾" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.56 No Bid

1" Cap, weld 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.56 No Bid

2" Cap, weld 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.83 No Bid

2" Tee, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.52 No Bid

2" 90°, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.53 No Bid

2" 4-hole Flange 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.48 No Bid

2" 4-hole Flange, Blind 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.94 No Bid

2" 4-hole Flange Kit 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.75 No Bid
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WELD FLANGE AND FITTINGS -  CONT.

2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.00 No Bid

4" Cap, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.13 No Bid

4" 90°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.56 No Bid

4" Tee, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.48 No Bid

4" x 2" Reducer, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.53 No Bid

4" x 2" Tee , weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.98 No Bid

6" x 4" Reducer, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.40 No Bid

WELD VALVES - CONTRACT

2" Valve - Weld x Weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $216.25 $186.00

4" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $421.25 $384.00

6" Valve - Weld x Weld 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,021.00 $1,938.00

WELD VALVES

¾" Valve - Weld x Weld                                      

w/ 2" Nut, CL 150
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $198.00 $271.00

2" Valve - Weld x Weld CL 300 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $231.00 $206.00

GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS

Dresser ¾" Style 90 Self-locking 

Compression End Cap
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.95 No Bid

Dresser 1" Style 90 Self-locking 

Compression End Cap
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.73 No Bid

PRESSURE GAUGES

Pressure Gauge 0-5                                       

2-1/2" Gauge, ¼" Bottom Mount,                  

All Stainless

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.00 No Bid

Pressure Gauge 0-160                                       

2-1/2" Gauge, ¼" Bottom Mount,                  

All Stainless

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.00 No Bid

Pressure Gauge 0-100                                                      

4" Gauge, ¼" Bottom Mount,                         

All Stainless, Glycerin Filled

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid
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PRESSURE GAUGES - CONT.

Pressure Gauge 0-200                                                      

4" Gauge, ¼" Bottom Mount,                         

All Stainless, Glycerin Filled

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid

Pressure Gauge 0-1,000                                                     

4" Gauge, ¼" Bottom Mount,                         

All Stainless, 1PSI Increments,                     

Mirror Dial, Glycerin Filled

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $498.00 No Bid

¼" NPT Threaded Ball Valve           

Stainless Steel, PTFE Seat.                     

Parker B-series #4F-B6LJ-SSP

25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 No Bid

ROTARY GAS METERS

2" Rotary Gas Meter (3M)                   

Counter-drive version
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,443.53 No Bid No Bid

Rotary Gas Meter (5M)                              

Counter-drive version
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,062.36 No Bid No Bid

ROTARY GAS METER SETS

2M/3M Rotary Meter Set 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,147.75 No Bid

5M Rotary Meter Set 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,129.26 No Bid

TAPECOAT

TAPECOAT 20 rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid

Roskote, R28 10 gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid
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