
Description Quantity Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Fortiline Hayes  Pipe CITCO

3/4" Con-seal CS-102 50 rolls No Bid No Bid $5.37 No Bid No Bid $10.07 No Bid

1-1/4" Con-seal CS-102 125 rolls No Bid No Bid $10.08 No Bid No Bid $22.53 No Bid

4" Hymax Coupling                                     

#2000-0563-260
10 $208.00 $199.50 $155.09 No Bid No Bid $212.46 No Bid

5" Hymax Coupling                                     

#2000-0638-260
10 $263.00 $252.30 $196.15 No Bid No Bid $268.71 No Bid

6" Hymax Coupling                                 

#2000-0768-260
15 $275.00 $268.20 $205.40 No Bid No Bid $281.38 No Bid

7" Hymax Coupling                                 

#2000-0847-260
5 $298.00 $286.38 $222.63 No Bid No Bid $304.99 No Bid

8" Hymax Coupling                                   

#2000-0984-260
25 $311.00 $298.30 $231.88 No Bid No Bid $317.69 No Bid

6" x 7" Hymax Coupling                                

#2000-0768-0874-260
5 $398.00 $382.63 $297.46 No Bid No Bid $407.51 No Bid

Manhole Casting w/Lid                              

Traffic - #1154
15 $272.00 $465.50 $256.70 No Bid No Bid $355.15 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser - Solid                      

22.5" x 1.5" - 1" Lid
20 $212.00 No Bid $198.51 No Bid No Bid $213.69 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser - Solid                      

22.75" x 1.5" - 1" Lid
15 $178.00 No Bid $166.32 No Bid No Bid $176.59 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser - Solid                      

23.5" x 1.5" - 1" Lid
20 $212.00 No Bid $206.00 No Bid No Bid $210.77 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser - Solid                      

28" x 1.5" - 1" Lid
5 $261.00 No Bid $253.11 No Bid No Bid $262.43 No Bid

Infra-Riser Manhole Riser                                 

4 foot x 1 inch
15 $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.77 No Bid

Concrete Manhole Riser                                          

4 foot x 6 inches
25 No Bid No Bid $64.00 No Bid No Bid $107.78 No Bid

4" Romac Saddle                                                       

#218-4804U
10 $98.00 $106.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.63 No Bid

4" CL x 4" PVC Fernco 15 $4.75 $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.30 No Bid

6" PVC x 6" PVC Fernco 10 $9.00 $11.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.19 No Bid

6" PVC x 4" PVC Fernco 5 $10.95 $12.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.80 No Bid
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Description Quantity Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Fortiline Hayes  Pipe CITCO

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES

SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)
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6" CL x 4" PVC Fernco 5 $10.95 $12.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.80 No Bid

8" CL X 6" PVC Fernco 5 $16.50 $20.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.09 No Bid

4" Cap Fernco 20 $3.50 $8.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.09 No Bid

6" Cap Fernco 20 $4.50 $11.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.88 No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC Coupling SW 10 $5.00 $5.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid

6" SCH 40 PVC Coupling SW 10 $19.50 $18.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.36 No Bid

4" x 6" SCH 35 PVC Adapter 25 $19.50 $11.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.02 No Bid

4" x 6" SCH 40 PVC Bushing 10 $15.00 $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.77 No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC Cap 20 $10.00 $7.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.89 No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC 22.5⁰ 20 $11.00 $8.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.57 No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC 45⁰ 20 $7.00 $9.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.20 No Bid

6" SCH 35 PVC 22.5⁰ 20 $14.50 $17.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.65 No Bid

6" SCH 35 PVC 45⁰ 20 $14.95 $14.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.18 No Bid

6" SCH 40 PVC 11.25° 10 $56.50 $57.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.70 No Bid

4" Cleanout Plug, SCH 40 20 $4.00 $3.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.62 No Bid

6" Cleanout Plug, SCH 40 20 $12.95 $11.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.65 No Bid

4" Cleanout, SCH 40 SW 25 $8.00 $7.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid

6" Cleanout, SCH 35 SW 10 $24.00 $22.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.18 No Bid

PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS CONT.

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS 
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