CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July 19, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Fortiline
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS

Fozicii?gg?ﬁm 150 $22.15 $18.60 $15.66 No Bid $16.00 $18.59 $17.07
Forg/iézge-tze;zvﬁ-vc;rw 250 $54.65 $45.44 $38.64 No Bid $39.00 $45.89 $42.14

3 4";‘:;b#§jf_é§3w_%fl\iomp 200 $82.90 $43.45 $36.94 No Bid $38.00 $43.87 $40.28
R, ;’égQTE‘E 75 $50.90 $44.57 $37.90 No Bid $38.00 $45.01 $41.33
et Qfﬁ;ﬁi&i 25 $54.30 $47.49 $40.38 No Bid $41.00 $47.94 $44.03
X ook (ch_’li\rl‘twye 25 $43.60 $38.12 $32.42 No Bid $33.00 $47.94 $35.33
px e L‘ﬁ’fﬁ;&fﬁf% 25 $60.55 $48.97 $41.64 No Bid $42.00 $49.39 $45.35
cor dl;&a‘fﬂrg_m 100 $24.15 $21.07 $17.91 No Bid $18.00 $21.27 $19.53

1" Meter Valve 20 $101.65 $83.67 $71.14 No Bid $72.00 $84.37 $77.47

Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL

1" x 2" Brass Nipple 20 $3.50 $3.77 $3.73 No Bid $3.50 $2.89 $3.33

1/2" x 3/4" Brass Bushing 25 $1.95 $2.05 $3.31 No Bid $2.00 $1.84 $2.07
3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 25 $2.85 $3.11 $5.49 No Bid $3.00 $2.79 $3.14
1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing 25 $5.95 $6.76 $11.20 No Bid $7.00 $6.07 $6.84
2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 25 $9.00 $10.05 $16.69 No Bid $10.00 $8.98 $10.14
2" Pack Jol Iale Couping 25 $115.00 $134.80 $114.63 No Bid $116.00 $135.97 $124.86
2" x 3" Brass Nipple 50 $9.00 $11.38 $11.27 No Bid $10.00 $8.72 $10.08

2" x 6" Brass Nipple 50 $18.60 $21.97 $21.77 No Bid $19.00 $16.84 $19.48

1" Brass 90° 10 $5.20 $5.92 $5.24 No Bid $6.00 $5.31 $6.00

2" Brass Plug 20 $9.75 $8.86 $7.83 No Bid $8.50 $7.95 $8.96

2" Brass Tee 5 $22.95 $26.47 $23.43 No Bid $26.00 $23.77 $26.83

T e oatter 200 $106.55 $90.57 $76.61 No Bid $78.00 $91.31 $83.85




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July 19, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Fortiline
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES

e ! 10 $216.75 $177.03 $150.53 No Bid $152.00 $178.52 $163.94
i’;‘rd(;‘gg‘igag'g”;ﬁf 75 $57.30 $48.82 $41.71 No Bid $42.00 $49.26 $45.23

il }g;ﬁ’gﬁ%‘_’g_gﬁi 25 $75.40 $64.19 $54.58 No Bid $55.00 $64.72 $59.43

O e e Ve 15 $63.40 $76.60 $58.87 No Bid $60.00 $65.83 $63.41
B S Service Sadde Ve 10 $74.95 $87.79 $68.63 No Bid $69.00 $79.87 $74.91
O e e e © 10 $74.95 $87.79 $68.63 No Bid $69.00 $79.87 $74.91

¥ X;szggog‘:"g?dfl; ve 25 $88.45 $94.44 $73.82 No Bid $74.00 $79.87 $88.45
1 ),éjr/j;ec%cze_ fza%d'gcg Ve 5 $103.65 $110.29 $86.22 No Bid $87.00 $112.48 $106.63
B e 10 $103.65 $110.29 $86.22 No Bid $87.00 $112.48 $106.63
e ! 20 $63.50 $76.60 $59.87 No Bid $60.00 $65.83 $63.41
e s 10 $89.00 $106.02 $82.86 No Bid $83.00 $115.88 $89.03
L S oo ¢ 1 $142.00 $134.15 $109.44 No Bid $110.00 $137.14 $142.00
e s 1 $142.00 $134.15 $109.44 No Bid $110.00 $137.14 $142.00

6" Macro Coupling #261-0760831 10 $281.00 $303.49 No Bid No Bid $260.00 $228.62 $293.00
6" Alpha Coupling #ALPHA-A-7.00 10 $337.00 $363.62 No Bid No Bid $329.00 $336.69 $351.00
8" Alpha Coupling #ALPHA-A-9.10 10 $383.00 $417.87 No Bid No Bid $373.00 $382.29 $399.00

CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER

4" X 18" X 20" 25 $18.00 No Bid $15.28 No Bid $15.50 No Bid $19.00

6" x 18" x 20" 200 $26.00 No Bid $23.22 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $30.00

12" x 18" x 20" 75 $37.00 No Bid $33.74 No Bid $36.00 No Bid $44.00

18" x 18" x 20" 50 $39.00 No Bid $35.50 No Bid $38.00 No Bid $47.00




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July 19, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Fortiline
VALVE BOX / VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve Box Frame & Top #JB-8006 50 $130.00 No Bid $116.49 No Bid $145.00 $48.30 $120.00
Valve Box Top - Only #JB-8006 25 $42.00 No Bid $35.41 No Bid $55.00 $22.82 $40.00
1-1/2" ClI Riser for 5 ¥4" Valve Box 25 $9.00 $17.00 $16.67 No Bid $9.30 $10.57 $18.00
COPPER - TYPE K
3/4" Copper - 60" Coil 1,500 ft. $5.70 No Bid $5.46 No Bid $5.34 $3.75 No Bid
3/4" Copper - 100' Coil 1,500 ft. $5.70 No Bid $5.46 No Bid $5.34 $3.75 No Bid
1" Copper - 60" Coil 1,500 ft. $7.55 No Bid $7.25 No Bid $7.09 $4.98 No Bid
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
S 10 $275.00 No Bid $273.00 No Bid $267.00 $279.92 $291.29
¢ gsoi;eéfstigter 5 $163.00 No Bid $99.93 No Bid $170.00 $109.52 No Bid
8" Megalug Retainer for PVC w/Accessories 20 $55.00 $72.75 $52.79 No Bid $81.00 $62.57 $62.00
8" Transition Gasket 25 $8.00 $9.40 No Bid No Bid $22.00 $8.52 $8.40
2" Brass Gate Valve 25 No Bid $222.10 No Bid No Bid $26.00 $31.17 $132.00
Hammond 645
2" Meter Flange Kit 20 $68.00 $66.08 No Bid No Bid $57.00 $69.69 $95.00
INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS
1" X 18" X 20" 50 $29.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.40 No Bid $30.00
1-1/2" X 18" X 20" 25 $46.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 No Bid $43.00
2" X 18" X 20" 25 $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid $56.00
WATER METERS
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $125.45 No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July 19, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Fortiline
WATER METERS CONT.
1" Water Meter 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $194.65 No Bid
2" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,343.00 No Bid
8" C/l Water Meter 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,681.00 No Bid
Fire Hydrant Meter 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,791.00 No Bid
igﬁ;g;gggoggg'f 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid
Sensus 520X/520M Meter Pit Housing 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid
Sensus OMNI Pressulrgosssr;)sor Kit-1"Port = (0 49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $673.00 No Bid
Sensus OMNI Pressulrsospes?;’or Kit-1-1/2"Port (0| 49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $701.00 No Bid
Sensus SMP“;'rtp(ﬁslsslgzssi)ensor Kit 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $808.00 No Bid
Sensus Smart Gateway Wall Mount 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid
MUNICIPEX
3/4" Municipex 1,500 ft. $0.73 $0.79 $0.69 No Bid $0.75 $0.84 $0.78
PVC AND DUCTILE WATER/SEWER PIPE
2" PVC Water Pipe 1,200 ft. $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.86 No Bid No Bid
6" PVC Water Pipe 400 ft. $7.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.12 No Bid No Bid
12" CL 52 Ductile Iron Water Pipe 20 ft. $49.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.09 No Bid No Bid
REPAIR CLAMPS
e o~ PVC 10 $62.30 $76.53 $53.07 No Bid $53.00 $59.84 $62.00
8 x 7 Zgo'ig';iifé%ifé“p -PVe 5 $73.80 $91.75 $63.62 No Bid $64.00 $70.24 $73.00
X e e CamP - ¢ 25 $63.65 $78.22 $52.78 No Bid $53.00 $59.84 $63.00
2" X 3" Patch Clamp S-B #245-023803-000 20 $8.00 $10.74 No Bid No Bid $16.00 $8.35 $7.60
2" x 6" Patch Clamp S-B #245-023806-000 20 $14.50 $17.97 No Bid No Bid $28.00 $15.13 $13.74




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July 19, 2021 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe CITCO Fortiline
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hydrant M&H #129-T, 42" Bury 15 $1,945.00 $1,773.49 $1,849.00 No Bid $2,062.00 $2,084.54 $2,009.00

AWARDED BID

TIE BID AT $30.00 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $29.00

TIE BID AT $10.00 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $9.00

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS




