CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: August5, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline V\'/:aet:agruwsoorrlls
BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS
1/2" x 3/4" Meter Coupling . .
Ford #C38-21-2.375-NL 15 No Bid $10.95 $9.79 No Bid $9.81 $10.00 $10.14 $10.15 $9.78 $9.92
3/4" Coupling . .
Ford #C44-33Q-NL 100 No Bid $18.45 $14.55 No Bid $14.55 $14.80 $15.00 $14.70 $14.45 $14.71
3/4" Male Adapter . .
Ford #C84-33Q-NL 25 No Bid $15.30 $11.93 No Bid $11.94 $12.20 $12.33 $12.05 $11.86 $12.07
3/4” Meter Coupling 400 No Bid $23.35 $9.38 No Bid $9.40 $9.60 $9.70 $9.50 $9.35 $9.51
Ford #C38-23-3-NL ’ ) ’ ) ) ) ' )
3/4” Meter Valve 250 No Bid $46.55 $35.82 No Bid $35.90 $36.60 $36.50 $36.15 $35.68 $36.27
Ford #B43-232W-Q-NL ’ ’ ) ) ' ) ’ ’
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . .
Ford #B44-233W-Q-NL 100 No Bid $44.00 $34.26 No Bid $34.30 $35.00 $35.05 $34.60 $34.11 $34.69
3/4" Curb Stop - IP x Comp : ;
No Bid 41.30 1.77 No Bid 31.83 32.50 32.85 32.10 31.59 32.15
Ford #B41-233W-Q-NL >0 o ¥ ¥ ' ¥ ¥ ¥ ¥ ¥ ¥
3/4" Swivel, 90° Bend Ford ; :
’ No B . . No B 18. 18.7 18. 18. 18.23 18.54
#1.104-33S-NL 10 o Bid $36.35 $18.32 o Bid $18.35 $18.75 $18.95 $18.50 $ $
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee . .
Ford #T444-333Q-NL 50 No Bid $42.90 $35.16 No Bid $35.23 $39.90 $36.00 $35.55 $35.00 $35.58
3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Tee . .
Ford #T444-334Q-NL 15 No Bid $45.75 $37.45 No Bid $37.53 $38.30 $38.75 $37.85 $37.27 $37.91
3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Pack Joint Wye . .
Ford #Y-44-243Q-NL 25 No Bid $36.75 $31.76 No Bid $30.12 $30.75 $31.10 $30.35 $29.91 $30.43
3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $2.85 $3.10 No Bid $5.16 $3.25 $2.75 $2.25 $1.96 $2.05
1" Coupling 50 No Bid $20.15 $16.62 No Bid $16.63 $17.00 $17.50 $16.75 $16.53 $16.82
Ford #C44-44Q-NL : : . . . . ; .
1" Male Adapter . .
Ford #C84-44Q-NL 50 No Bid $17.90 $14.12 No Bid $14.13 $14.40 $14.60 $14.30 $14.06 $14.29
1" Swivel, 90° Bend 10 No Bid $46.70 $26.40 No Bid $26.43 $27.00 $27.30 $26.70 $26.28 $26.71
Ford #L104-44S-NL : : . . . . ; .
1" Curb Stop - IP x Comp . .
Ford #B41-444W-Q-NL 75 No Bid $92.50 $72.71 No Bid $72.90 $74.40 $74.95 $73.50 $72.37 $73.61
1" x 4" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $4.75 $5.47 No Bid $5.40 $6.00 $4.90 $3.85 $3.73 $3.87
1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $4.90 $6.12 No Bid $8.44 $7.50 $6.15 $5.00 $4.99 $4.64
2" Male Adapter . .
Ford #C84-77-NL 25 No Bid $72.00 $56.39 No Bid $56.50 $57.70 $58.00 $57.00 $56.12 $57.08
2" x 3" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $7.65 $9.45 No Bid $9.31 $10.50 $9.00 $7.00 $6.43 $6.68
2" x 6" Brass Nipple 50 No Bid $17.75 $33.27 No Bid $17.99 $20.50 $17.36 $6.25 $12.44 $12.92
2" x 12" Brass Nipple 10 No Bid $32.65 $18.26 No Bid $35.45 $40.00 $32.25 $32.00 $24.52 $25.45




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: August5, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline V\'/:aet:agruwsoorrlls

2" Brass 90° 10 No Bid $15.10 $17.30 No Bid $14.94 $21.00 $16.45 $14.50 $14.13 $13.14
2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $8.30 $9.06 No Bid $7.81 $11.00 $9.00 $9.15 $7.39 $6.87
Y e eseter 25 No Bid $105.25 $74.85 No Bid $75.00 $76.60 $77.44 $74.75 $73.64 $75.77
e et estter 10 No Bid $120.90 $88.90 No Bid $89.10 $91.00 $91.95 $88.75 $87.44 $89.98
b 25 No Bid $205.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $158.65 $156.27 $230.00
i@rd?;;rg%ag'gnsm 100 No Bid $47.30 $38.48 No Bid $38.57 No Bid $39.75 $38.85 $38.30 $38.97
TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR SLEEVES AND SERVICE SADDLES
ot ds;;\g%zsz%gli—czvc 5 No Bid $60.95 $62.72 No Bid $45.37 $57.40 $46.82 $47.50 $46.39 $45.32
O e e o C 10 No Bid $73.00 $67.68 No Bid $55.89 $61.90 $57.70 $51.60 $50.39 $55.84
¥ Xé;ji';;’gog‘:"gﬂi;,;’ ve 5 No Bid $85.00 $77.33 No Bid $70.71 $70.50 $70.85 $59.00 $57.51 $68.58
O e e, 35 No Bid $60.95 $62.72 No Bid $45.37 $57.40 $46.82 $47.55 $46.39 $45.32
ox2 iegéi;gzs_gggfpf' 5 No Bid $73.00 $67.68 No Bid $55.89 $61.90 $57.70 $51.65 $50.39 $55.84
e e ¢! 5 No Bid $85.60 $86.80 No Bid $64.26 $79.40 $66.32 $66.80 $65.15 $64.20
te x 3y Sevoesadde @ | s No Bid $99.60 $90.31 No Bid $75.39 $82.60 $77.80 $77.75 $75.83 $75.31
B e ! 5 No Bid $114.00 $99.84 No Bid $85.85 $93.00 $88.60 $83.00 $81.22 $85.77
6" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 10 No Bid $53.00 $58.80 No Bid $49.00 $72.00 $54.70 $61.00 $87.06 $49.98
8" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 5 No Bid $85.00 $95.20 No Bid $79.33 $116.00 $88.62 $99.00 $113.70 $80.92
O s o 25 No Bid $269.00 $273.29 No Bid No Bid $285.00 $248.00 $245.00 $241.48 $275.07
RIS 5 No Bid $410.00 $414.57 No Bid No Bid $443.50 $377.30 $373.00 $367.62 $418.76
12" Alpha Coupling 2 No Bid $492.00 $498.23 No Bid No Bid $308.00 $481.80 $270.00 $266.00 $291.04
#ALPHA-A-7.00
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER

6" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $26.00 No Bid No Bid $23.23 $25.00 No Bid No Bid $26.90 $26.38
12" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid $33.74 $36.35 No Bid No Bid $39.10 $38.69




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: August5, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline V\'/:aet:egruwsoorrlls
VALVE BOX / VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve Box Frame & Top . . .
18006 50 No Bid $103.00 $134.79 No Bid $104.12 $115.00 No Bid $115.00 $137.05 $120.00
Valve Box Top - Only . . .
IBBO0S 25 No Bid $49.00 $56.04 No Bid $36.09 $35.30 No Bid $39.50 $44.70 $35.00
COPPER - TYPE K
%" Copper - 60' Roll 3,300 ft. No Bid $2.75 $2.72 No Bid $2.75 $2.70 $2.76 $2.90 $3.31 $2.67
%" Copper - 100’ Roll 1,500 ft. No Bid $2.75 $2.72 No Bid $2.75 $2.70 $2.76 $2.90 $3.31 $2.67
1" Copper - 60’ Roll 1,500 ft. No Bid $3.64 $3.41 No Bid $3.63 $3.67 $3.60 $3.85 $4.37 $3.54
1" Copper - 100’ Roll 1,000 ft. No Bid $3.64 $3.41 No Bid $3.63 $3.67 $3.60 $3.85 $4.37 $3.54
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON FITTINGS
2" MJ In-line Valve 15 No Bid $275.00 No Bid No Bid $242.90 $280.00 No Bid No Bid $248.00 $248.90
Mueller #A-2361-23 ’ ’ ' ’ )
6" MJ In-line Valve 5 No Bid $545.00 No Bid No Bid $502.70 $565.00 No Bid No Bid $500.20 $502.71
Mueller #A-2361-23 : : : : :
6" MJ Flex Adapter 5 No Bid $163.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $163.00 No Bid No Bid $172.00 $182.29
Epoxy Coated
8" Megalug Retainer for PVC 5 No Bid $47.00 $61.77 No Bid No Bid $59.85 No Bid No Bid $51.31 $57.20
w/Accessories
12" Megalug Retainer for DI 3 No Bid $75.00 $113.48 No Bid No Bid $98.90 No Bid No Bid $84.77 $93.68
w/Accessories
6" MJ Cap w/ 2" Threaded Tap 5 No Bid $36.00 $42.00 No Bid $35.33 $51.94 No Bid No Bid $83.71 $36.04
8" MJ Cap 5 No Bid $37.00 $41.47 No Bid $36.00 $52.92 No Bid No Bid $62.37 $36.72
2" Brass Gate Valve 15 No Bid No Bid $189.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.00 $114.93
Hammond 645
INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX RISERS
1/2" X 18" X 20" 25 No Bid $51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.50 No Bid No Bid $45.31 $49.68
1-1/2" X 18" X 20" 25 No Bid $83.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.80 No Bid No Bid $74.07 $79.33
2" X 18" X 20" 25 No Bid $107.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.60 No Bid No Bid $95.47 $101.40
3" X 18 " X 20" 25 No Bid $162.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $166.00 No Bid No Bid $144.08 $151.54




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: August5, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline V\'/:aet:egruwsoorrlls
WATER METERS
5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 No Bid No Bid
1" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 No Bid No Bid
2" Water Meter 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,305.00 No Bid No Bid
10" C/I Water Meter 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,665.00 No Bid No Bid
Fire Hydrant Meter 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,799.00 No Bid No Bid
32'52322230%38'19 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid
Sl\jgts:rspﬁ’f%ﬁ izlr?g" 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.50 No Bid No Bid
Sensus OMNl'lséissz:f SensorKit g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $673.00 No Bid No Bid
Sensus OMNI Pressure SensorKity g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $701.00 No Bid No Bid
1-1/2 Inch Port
Sensus OMg'lséissz:f SensorKit) g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $808.00 No Bid No Bid
Sensus Smaglﬁ]?teway wall 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $312.00 No Bid No Bid
MUNICIPEX
3/4" Municipex 1,500 ft. No Bid $0.69 0.69 No Bid $0.66 $0.70 $0.69 $0.78 $0.65 $0.78
1" Municipex 1500 ft. No Bid $0.99 1.05 No Bid $0.98 $1.05 $1.05 $1.16 $0.97 $1.15
PVC AND DUCTILE IRON WATER/SEWER PIPE
2" PVC Water Pipe 600 ft. No Bid $0.48 $0.51 No Bid $0.45 $0.56 $0.73 $0.48 $0.58 $0.47
4" PVC Water Pipe 400 ft. No Bid $1.49 $1.58 No Bid $1.50 $1.47 $2.04 $1.54 $1.95 $1.55
6" PVC Water Pipe 800 ft. No Bid $3.10 $3.39 No Bid $3.17 $3.16 $3.91 $3.27 $4.16 $3.30
8" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid $5.20 $5.79 No Bid $5.38 $5.34 $7.46 $5.50 $7.05 $5.60
10" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid $8.35 $8.86 No Bid $8.37 $8.75 $11.05 $8.34 $10.96 $8.71
REPAIR CLAMPS
2°x7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp-PVCICl| 4 No Bid $36.10 $39.42 No Bid $34.10 $35.00 $36.25 $34.00 $33.26 $34.41

Ford #F1-263-75




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: August5, 2020 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Consolidated Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe Core & Main Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline V\'/:;c:agruwsoorrlls
Zix Azl Cicle Slamp -PVEICl s No Bid $55.30 $69.98 No Bid $62.28 $64.00 $64.95 $57.00 $55.85 $62.85
4'x 7'1/F2;r5‘2';1”_§5_$'5amp Cls No Bid $46.90 $54.94 No Bid $47.55 $49.00 $49.60 $44.50 $43.60 $47.99
4 X 12F"0Fr3';$1ﬂelfla£“p - ¢l 5 No Bid $71.01 $87.89 No Bid $76.10 $78.50 $79.30 $75.10 $73.49 $76.81
6" x 7'1’F2;r';“#L'F?_r7°;_?5amp Rl No Bid $51.10 $58.30 No Bid $50.41 $52.00 $52.50 $52.50 $51.46 $50.89
6" X 12;0'?3'2#3{?;922'1"3‘;'{’ -Cl 10 No Bid $80.41 $96.67 No Bid $85.03 $87.70 $88.75 $84.00 $82.30 $85.82
8" x 7'1/F2;r';“;'|§i_§'3%_c7'5amp Cl s No Bid $61.30 $72.07 No Bid $62.33 $64.00 $65.00 $61.65 $60.40 $62.91
xR P CIse Same el 2 No Bid $74.05 $82.20 No Bid $71.08 $73.30 $75.70 $81.10 $79.42 $71.74
v 2;_?3"";‘;- ZCZ‘_’(;';BE'OS_OO“OD;”Q 5 No Bid $8.52 $10.41 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid $16.40 $16.14 $6.87
e oD S oPng 5 No Bid $9.90 $11.55 No Bid No Bid $12.50 No Bid $17.50 $17.28 $7.99
1" Galv. g?;;‘g'zigggg’jgos S s No Bid $11.40 $13.04 No Bid No Bid $14.50 No Bid $20.30 $19.92 $9.02
2" Galv. Comp. Coupling 5 30 No Bid $20.30 $24.33 No Bid No Bid $26.00 No Bid $35.50 $35.03 $16.47

B #522-23800-003

AWARDED BID

TIE BID AT $0.66 - AWARDED TO FORTILINE AT $0.65

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS




