CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER SAMPLING STATION & METER SETTER BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: January 4, 2018 @ 2:00 P.M.
. Consolidated Bartlett Southern . . -
Description Qty Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Controls Pipe Core & Main || Hayes Pipe [|CI Thornburg Fortiline
WATER METER SETTER / SAMPLING
STATION
5/8" X 3/4" Meter Setter/Sampling Station - . . . .
AY McDonald #710-203NNJISx72x780 75 No Bid No Bid $224.00 No Bid No Bid $261.00 $237.25 $229.023 $233.65
Sampling Rod - AY McDonald . . . .
#710SSFAUCETX780 5 No Bid No Bid $158.00 No Bid No Bid $151.00 $167.50 $161.195 $158.20
Meter Resetter - AY McDonald #710- 250 No Bid No Bid $105.00 No Bid No Bid $116.25 $121.74 $107.37 $74.98
203QNJ--x72
LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS
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