CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: JULY 28, 2016 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Qty Chris-More Conslfig:ated G&C Supply Volunteer Bartlett Controls || United Utilities Southern Pipe HD Supply Badger Meter Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline Klngerlrllr;dustry
2" PLASTIC METER BOX
2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $302.73 $250.56 No Bid $295.50 No Bid $250.43 No Bid
BRASS WATER VALVES AND
FITTINGS
3/4" x 1" Coupling . . . . . .
Ford #CA44-340-NL 10 No Bid $16.60 $13.94 $14.44 No Bid No Bid $13.97 $14.12 No Bid $14.55 No Bid $14.74 No Bid
3/4" Meter Coupling . . . . . .
Ford #C38-23-3-NL 500 No Bid $18.10 $7.68 $8.01 No Bid No Bid $7.69 $7.78 No Bid $7.86 No Bid $8.29 No Bid
3/4" Female Adapter . . . . . .
Ford #C14-330-NL 25 No Bid $13.35 $10.36 $10.73 No Bid No Bid $10.39 $10.50 No Bid $10.80 No Bid $10.96 No Bid
1" Male Adapter . . . . . .
Ford #C84-440-NL 25 No Bid $14.65 $11.67 $12.09 No Bid No Bid $11.70 $11.83 No Bid $12.20 No Bid $12.47 No Bid
3/4" Meter Adapter A-23-NL 25 No Bid No Bid $6.79 $7.05 No Bid No Bid $6.81 $6.89 No Bid $7.10 No Bid $7.27 No Bid
3/4" Meter Valve . . . . . .
Ford #B43-232W-O-NL 150 No Bid $37.20 $29.60 $30.67 No Bid No Bid $29.68 $29.99 No Bid $30.90 No Bid $31.31 No Bid
1" Meter Valve 5 No Bid $67.80 $54.50 $56.45 No Bid No Bid $54.66 $55.22 No Bid $56.95 No Bid $57.63 No Bid
Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL ) ’ ' ) ) ) )
1" Curb Stop - IP x Comp . . . . . .
Ford #B41-444W-O-NL 15 No Bid $58.30 $60.06 $62.21 No Bid No Bid $60.24 $60.86 No Bid $62.75 No Bid $63.51 No Bid
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . . . . . .
Ford #B44-233W-O-NL 50 No Bid $34.00 $28.31 $29.33 No Bid No Bid $28.39 $28.68 No Bid $29.55 No Bid $29.94 No Bid
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee . . . . . .
Ford #T444-3330-NL 75 No Bid $33.55 $29.03 $30.09 No Bid No Bid $29.12 $29.42 No Bid $30.35 No Bid $30.72 No Bid
3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Wye . . . . . .
Ford #Y-44-2430-NL 25 No Bid $28.75 $24.83 $25.72 No Bid No Bid $24.90 $25.16 No Bid $25.95 No Bid $26.26 No Bid
3/4" x 1/2" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $1.55 $1.61 $1.81 No Bid No Bid $1.49 $1.53 No Bid $1.58 No Bid $1.65 No Bid
3/4" Brass Coupling 10 No Bid $3.15 $2.45 $2.68 No Bid No Bid $2.25 $2.68 No Bid $2.80 No Bid $2.43 No Bid
3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 25 No Bid $2.15 $2.45 $2.70 No Bid No Bid $2.25 $2.31 No Bid $2.40 No Bid $2.45 No Bid
1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing 5 No Bid $4.75 $5.34 $5.90 No Bid No Bid $4.90 $5.85 No Bid $5.20 No Bid $5.37 No Bid
2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 5 No Bid $7.80 $7.83 $8.75 No Bid No Bid $7.26 $8.67 No Bid $7.70 No Bid $7.95 No Bid
3/4" Brass Tee 5 No Bid $3.30 $3.72 $4.09 No Bid No Bid $3.42 $4.08 No Bid $3.60 No Bid $3.73 No Bid
2" Brass Tee 5 No Bid $17.75 $20.73 $23.02 No Bid No Bid $19.19 $22.94 No Bid $20.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 7" Meter Resetter . . . . . .
Ford #V42-TW-NL 500 No Bid $74.60 $59.49 $60.41 No Bid No Bid $59.54 $60.46 No Bid $59.82 No Bid $61.67 No Bid
3/4" x 12" Meter Resetter . . . . . .
Ford #V42-12W-NL 25 No Bid $82.00 $62.52 $63.32 No Bid No Bid $62.71 $63.36 No Bid $64.75 No Bid $63.97 No Bid
1" x 12" Meter Resetter . . . . . .
Ford #VA44-12W-NL 55 No Bid $165.00 $116.51 $118.11 No Bid No Bid $116.98 $118.18 No Bid $116.95 No Bid $119.33 No Bid
1" Copper Setter . . . . . . . . . .
McDonald #718-410WX 10 No Bid $161.00 No Bid $134.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.73 No Bid
3/4" Corporation Stop . . . . . .
Ford #FB100-3-O-NL 25 No Bid $37.80 $31.79 $32.93 No Bid No Bid $31.88 $32.21 No Bid $33.00 No Bid $33.61 No Bid
COLD WATER METERS- Positive
Displacement Type Compound and
Turbine Class I
5/8" x 3/4" Displacement 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Displacement 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $385.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Compound 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,944.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 28,2016 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Chris-More Conslfig:ated G&C Supply Volunteer Bartlett Controls || United Utilities Southern Pipe HD Supply Badger Meter Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline Klngerlrllr::dustry
4" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.14 $12.93 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $12.53 No Bid
6" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.81 $22.17 No Bid $22.50 No Bid $21.47 No Bid
18" x 18" x 20" 75 No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.95 $35.11 No Bid $34.00 No Bid $34.00 No Bid
COPPER - TYPE K
%" Copper 2,100 ft. No Bid $2.45 $2.246 $2.38 No Bid No Bid $2.25 $2.14 No Bid $2.350 No Bid $2.72 No Bid
1" Copper 600 ft. No Bid $3.25 $2.96 $3.06 No Bid No Bid $3.08 $2.81 No Bid $3.12 No Bid $3.60 No Bid
INFRA-RISER Valve Box Riser
1/2" x 18" x 20" 15 No Bid $22.00 $19.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.44 No Bid $20.25 No Bid $19.37 No Bid
1" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $23.00 $20.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.54 No Bid $21.45 No Bid $20.40 No Bid
1-1/2" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $35.00 $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.42 No Bid $33.25 No Bid $31.66 No Bid
2" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $45.00 $41.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.08 No Bid $43.50 No Bid $40.81 No Bid
PVC & DUCTILE WATER/SEWER
PIPE
2" PVC Water Pipe 400 ft. No Bid $0.45 $0.45 $0.37 No Bid No Bid $0.38 $0.36 No Bid $0.62 No Bid $0.45 No Bid
REPAIR CLAMPS
6" x 7%2" Full Circle Clamp- CI . . . . . . .
S-B #226-069007-000 30 No Bid $47.85 $38.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.64 $38.90 No Bid $73.00 No Bid $79.73 No Bid
6" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI No Bid $72.65 $61.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.44 $62.22 No Bid $117.00 No Bid $127.50 No Bid
S-B #226-069012-000 5
8" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp- CI . . . . . . .
S-B #226-090507-000 5 No Bid $55.00 $46.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.50 $46.54 No Bid $88.00 No Bid $93.59 No Bid
8" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI . . . . . . .
S-B #226-090512-000 5 No Bid $87.00 $73.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.50 $74.52 No Bid $140.50 No Bid $149.88 No Bid
12" x 7-1/2" Full Circle Clamp - CI . . . . . . .
S-B #226-132007-000 5 No Bid $76.00 $62.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.16 $63.89 No Bid $120.50 No Bid $138.75 No Bid
1/2" Galv. Comp. Coupling 5 No Bid $12.50 $6.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.82 No Bid $11.00 No Bid $15.64 No Bid
S-B #522-010500-003 ’ ’ ’ ’ '
3/4" Galv. Comp. Coupling 10 No Bid $14.50 $7.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.78 No Bid $12.80 No Bid $16.74 No Bid
S-B #522-10500-003 ’ ' ’ ’ ’
2" Galv. Comp. Coupling . . . . . . . .
S-B #522-23800-003 25 No Bid $28.00 $14.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.97 No Bid $27.00 No Bid $34.44 No Bid
TAPPING SLEEVES AND SERVICE
SADDLES
10" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-1075-CC3 5 No Bid $84.00 $69.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.37 $72.10 No Bid $72.85 No Bid $102.54 No Bid
6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-669-CCA 10 No Bid $59.00 $41.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.47 $52.09 No Bid $52.65 No Bid $73.01 No Bid
8" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-871-CC4 5 No Bid $69.00 $57.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.62 $59.72 No Bid $60.35 No Bid $84.92 No Bid
8" x 2" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . . .
Ford #EC202-871-1P7 10 No Bid $81.00 $64.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.28 $64.23 No Bid $64.90 No Bid $90.52 No Bid
2" x 3/4" Service Saddle - CI . . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-250-CC3 5 No Bid $53.00 $33.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.23 $40.26 No Bid $40.65 No Bid $63.00 NCéBld




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 28,2016 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Qty Chris-More Conslfig:ated G&C Supply Volunteer Bartlett Controls || United Utilities Southern Pipe HD Supply Badger Meter Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline Klngerlrllr;dustry
6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - ClI . . . . . . .
o S0 760.CC3 15 No Bid $59.00 $41.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.47 $52.09 No Bid $52.60 No Bid $73.01 No Bid
8" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl . . . . . . .
o R0 070 COs 10 No Bid $71.00 $48.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.13 $59.72 No Bid $60.35 No Bid $84.92 No Bid
10" x 3/4" Service Saddle - ClI . . . . . . .
P HECo09 1219.0C3 5 No Bid $84.00 $58.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.92 $72.10 No Bid $72.85 No Bid $102.54 No Bid
12" x 3/4" Service Saddle - CI . . . . . . .
e HEC202.1390.C04 2 No Bid $98.00 $68.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.60 $75.01 No Bid $75.80 No Bid $119.36 No Bid
16" x 3/4" Service Saddle - CI . . . . . . .
e £ G202, 140,004 1 No Bid $139.00 $96.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.33 $95.22 No Bid $96.20 No Bid $163.56 No Bid
4" x 1" Service Saddle - CI . . . . . . .
Pord AECo09.226.004 2 No Bid $52.00 $35.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.34 $44.86 No Bid $45.35 No Bid $63.55 No Bid
8" x 1" Service Saddle - Cl . . . . . . .
Eord BRC209. 070004 10 No Bid $71.00 $48.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.13 $59.72 No Bid $60.35 No Bid $84.92 No Bid
12" x 1" Service Saddle - ClI . . . . . . .
o 0 1590.004 10 No Bid $98.00 $68.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.60 $75.01 No Bid $75.80 No Bid $119.78 No Bid
12" x 2" Service Saddle - ClI . . . . . . .
ool SEC209.1320.1P7 5 No Bid $112.00 $77.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.70 $84.43 No Bid $75.80 No Bid $127.83 No Bid
6" x 12" Cl MJ Sleeve 10 No Bid $45.00 $41.00 $41.30 No Bid No Bid $38.26 $62.38 No Bid $41.35 No Bid $42.11 No Bid
6" Macro Coupling 10 No Bid $209.00 $191.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $219.17 No Bid $180.48 No Bid $223.88 No Bid
#261-0760831
VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON
FITTINGS
2" MJ In-line Valve . . . . . .
veller 23606 5 No Bid $239.00 $235.00 $235.00 No Bid No Bid $226.22 $245.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $230.94 $45.00
6" MJ Tapping Valve 2 No Bid $690.00 $655.00 $447.99 No Bid No Bid $457.00 $720.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $651.56 $315.00
Mueller #T-2360
6" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated 10 No Bid $139.95 $169.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.70 $84.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.05 $40.74
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC 25 No Bid $20.00 $25.75 $20.39 No Bid No Bid $22.81 $37.14 No Bid $29.50 No Bid $28.29 $34.00
8" Megalug Retainer for PVC 6 No Bid $29.00 $36.00 $28.97 No Bid No Bid $32.47 $50.11 No Bid $41.50 No Bid $35.29 $51.68
6" x 6" x 6" MJ Tee 3 No Bid $70.00 $66.00 $65.63 No Bid No Bid $60.71 $92.92 No Bid $69.00 No Bid $67.61 $60.98
6" MJ Accessory Kit 25 No Bid $15.00 $12.36 $15.52 No Bid No Bid $11.10 $16.99 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $13.82 $10.58
8" MJ Accessory Kit 25 No Bid $16.00 $13.90 $15.83 No Bid No Bid $12.49 $19.11 No Bid $16.00 No Bid $15.55 $11.81
8" Transition Gasket 25 No Bid $7.00 $5.45 $11.08 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $5.42 No Bid $4.95 No Bid $3.86 $3.50
1/2" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $38.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.78 No Bid $51.00 No Bid $29.96 No Bid
Hammond 645
3/4" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $46.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.73 No Bid $58.00 No Bid $36.43 No Bid
Hammond 645
2" Brass Gate Valve 10 No Bid No Bid $134.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $131.19 No Bid $162.00 No Bid $106.85 No Bid
Hammond 645
VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve Box Frame & Top 25 No Bid $39.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.85 $96.88 No Bid $117.50 No Bid $95.79 No Bid
Valve Box Top #JB-8006 25 No Bid $105.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.57 $29.17 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $29.47 No Bid
2" Cl Riser Square Valve Box . . . . . . . . . .
AB4BE200 100 No Bid $83.00 $26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.26 NoyBid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 28,2016 @ 2:00 P.M.

Consolidated

Kinger Industry

Description Qty Chris-More Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer Bartlett Controls || United Utilities Southern Pipe HD Supply Badger Meter Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg Fortiline Inc
1-1/2" CI Riser for 5¥4" Valve Box 10 No Bid $10.00 $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.33 No Bid $11.75 No Bid $12.63 No Bid
2" Cl Riser for 5%4" Valve Box 15 No Bid $11.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.38 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $16.84 No Bid
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box 500 No Bid $16.95 $27.33 $18.80 No Bid No Bid $13.27 $16.80 No Bid $43.00 No Bid $15.79 No Bid
Water Meter Box Lid 500 No Bid $10.50 $10.55 $11.10 No Bid No Bid $10.20 $25.77 No Bid $26.00 No Bid $10.53 No Bid

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

TIE BID AT $250.56 - AWARDED TO FORTILINE AT $250.43

TIE BID AT $2.25 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $2.15

TIE BID AT $4.90 - AWARDED TO CONSOLIDATED PIPE AT $4.75
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