CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 20,2015 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Quantity Chris-More Consl. Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer General Utility Walter Wood Southern Pipe HD Supply Badger Meter Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg FORTILINE
MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR MATERIAL
3/4" X 10" All Thread Rod 500 ft. No Bid $1.50 $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.41 $1.58 No Bid $1.93 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Threaded Rod Hex Coupling Nut 100 No Bid $0.75 $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.64 $2.00 No Bid $0.70 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Heavy Hex Nuts 500 No Bid $0.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.25 $0.37 No Bid $0.40 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Heavy Flat Washers 500 No Bid $0.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.21 $0.26 No Bid $0.20 No Bid No Bid
COLD WATER METERS- Positive
Displacement Type Compound and
Turbine Class I
5/8" x 3/4" Displacement 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25 No Bid $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Displacement 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 No Bid $136.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Displacement 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $363.64 No Bid $500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Compound 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,528.50 No Bid $2,788.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
COPPER - TYPE K
94" Copper 2,100 ft. $2.632 $2.73 $2.640 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.55 No Bid $2.658 No Bid $3.34
1" Copper 600 ft. $3.430 $4.00 $3.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.46 $3.32 No Bid $3.57 No Bid $4.44
BRASS WATER VALVES AND
FITTINGS
%" Pack Joint Coupling 150 No Bid $13.60 $12.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $11.85 No Bid $12.00 No Bid $12.42
Ford#C44-33Q-NL : : . . . )
3/4" Meter Coupling Ford #C38-23-3-NL 300 No Bid $17.20 $7.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.76 $7.10 No Bid $7.74 No Bid $8.03
1" Meter Coupling Ford #C38-44-2-NL 25 No Bid $24.45 $9.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.70 $10.80 No Bid $9.66 No Bid $9.91
1" Pack Joint Female Adapter . . . . . .
Ford#C14-44Q-NL 25 No Bid $17.10 $14.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 $14.10 No Bid $14.16 No Bid $14.55
2" Pack Joint Male Adapter . . . . . .
Ford#C84-77-NL 15 No Bid $53.10 $46.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.22 $46.28 No Bid $46.83 No Bid $48.20
3/4" Meter Adapter A-23-NL 25 No Bid No Bid $6.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.79 $7.92 No Bid $6.79 No Bid $7.04
3/4" Pack Joint Meter Valve . . . . . .
Ford #B43-232W-Q-NL 250 No Bid $33.90 $29.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.66 $29.05 No Bid $29.45 No Bid $30.64
1" Pack Joint Meter Valve . . . . . .
Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL 10 No Bid $62.50 $54.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.63 $53.45 No Bid $54.18 No Bid $56.39
3/4" Curb Stop - IP x Comp . . . . . .
Ford #B41-233W-Q-NL 50 No Bid $30.05 $26.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.29 $26.15 No Bid $26.12 No Bid $27.16
3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp . . . . . .
Ford #B44-233W-Q-NL 150 No Bid $32.45 $28.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.37 $28.27 No Bid $28.17 No Bid $29.30
3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Pack Joint Tee . . . . . .
Ford #T444-333Q-NL 50 No Bid $31.30 $29.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.43 $29.20 No Bid $29.22 No Bid $30.06
3/4" x 3/4" x 1" Pack Joint Wye Ford . . . . . .
#Y-44-2430-NL 25 No Bid $26.80 $25.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.17 $27.10 No Bid $25.02 No Bid $25.70
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1" x 2" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $2.85 $2.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.68 $2.74 No Bid $2.85 No Bid $2.36
3/4" x 1/2" Brass Bushing 50 No Bid $1.85 $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.68 $1.78 No Bid $2.05 No Bid $1.59
2" Brass Coupling 15 No Bid $14.30 $13.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 $14.25 No Bid $12.95 No Bid $12.54
3/4" x 7" Meter Resetter . . . . . .
Ford #V42-7TW-NL 600 No Bid $70.45 $59.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.77 $59.50 No Bid $59.26 No Bid $60.35
1"x 18" Meter Resetter Ford 5 No Bid $165.60 $138.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.59 $143.50 No Bid $138.32 No Bid $145.45
#V44-18W-NL
1" Copper Setter . . . . . . . . .
McDonald #18-410WX 20 No Bid $150.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.59
3/4" Corporation Stop . . . . . .
Ford #F100-3-Q-NL 100 No Bid $35.25 $32.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.24 $30.70 No Bid $32.00 No Bid $32.90
1" Corporation Stop . . . . . .
Ford #F100-4-O-NL 50 No Bid $46.35 $42.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.40 $40.39 No Bid $42.07 No Bid $43.26
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hydrant 15 No Bid $1,445.00 $1,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,472.00 $1,429.75 No Bid $1,406.00 No Bid $1,477.47
M&H #129-T, 42" Bury ’ ' ' ' ' ' ’ ’ ’ ’ ’ ’
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box 1,000 No Bid $27.45 $16.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.17 $28.05 No Bid $16.25 No Bid $27.12
Cast Iron Water Meter Box 50 No Bid $66.00 $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.27 $63.90 No Bid $49.45 No Bid $66.32
VALVES/FITTINGS
4" MJ Foster :jﬁitgc'fpoxy Coated 5 No Bid $65.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.46 $67.15 No Bid $64.05 No Bid $78.89
6" Megalug Retainer for DI 20 No Bid $19.00 $21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.81 $25.33 No Bid $21.35 No Bid $26.20
6" MJ Cap w/ 2" Tap 5 No Bid $41.00 $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.76 $19.39 No Bid $38.32 No Bid $31.87
8" MJ Accessory Kit 25 No Bid $19.00 $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.12 $15.15 No Bid $19.00 No Bid $15.55
10" MJ Accessory Kit 10 No Bid $27.00 $24.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.42 $21.47 No Bid $32.05 No Bid $20.40
8" Transition Gasket 25 No Bid $8.00 $5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.28 $4.21 No Bid $4.90 No Bid $4.00
12" Transition Gasket 10 No Bid $11.00 $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.22 $7.43 No Bid $6.94 No Bid $5.60
2" Brass Gate Valve . . . . . . . .
10 No Bid No Bid $143.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.75 No Bid $123.94 No Bid $104.60
Hammond 645
REPAIR CLAMPS
3" x 7¥2" Full Circle Clamp- PVC . . . . . .
S-B #226-035007-000 5 No Bid $39.80 $30.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.33 $30.35 No Bid $34.10 No Bid $63.62
6" x 7%2" Full Circle Clamp- ClI . . . . . .
S-B #226-069007-000 10 No Bid $53.40 $41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.90 $40.70 No Bid $41.59 No Bid $80.99
24" x 20" Full Circle Clamp- CI . . . . . .
S-B #228-30257020-000 1 No Bid $1,495.00 $759.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $644.00 $1,286.70 No Bid $637.78 No Bid $2,293.52
2" x 3" Patch Clamp S. . . . . . .
B #245-023803-000 10 No Bid $6.40 $5.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 $5.28 No Bid $6.00 No Bid $10.72
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2" x 6" Patch Clamp . . . . . .
S-B #245-023806-000 10 No Bid $11.55 $10.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.87 $9.65 No Bid $10.82 No Bid $19.45
3/4" Galv. Comp. Coupling . . . . . . .
S-B #522-10500-003 15 No Bid $13.95 $7.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.80 No Bid $9.00 No Bid $17.00
2" Galv. Comp. Coupling S- . . . . . . .
B #522-23800-003 25 No Bid $26.60 $14.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid $13.50 No Bid $34.44
TAPPING SLEEVES AND SERVICE
SADDLES
2" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC Ford . . . . . .
#FC202-250-CCA 5 No Bid $46.25 $34.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.28 $37.61 No Bid $34.47 No Bid $63.00
6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-669-CC4 15 No Bid $51.05 $42.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.99 $41.50 No Bid $42.31 No Bid $73.01
8" x %" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . .
Ford #£C202-871-CC3 10 No Bid $60.35 $54.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.40 $49.05 No Bid $54.90 No Bid $84.92
8" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-871-CC4 5 No Bid $60.35 $54.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.40 $49.05 No Bid $54.90 No Bid $84.92
8" x 2" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . .
Ford #£C202-871-IP7 5 No Bid $71.25 $63.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.53 $57.90 No Bid $63.88 No Bid $90.52
10" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-1075-CC3 10 No Bid $71.70 $66.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.75 $58.28 No Bid $68.12 No Bid $102.54
4" x 3/4" Service Saddle - ClI Ford . . . . . .
HFC202-526-CC3 3 No Bid $44.45 $36.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.52 $36.13 No Bid $36.72 No Bid $63.55
6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - Cl Ford . . . . . .
#FC202-760-CC3 25 No Bid $51.05 $42.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.99 $41.50 No Bid $42.21 No Bid $73.01
8" x 1" Service Saddle - Cl . . . . . .
Ford #£C202-979-CCA 5 No Bid $60.35 $47.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.09 $49.05 No Bid $47.35 No Bid $84.92
12" x 1" Service Saddle - ClI . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-1320-CC4 5 No Bid $83.45 $67.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.98 $67.85 No Bid $67.30 No Bid $119.36
12" x 1" Service Saddle - Cl . . . . . .
Ford #£C202-1320-1P7 5 No Bid $95.60 $76.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $76.27 $77.33 No Bid $76.68 No Bid $127.83
8" x 12" Cl MJ Sleeve 10 No Bid $93.00 $86.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.18 $73.80 No Bid $82.58 No Bid $71.60
10" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 10 No Bid $110.00 $103.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.46 $87.80 No Bid $97.47 No Bid $79.20
6" Macro Coupling 25 No Bid $192.00 $194.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $212.45 No Bid $209.00 No Bid $219.17
#261-0760831
10" Macro Coupling 10 No Bid $281.00 $286.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $311.20 No Bid $308.00 No Bid $321.03
#261-1190831
12" Macro Coupling 5 No Bid $330.00 $332.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $366.25 No Bid $362.00 No Bid $377.83
#261-1380831
6" Alpha Coupling 6 No Bid $225.00 $226.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $249.80 No Bid $247.00 No Bid $257.68
#ALPHA-A-7.00
8" Alpha Coupling 4 No Bid $256.00 $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $283.60 No Bid $280.00 No Bid $292.58
#ALPHA-A-7.00
10" Alpha Coupling 2 No Bid $331.00 $329.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $366.85 No Bid $363.00 No Bid $378.47
#ALPHA-A-7.00
12" Alpha Coupling 2 No Bid $390.00 $389.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $431.95 No Bid $427.00 No Bid $445.58
#ALPHA-A-7.00
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
4" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.14 $12.25 No Bid $13.70 No Bid $21.62
12" x 18" x 20" 100 No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.22 $31.55 No Bid $31.50 No Bid $32.21
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PVC & DUCTILE WATER/SEWER PIPE
2" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $0.45 $0.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.39 $0.39 No Bid $0.382 No Bid $0.47
4" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $1.55 $1.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.38 $1.28 No Bid $1.26 No Bid $1.56
6" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $2.85 $2.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.74 $2.68 No Bid $2.67 No Bid $3.33
8" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $5.00 $4.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.71 $4.55 No Bid $4.53 No Bid $5.64
10" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid $8.00 $7.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.25 $7.08 No Bid $7.04 No Bid $8.77
12" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid $10.70 $10.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.23 $9.97 No Bid $9.93 No Bid $12.35
VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME
Valve Box Frame & Top 25 No Bid $105.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.90 No Bid $35.00 No Bid $97.89
Valve Box Frame & Top #JB-8006 25 No Bid $35.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.60 No Bid $11.00 No Bid $29.47
Valve Box - Tyler 6850 10 No Bid $42.00 $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.30 No Bid $43.65 No Bid $55.53
Valve Box Top - Tyler 6850 25 No Bid $5.00 $22.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid $19.30 No Bid $10.09
2" CI Riser Square Valve Box 100 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid $26.00 No Bid $105.26
#A8455200
INFRA-RISER Valve Box Riser
1/2" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $19.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.16 No Bid $18.65 No Bid $20.67
1" x 18" x 20" 75 No Bid $20.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.13 No Bid $19.60 No Bid $21.77
1-1/2" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.69 No Bid $29.85 No Bid $33.78
2" PLASTIC METER BOX
2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $255.72 $239.40 No Bid $118.61 No Bid $250.69

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS
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