CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER/SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Quantity Chris-More CF?ir:)ZL G&C Supply | Volunteer Gjtri]l?trjl \\/IVV?)l(t)edr Sogitgeern HD Supply Bl\igtgeerr HF?;/)? Thor?burq GCP
\
MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR MATERIAL
3/4" X 10" All Thread Rod 200 ft. No Bid $1.69 $1.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.38 $1.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Threaded Rod Hex Coupling Nut 50 No Bid $2.50 $2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.83 $1.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 3-1/2" T-bolt w/Nut 500 No Bid $1.50 $1.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.50 $1.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Heavy Hex Nuts 100 No Bid $0.50 $0.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 $0.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Heavy Flat Washers 100 No Bid $0.40 $1.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.22 $0.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CON-SEAL
3/4" Con-seal 100 rolls No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.26 $5.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/4" Con-seal 75 rolls No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.50 $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
MANHOLE CASTINGS W/LIDS
(LABELED SANITARY SEWER)
Manhole Casting wiLid 25 No Bid $210.00 $197.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.90 $207.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Traffic - #1150
MANHOLE CASTING RISERS
Manhole Cas“”%g,i,ii[ - Solid 22.5"x 10 No Bid $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solld 227515 25 No Bid $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 23" x 1.5"x1" 20 No Bid $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 26" x 1.5"x1" 20 No Bid $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - ‘Adjustable 23"x g No Bid $145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.5"x1"




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER/SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Quantity Chris-More CF?ir:)ZL G&C Supply | Volunteer G&Tﬁ{jl \\/IVV?)l(t)edr Sogitgeern HD Supply B’\jg?eerr HF?;/)? Thor?burq GCP
PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS
4" PVC x 4" PVC Fernco 10 No Bid $5.00 $3.99 $4.32 No Bid No Bid $3.15 $3.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" CLAY x 8" PVC Fernco 10 No Bid $15.00 $13.20 $14.21 No Bid No Bid $11.57 $12.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" SCH 40 x SCH 35 PVC Coupling 25 No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.38 $3.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" SCH 40 PVC 22.5° 10 No Bid $7.50 $5.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.90 $4.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" SCH 80 PVC Adapter, Socket x FIPT 50 No Bid $2.10 $2.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" SCH 80 PVC Coupling 10 No Bid $2.10 $2.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CONCRETE MANHOLE RISERS
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 3 inches 25 No Bid $56.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 $46.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 4 inches 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.67 $46.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 6 inches 50 No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 $50.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
COLD WATER METERS- Positive
Displacement Type Compound and
Turbine Class Il
5/8" x 3/4" Displacement 1200 No Bid $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.50 No Bid $31.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Displacement 50 No Bid $136.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 No Bid $91.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Displacement 25 No Bid $573.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $344.00 No Bid $372.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
COPPER - TYPE K
¥4" Copper 4,200 ft. $3.20 No Bid $2.987 $2.81 No Bid No Bid $2.98 $3.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER/SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
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Description Quantity Chris-More CF?ir:)ZL G&C Supply | Volunteer G&Tﬁ{jl \\/IVV?)l(t)edr Sogitgeern HD Supply B’\jg?eerr HF?;/)? Thor?burq GCP
1" Copper 2,000 ft. $4.175 No Bid $3.99 $3.66 No Bid No Bid $3.92 $4.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

BRASS WATER VALVES AND FITTINGS
%"FE%C;C‘]ﬂr_‘égg_”,fl'_i”g 75 No Bid $14.30 $12.23 $12.30 No Bid No Bid $12.14 $12.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"FF;‘?§';£T_Z§%‘E':_”9 75 No Bid $15.55 $13.99 $14.07 No Bid No Bid $13.90 $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
z Pa;'; rijog‘é;v'?"’_"?eﬁlot’p””g 25 No Bid $65.30 $88.99 $90.05 No Bid No Bid $88.90 $89.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Meter Coupling Ford #C38-23-2-NL 150 No Bid $7.10 $6.46 $6.62 No Bid No Bid $6.39 $6.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Meter Coupling Ford #C38-23-3-NL 400 No Bid $9.50 $7.84 $8.04 No Bid No Bid $7.74 $7.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sl PaFZ'? ;;igtlz_egrgg'_eN‘l\_dapter 15 No Bid $12.55 $10.65 $10.63 No Bid No Bid $10.48 $10.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
v Pai';f;;g;‘fg‘%’:ﬁfap‘er 15 No Bid $17.95 $14.41 $14.56 No Bid No Bid $14.22 $14.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
L Pack o Jﬁ"ﬂgﬁ\?ﬁpter 50 No Bid $13.85 $11.92 $11.97 No Bid No Bid $11.79 $11.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
z Paggr‘éggtgm‘;'g_ﬁfapter 25 No Bid $55.70 $47.17 $48.00 No Bid No Bid $47.10 $47.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" F’é‘ig;gg‘i_’ggg_ﬁﬁapter 150 No Bid $11.70 $10.04 $10.20 No Bid No Bid $9.98 $10.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Meter Adapter A-23-NL 50 No Bid $21.50 $7.05 $7.12 No Bid No Bid $6.79 $6.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Meter Adapter A-23-NL 25 No Bid $21.50 $17.47 $8.75 No Bid No Bid $16.55 $16.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S/igfda;'éigi_gg'\;\‘i}%}f\lai"e 250 No Bid $35.60 $29.61 $30.36 No Bid No Bid $29.58 $29.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S L 25 No Bid No Bid $22.94 $22.96 No Bid No Bid $22.45 $22.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S L 25 No Bid No Bid $22.94 $22.96 No Bid No Bid $22.45 $22.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Slﬁ';%”;gi?gg'g'\z _ch_:ﬁanp 50 No Bid $31.50 $26.72 $27.16 No Bid No Bid $26.58 $26.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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3/4"F%‘:;b#88ff_é;ﬁ;‘_‘é’_‘,\ﬁ_"mp 100 No Bid $34.00 $28.83 $29.03 No Bid No Bid $28.68 $28.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ﬁ;%”;f;i?g AL 25 No Bid $64.85 $54.97 $55.89 No Bid No Bid $54.69 $55.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1;532892‘1)?4;15\/"_8_0&'[’ 50 No Bid $56.20 $60.88 $61.59 No Bid No Bid $60.93 $61.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
v XF10' rc’; 2@;;3?:2;81?‘*‘* 15 No Bid $39.00 $50.54 $32.71 No Bid No Bid $46.98 $47.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sl XF%/i;;‘T‘Zj;zzngJﬂEt Tee 50 No Bid $32.80 $20.72 $29.97 No Bid No Bid $29.43 $47.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3&'; jm"lﬂ’fg;iﬂd 25 No Bid $34.20 $15.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.32 $15.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Swivel, 90° if;g A4S NL Ford| 25 No Bid $30.85 $22.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.09 $22.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i’:r' di"t‘)(’i'ojzzzess 25 No Bid $39.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 3" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $2.30 $2.23 $1.92 No Bid No Bid $1.91 $1.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 4" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $3.00 $3.12 $2.51 No Bid No Bid $2.53 $2.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $4.35 $4.29 $3.65 No Bid No Bid $3.68 $3.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x CL Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $1.75 $1.79 $1.45 No Bid No Bid $1.46 $1.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 2" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $2.20 $2.19 $1.85 No Bid No Bid $1.84 $1.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 3" Brass Nipple 50 No Bid $2.95 $2.87 $2.43 No Bid No Bid $2.44 $2.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 4" Brass Nipple 50 No Bid $3.85 $3.69 $3.24 No Bid No Bid $3.22 $3.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $5.60 $5.35 $4.67 No Bid No Bid $4.70 $4.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 2" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $3.20 $3.10 $2.65 No Bid No Bid $2.67 $2.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 4" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $5.55 $5.26 $4.63 No Bid No Bid $4.66 $4.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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1" x 6" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $8.20 $7.96 $7.02 No Bid No Bid $6.88 $6.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" x CL Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $5.05 $4.83 $4.16 No Bid No Bid $4.19 $4.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" x 2" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $5.45 $5.16 $4.51 No Bid No Bid $4.57 $4.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" x 4" Brass Nipple 10 No Bid $9.75 $9.15 $8.11 No Bid No Bid $8.20 $8.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" Brass Nipple 40 No Bid $9.60 $8.99 $7.95 No Bid No Bid $8.08 $8.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 12" Brass Nipple 15 No Bid $36.55 $33.60 $30.34 No Bid No Bid $30.80 $30.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 50 No Bid $3.30 $2.69 $2.70 No Bid No Bid $2.58 $2.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/4" x 3/4" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $5.70 $4.59 $4.61 No Bid No Bid $4.41 $4.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $5.70 $4.59 $4.61 No Bid No Bid $4.41 $4.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" x 1" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $7.25 $5.81 $5.90 No Bid No Bid $5.62 $5.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 1-1/2" Brass Bushing 20 No Bid $10.70 $8.62 $8.75 No Bid No Bid $8.35 $8.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Brass 90° 15 No Bid $4.10 $3.85 $3.33 No Bid No Bid $3.19 $3.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3/4" Brass Coupling 15 No Bid $3.30 $2.94 $2.68 No Bid No Bid $2.59 $2.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Brass Tee 10 No Bid $5.05 $4.26 $4.09 No Bid No Bid $3.92 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1" Brass Coupling 25 No Bid $5.00 $4.26 $4.06 No Bid No Bid $3.92 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1" Brass 90° 15 No Bid $6.35 $5.13 $5.14 No Bid No Bid $4.92 $5.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1" Brass 45° 10 No Bid $8.85 $5.71 $5.67 No Bid No Bid $5.39 $5.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Brass 90° 10 No Bid $20.50 $16.54 $16.63 No Bid No Bid $15.94 $16.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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2" Brass 45° 15 No Bid $30.85 $17.96 $18.32 No Bid No Bid $17.54 $17.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Brass Coupling 15 No Bid $17.65 $14.23 $14.24 No Bid No Bid $13.75 $13.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Brass Plug 10 No Bid $9.50 $7.88 $7.69 No Bid No Bid $7.38 $7.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
T eater 600 No Bid $69.35 $59.64 $60.47 No Bid No Bid $59.53 $60.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
et e AL Fordl 25 No Bid $75.15 $62.94 $63.71 No Bid No Bid $62.68 $63.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4;8‘r£'\/'\£gfi;\?/‘f;‘fter 25 No Bid $87.10 $74.75 $75.64 No Bid No Bid $74.45 $74.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDon :Id igggi 1SSe\t/t\/el:lFF-77O 25 No Bid $849.00 | | $629.00 || $606.13 No Bid No Bid $575.44 | $578.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1’§;5°;E%agg’(g_ztfp 15 No Bid No Bid $21.66 $19.28 No Bid No Bid $36.63 $20.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FIRE HYDRANTS
Fire Hydrant 20 NoBid $1,385.00 = $1327.01  $1346.48  $1,287.00 = NoBid  $1,330.58  $1,368.00  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
M&H #129-T, 42" Bury '
WATER METER BOX
Water Meter Box w/Lid 250 No Bid $37.00 $27.83 $24.32 No Bid No Bid $28.50 $48.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
VALVES/FITTINGS
6" MJIn-Line Valvjom-o L M&H| 5 No Bid $445.00 | | $420.94 |  $430.97 No Bid No Bid $408.95  $347.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated 15 No Bid $142.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.00 $142.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 6" x 6" MJ Tee 3 No Bid $95.00 $95.00 $80.86 No Bid No Bid $78.28 $88.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Megalug Retainer for DI/PVC 30 No Bid $38.00 $29.50 $17.05 No Bid No Bid $16.67 $30.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC 25 No Bid $38.00 $29.50 $21.32 No Bid No Bid $23.64 $35.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M.
A . . Consl. General Walter Southern Badger Hayes Cl
Description Quantity Chris-More Pipe G&C Supply | Volunteer Utility Wood S HD Supply Meter Pipe hir GCP
8" MJ Cap 5 No Bid $44.00 $41.00 $36.80 No Bid No Bid $36.62 $40.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" MJ Accessory Kit 50 No Bid $17.00 $15.50 $10.24 No Bid No Bid $14.38 $16.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" MJ Accessory Kit 10 No Bid $29.00 $26.00 $15.78 No Bid No Bid $23.87 $28.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Transition Gasket 50 No Bid $4.50 $3.90 $3.39 No Bid No Bid $3.29 $17.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lon
%" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $39.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hammond 645
3/4" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $47.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hammond 645
1-1/4" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $92.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hammond 645
1-1/2" Brass Gate Valve 5 No Bid No Bid $104.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hammond 645
REPAIR CLAMPS
2" x 7%" Full Circle Clamp- PVC . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-023807-000 20 No Bid $29.05 $34.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.52 $32.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" x 12" Full Circle Clamp- PVC . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-045012-000 5 No Bid $60.35 $73.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.02 $70.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 7%2" Full Circle Clamp- ClI . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-069007-000 25 No Bid $43.65 $52.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.90 $51.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 12" Full Circle Clamp- ClI . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-069012-000 5 No Bid $69.85 $84.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.05 $82.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 12" Full Circle Clamp- CI . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-111012-000 2 No Bid $98.75 $129.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.23 $116.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" x 7%" Full Circle Clamp-Cl . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-132007-000 5 No Bid $71.70 $97.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.10 $84.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 3" Patch Clamp . . . . . . . .
S-B #245-008403-000 5 No Bid $5.50 $5.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.97 $4.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" patch Clamp 15 No Bid $7.50 $5.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.14 $5.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S-B #245-023803-000 ' ' ' '
2"x 6" patch Clamp 20 No Bid $13.40 $10.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.64 $10.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S-B #245-023806-000 ' ' ' '
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1"8(?3";5(23222'258_‘6?3”9 25 No Bid $15.50 $10.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TAPPING SLEEVES AND SERVICE
SADDLES
B e e e C 10 No Bid No Bid $36.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.20 $36.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e e 25 No Bid No Bid $43.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.90 $46.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"F’; f’é“; Egrz"écze_zsé%‘fggc' 5 No Bid No Bid $36.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.20 $36.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"F’; f’é“; Egrz"(i)cze_fé%‘fggc' 30 No Bid No Bid $41.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.25 $46.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
o' x 2 Se“’icz 'fggg'ze_'%o_m Ford 5 No Bid No Bid $62.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.50 $48.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
e s 10 No Bid No Bid $51.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.00 $56.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10";; fé“;FSCezr‘o’izc_elgfs_dc"*Cé ¢ 5 No Bid No Bid $65.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 $66.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 25 No Bid No Bid $54.50 $50.36 No Bid No Bid $47.75 $54.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
12" x 18" x 20" 150 No Bid $37.00 No Bid $35.30 No Bid No Bid $30.60 $33.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00
18" x 18" x 20" 75 No Bid $39.00 No Bid $41.18 No Bid No Bid $32.95 $35.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00
PVC & DUCTILE WATER/SEWER PIPE
8" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid No Bid $5.26 $5.46 No Bid No Bid $5.11 $5.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid No Bid $8.23 $8.49 No Bid No Bid $8.13 $8.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid No Bid $12.28 $11.96 No Bid No Bid $11.44 $12.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MUNICIPEX




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 23,2014 @ 2:00 P.M.
Description Quantity Chris-More CF?iT)ZL G&C Supply | Volunteer Gjtri]ﬁtrjl VV\\II?)l(t)edr Sogitgsrn HD Supply B’\jstgeerr H;%(ZS Thorilburq GCP
3/4" Municipex 600 ft. No Bid No Bid $0.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.66 $0.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Municipex 400 ft. No Bid No Bid $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.96 $1.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Municipex 400 ft. No Bid No Bid $7.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.05 $6.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

TIE BID AT $47.22

TIE BID AT $29.64

TIE BID AT $2.46

TIE BID AT $4.23 - TIED AGAIN AT $4.20
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