
1

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY
CHRIS- 
MORE

CONSLDATD 
PIPE

G & C
VOLUNTEER 

UTILITY
EAST 

JORDAN 
WALTER 
WOOD

SOUTHERN 
PIPE HD SUPPLY

BADGER 
METER

HAYES  
PIPE 

CI 
THORNBURG

GENERAL 
UTILITY

  

CON-SEAL

3/4" Con-seal
50 rolls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.26 NO BID NO BID $5.95 NO BID NO BID

1-1/4" Con-seal
35 rolls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.51 NO BID NO BID $10.89 NO BID NO BID

HYMAX COUPLINGS

5" HYMAX COUPLING                                  
#2000 -0638-260

20 NO BID $215.00 $164.93 NO BID NO BID $179.47 $161.90 $177.20 NO BID $229.49 NO BID NO BID

7" HYMAX COUPLING                                  
#2000-0847-260

20 NO BID $242.00 $187.27 NO BID NO BID $203.72 $183.75 $200.07 NO BID $258.39 NO BID NO BID

MANHOLE CASTINGS AND LIDS  
(LABELED SANITARY SEWER)

Manhole Casting w/Lid                              
Traffic - #1150

30 NO BID $210.00 $198.74 NO BID NO BID $243.18 $198.90 $207.00 NO BID $235.79 NO BID NO BID

Manhole Casting w/Lid                     
Watertight -#1123

15 NO BID $535.00 $474.55 NO BID NO BID $572.73 $473.80 $486.00 NO BID $531.59 NO BID NO BID

Manhole Casting w/Lid                                 
Traffic-#1154

10 NO BID $234.00 $198.74 NO BID NO BID $252.27 $198.90 $207.00 NO BID $236.84 NO BID NO BID

PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS

4" PVC Cap Fernco
10 NO BID $4.50 $6.06 $2.22 NO BID $3.59 $2.07 $6.00 NO BID $4.75 NO BID NO BID

4" PVC x 4" PVC Fernco
10 NO BID $4.50 $3.79 $3.48 NO BID $4.26 $3.54 $5.00 NO BID $3.65 NO BID NO BID

8" PVC x 6" PVC  Fernco
5 NO BID $15.50 $14.10 $13.83 NO BID $16.94 $14.10 $15.00 NO BID $14.25 NO BID NO BID

12" PVC x 12" PVC Fernco
4 NO BID $51.00 $20.69 $20.08 NO BID $24.58 $20.46 $25.00 NO BID $20.75 NO BID NO BID

6"  Romac Saddle                                          
#218-6664U

15 NO BID $98.00 $98.90 $103.15 NO BID $101.25 $91.50 $93.75 NO BID $90.75 NO BID NO BID

4" SCH 40 PVC Coupling
5 NO BID $2.65 $3.78 $4.00 NO BID $2.54 $2.03 NO BID NO BID $2.88 NO BID NO BID

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    JULY 10, 2013 @  2:00 P.M.
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4" SCH 40 PVC Cap, SW
20 NO BID $3.60 $5.07 $7.80 NO BID $6.36 $4.42 NO BID NO BID $3.92 NO BID NO BID

4" Cleanout Plug, SCH 40
50 NO BID $4.85 $2.38 $3.15 NO BID $1.96 $1.28 NO BID NO BID $1.75 NO BID NO BID

4" Cleanout, SCH 40
10 NO BID $3.25 $6.85 $5.30 NO BID $2.42 $3.34 NO BID NO BID $6.05 NO BID NO BID

6" SCH 40 PVC Coupling
10 NO BID $8.35 $11.84 $15.12 NO BID $8.27 $8.39 NO BID NO BID $9.10 NO BID NO BID

6" SCH 40 PVC 22.5°
5 NO BID $26.50 $35.99 $32.30 NO BID $25.79 $21.89 NO BID NO BID $16.51 NO BID NO BID

6" x 4" SCH 40 PVC Bushing
10 NO BID $8.65 $12.96 $25.15 NO BID $12.13 $17.02 NO BID NO BID $9.43 NO BID NO BID

6" Cleanout SCH 35 PVC, SW
10 NO BID $12.50 $18.63 $15.40 NO BID $11.42 $10.05 NO BID NO BID $18.90 NO BID NO BID

2" PLASTIC METER BOX

2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid
15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $305.18 NO BID NO BID $273.65 NO BID NO BID

BRASS WATER VALVES & FITTINGS

¾"  Pack Joint Coupling                     
Ford#C44-33Q-NL

125 NO BID $13.20 $12.15 $12.37 NO BID $15.57 $12.00 $13.17 NO BID $12.40 $13.39 NO BID

¾"  x 1" Pack Joint Coupling                                           
Ford #C44-34Q-NL

25 NO BID $15.05 $14.21 $14.37 NO BID $18.08 $14.10 $15.00 NO BID $14.58 $15.56 NO BID

1" Pack Joint Coupling                     
Ford#C44-44Q-NL

30 NO BID $15.00 $13.99 $14.14 NO BID $17.80 $13.90 $14.97 NO BID $15.32 $15.32 NO BID

2" Pack Joint Male Coupling                                         
Ford C77-77-NL

25 NO BID $98.15 $88.96 * $90.51 NO BID $113.90 $88.92 * $98.15 NO BID $91.88 $93.60 NO BID

½" x ¾" Meter Coupling                                       
Ford #C38-21-2.375-NL

10 NO BID $11.55 $8.33 $5.83 NO BID $10.50 $8.20 NO BID $8.49 $6.88 NO BID

¾" Meter Coupling                                           
Ford #C38-23-2-NL

225 NO BID $8.05 $6.46 $6.59 NO BID $8.30 $6.40 $8.04 NO BID $6.60 $7.14 NO BID

¾" Meter Coupling                                           
Ford #C38-23-3-NL

150 NO BID $15.25 $7.85 $8.00 NO BID $10.07 $7.75 $15.26 NO BID $8.00 $8.67 NO BID

1" Meter Coupling                                      
Ford #C38-44-2-NL

25 NO BID $21.70 $9.81 $9.87 NO BID $12.42 $9.69 $21.69 NO BID $9.97 $10.70 NO BID
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¾" Pack Joint Male Adapter                           
Ford #C84-33Q-NL

50 NO BID $10.80 $10.10 $10.15 NO BID $12.78 $9.99 $10.80 NO BID $10.29 $11.00 NO BID

1" Pack Joint Male Adapter                      
Ford #C84-44Q-NL

25 NO BID $13.10 $11.90 $12.03 NO BID $15.14 $11.80 $13.09 NO BID $12.19 $13.03 NO BID

2" Pack Joint Male Adapter                              
Ford# C84-77-NL

25 NO BID $51.40 $47.48 $48.00 NO BID $60.41 $47.23 $51.40 NO BID $48.72 $49.65 NO BID

¾" Pack Joint Meter Valve                        
Ford  #B43-232W-Q-NL

250 NO BID $32.85 $29.83 $30.52 NO BID $38.40 $29.65 $32.85 NO BID $30.59 $31.56 NO BID

1" Pack Joint Meter Valve                             
Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL

25 NO BID $60.50 $55.56 $56.16 NO BID $36.72 $55.26 $60.46 NO BID $57.00 $60.85 NO BID

¾" Curb Stop - IP x IP                                        
Ford #B11-233W-NL

25 NO BID $24.65 $22.61 $22.84 NO BID $28.77 $22.46 $24.64 NO BID $23.19 $24.75 NO BID

¾" Curb Stop - IP x Comp                                
Ford #B41-233W-G-NL

50 NO BID $30.05 $26.75 $27.03 NO BID $34.03 $26.59 $30.05 NO BID $27.42 $29.28 NO BID

¾" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp                                
Ford #B44-233W-G-NL

75 NO BID $33.00 $28.86 $29.18 NO BID $34.92 $28.69 $32.98 NO BID $29.59 $31.61 NO BID

1" Curb Stop- IP x IP                             
Ford#B11-444W-NL

10 NO BID $43.40 $55.00 $55.54 NO BID $69.98 $54.70 $43.37 NO BID $56.42 $60.24 NO BID

1" Curb Stop- IP x Comp                             
Ford#B41-444W-G-NL

25 NO BID $51.90 $61.23 $66.97 NO BID $77.91 $60.90 $51.88 NO BID $62.82 $67.06 NO BID

¾" x ¾" x 1" Pack Joint Wye                  Ford 
#Y-44-243Q-NL

30 NO BID $30.30 $29.60 $29.94 NO BID $37.66 $29.42 $30.29 NO BID $30.35 $32.44 NO BID

¾" x ¾" x ¾" Pack Joint Tee                  Ford 
#T444-333Q-NL

50 NO BID $32.30 $31.54 $31.89 NO BID $40.12 $31.36 $32.29 NO BID $32.34 $34.55 NO BID

¾" x ¾" x 1" Pack Joint Tee               
Ford#T444-334Q-NL

25 NO BID $27.25 $25.40 $25.59 NO BID $32.20 $25.17 $27.22 NO BID $25.95 $27.73 NO BID

1" Swivel, 45 ° Bend                          
Ford#LA04-44S-NL

5 NO BID $36.80 $25.66 $25.94 NO BID $32.63 $25.49 $36.77 NO BID $26.29 $28.10 NO BID

½" x 3" Brass Nipple
10 NO BID $2.65 $2.36 $1.90 * NO BID $2.47 $1.93 * $2.13 NO BID $2.09 NO BID NO BID

¾" x 2" Brass Nipple
5 NO BID $2.55 $2.32 $1.88 NO BID $2.36 $1.87 $2.03 NO BID $2.00 NO BID NO BID

¾" x 3" Brass Nipple
5 NO BID $3.00 $3.17 $2.45 * NO BID $3.16 $2.48 * $2.72 NO BID $2.68 NO BID NO BID

1½" x 6" Brass Nipple
5 NO BID $14.45 $14.72 $12.15 NO BID $6.02 $12.28 $13.30 NO BID $13.10 NO BID NO BID
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2" x 3" Brass Nipple
10 NO BID $9.60 $9.60 $8.07 NO BID $10.29 $8.17 $8.85 NO BID $8.72 NO BID NO BID

2" x 6" Brass Nipple
50 NO BID $17.45 $18.35 $15.64 NO BID $19.88 $15.79 $17.10 NO BID $16.85 NO BID NO BID

2" x 12" Brass Nipple
15 NO BID $34.40 $35.96 $30.80 NO BID $39.18 $31.10 $33.69 NO BID $33.18 NO BID NO BID

¾" x 1" Brass Bushing
15 NO BID $3.35 $3.00 $2.70 NO BID $2.93 $2.93 $2.86 NO BID $2.84 NO BID NO BID

1½" x 1" Brass Bushing
5 NO BID $14.95 $6.46 $5.90 NO BID $7.32 $6.39 $6.23 NO BID $6.17 NO BID NO BID

2" x 1½" Brass Bushing
5 NO BID $14.95 $9.72 $8.74 NO BID $10.85 $9.46 $9.25 NO BID $9.15 NO BID NO BID

¾" Brass Coupling
15 NO BID $5.95 $3.00 $2.68 NO BID $3.36 $2.93 $2.86 NO BID $2.84 NO BID NO BID

2" Brass Coupling
10 NO BID $20.00 $15.56 $14.24 NO BID $17.86 $15.59 $16.05 NO BID $15.06 NO BID NO BID

1" Brass Tee
10 NO BID $11.00 $7.99 $7.29 NO BID $9.07 $7.91 $7.73 NO BID $7.65 NO BID NO BID

2" Brass 45°
5 NO BID $29.00 $19.69 $18.32 NO BID $22.79 $19.91 $19.40 NO BID $19.23 NO BID NO BID

2" Brass Plug
5 NO BID $11.00 $8.28 $7.69 NO BID $9.59 $8.37 $8.17 NO BID $8.10 NO BID NO BID

¾" x 7" Meter Resetter                                
Ford #V42-7W-NL

500 NO BID $64.00 $59.75 $60.63 NO BID $76.51 $59.54 $64.04 NO BID $59.99 $62.50 NO BID

¾" x 12" Meter Resetter                                
Ford #V42-12W-NL

5 NO BID $69.35 $63.59 $63.71 NO BID $80.18 $62.69 $69.36 NO BID $64.65 $69.02 NO BID

¾" x 18" Meter Resetter                                
Ford #V42-18W-NL

5 NO BID $80.40 $75.74 $75.64 NO BID $95.22 $74.46 $80.40 NO BID $76.81 $78.23 NO BID

1" X 12 " Meter Resetter                                                     
Ford #V44-12W-NL

3 NO BID $128.95 $119.82 $118.85 NO BID $149.57 $116.90 $128.95 NO BID $120.62 $121.92 NO BID

1" Copper Setter                                                       
McDonald #718-410WX

25 NO BID $142.25 $141.75 $135.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID $145.24 NO BID $204.00 $140.00 NO BID

2" Copper Setter                                
McDonald #720-715WNFF-770              

10 NO BID $682.50 $615.31 $584.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID $682.70 NO BID $881.37 $636.70 NO BID

¾" Corporation Stop                                
Ford #FB1003Q-NL

125 NO BID $34.10 $31.87 $32.76 NO BID $41.24 $31.80 $34.09 NO BID $32.88 $35.49 NO BID
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1" Corporation Stop                                       
Ford #FB1004Q-NL

40 NO BID $44.90 $42.40 $43.09 NO BID $54.24 $42.39 $44.86 NO BID $43.73 $46.68 NO BID

2" Pack Joint Male Coupling                               
Ford C77-77-NL

25 NO BID $98.15 $88.96 * $90.51 NO BID $113.89 $88.92 * $98.16 NO BID $91.85 $93.60 NO BID

¾" Meter Washers-Black Rubber                  
[ " Thick 

5,000 NO BID $0.10 $0.08 $0.06 NO BID $0.07 $0.09 $0.07 NO BID $0.15 $0.25 NO BID

1" Meter Washers- Black Rubber                       
[ " Thick

500 NO BID $0.12 $0.10 $0.20 NO BID $0.28 NO BID $0.08 NO BID $0.18 $0.26 NO BID

COLD WATER METERS

] " x ¾" Displacement
1000 NO BID $47.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.99 NO BID $30.85 NO BID $45.60 NO BID

1" Displacement
15 NO BID $121.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92.70 NO BID $89.75 NO BID $108.00 NO BID

2" Displacement
15 NO BID $315.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $333.33 NO BID $355.00 NO BID $637.83 NO BID

COPPER - TYPE K

¾" Copper
4,200 ft. NO BID $3.20 $2.93 $2.95 NO BID $3.26 $2.75 $2.95 NO BID $2.91 NO BID $2.85

1" Copper                                 
1,200 ft. NO BID $4.20 $3.84 $3.83 NO BID $4.24 $3.57 $3.95 NO BID $3.80 NO BID $3.80

2" Copper
160 ft. NO BID $11.15 $10.51 $10.29 NO BID $11.40 $9.62 $11.05 NO BID $10.19 NO BID $10.70

INFRA-RISER Valve Box Risers

½" x 18" x 20"
25 NO BID $17.50 $19.62 NO BID NO BID $20.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.52 NO BID NO BID

1" x 18" x 20"
25 NO BID $18.45 $20.76 NO BID NO BID $21.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.46 NO BID NO BID

1½" x 18" x 20"
25 NO BID $28.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.65 NO BID NO BID

2" x 18" x 20"
100 NO BID $36.90 $39.63 NO BID NO BID $43.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.91 NO BID NO BID

3" x 18" x 20"
75 NO BID $55.25 * $60.03 NO BID NO BID $66.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 * NO BID NO BID
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REPAIR CLAMPS 

6" x 7½" Full Circle Clamp PVC                            
S-B #226-066307-000

10 NO BID $42.75 $41.48 NO BID NO BID $69.93 $41.83 $42.74 NO BID $46.47 $55.52 $94.38

10" x 12" Full Circle Clamp PVC                            
S-B #226-107512-000

3 NO BID $93.00 * $96.78 NO BID NO BID $158.34 $100.25 $92.06 * NO BID $105.25 $133.07 $213.75

6" x 7½" Full Circle Clamp- CI                            
S-B #226-069007-000

5 NO BID $42.45 $42.79 NO BID NO BID $71.47 $42.77 $42.43 NO BID $47.50 $55.52 $96.50

10" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - Cl                                
S-B #226-111012-000

2 NO BID $96.00 $97.44 NO BID NO BID $161.65 $100.25 $95.98 NO BID $107.45 $133.07 $218.20

12" x 7½" Full Circle Clamp-CI                            
S-B #226-132007-000

3 NO BID $69.70 $70.89 NO BID NO BID $117.36 $72.57 $91.10 NO BID $78.00 $96.61 $158.40

 ¾" x 6" Patch Clamp                                      
S-B #245-010506-000

5 NO BID $8.00 $8.59 $8.21 NO BID $10.97 $7.90 $7.99 NO BID $7.37 $16.60 $14.80

1" x 3" Patch Clamp                                  S-
B #245-013203-000

5 NO BID $4.70 $5.19 $4.74 NO BID $6.42 $8.40 $4.67 NO BID $4.32 $10.23 $9.68

1" X 6" Patch Clamp                                        
S-B #245-013206-000

5 NO BID $8.55 $9.19 $8.68 NO BID $11.68 $4.49 $8.51 NO BID $7.85 $18.04 $15.78

2" x 3" Patch Clamp                                      
S-B  #245-023803-000

15 NO BID $5.65 $6.69 $5.63 NO BID $7.75 $5.99 $5.65 NO BID $5.21 $11.25 $10.46

2" x 6" Patch Clamp                                                
S-B #245-023806-000

20 NO BID $10.25 $12.01 $10.37 NO BID $14.03 $11.32 $10.22 NO BID $9.43 $20.42 $18.95

¾" Galv. Comp. Coupling                           S-
B #522-10500-003

15 NO BID $13.00 $10.27 $6.84 NO BID $9.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 NO BID $16.80

2" Galv. Comp. Coupling                                
S-B #522-23800-003

20 NO BID $26.00 $20.76 $19.47 NO BID $30.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.19 $29.50 $34.65

TAPPING SLEEVES AND SERVICE 
SADDLES

6" x 1" Service Saddle  - PVC                 
Ford #FC202-669-CC4

15 NO BID $41.20 $45.92 NO BID NO BID $55.90 $45.65 $41.18 NO BID $47.12 $46.92 NO BID

8" x 1" Service Saddle-PVC                            
Ford # FC202-871-CC4

3 NO BID $48.25 * $56.96 NO BID NO BID $67.82 $55.41 $48.15 * NO BID $57.17 $55.02 NO BID

6" x ¾" Service Saddle  - CI                    
Ford #FC202-760-CC3

50 NO BID $41.20 $46.30 NO BID NO BID $56.35 $39.34 $41.18 NO BID $47.51 $46.92 NO BID

6" x 1" Service Saddle  - CI                                                   
Ford #FC202-760-CC4

10 NO BID $41.20 $46.30 NO BID NO BID $56.35 $39.34 $41.18 NO BID $47.51 $46.92 NO BID
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6" x 2" Service Saddle-Cl                      Ford 
# FC202-760-IP7

5 NO BID $49.00 * $50.58 NO BID NO BID $60.63 $49.52 $48.80 * NO BID $51.12 $50.97 NO BID

8" x ¾" Service Saddle  - CI                         
Ford #FC202-979-CC3

5 NO BID $48.65 $56.59 NO BID NO BID $68.05 $47.49 $48.65 NO BID $57.38 $54.56 NO BID

8"x 1" Service Saddle  - CI                      
Ford #FC202-979-CC4

5 NO BID $48.65 $56.59 NO BID NO BID $68.05 $47.49 $48.65 NO BID $57.38 $54.56 NO BID

12" x 1" Service Saddle  - CI                 Ford 
#FC202-1320-CC4

5 NO BID $67.30 $76.97 NO BID NO BID $92.48 $66.99 $67.29 NO BID $77.96 $76.70 NO BID

12" x 2" Service Saddle  - CI                 Ford 
#FC202-1320-IP7

2 NO BID $77.10 $80.45 NO BID NO BID $94.65 $68.80 $77.09 NO BID $79.80 $82.14 NO BID

6" x 6" Tapping Sleeve-PVC                    
Ford #FAST-700X6A

2 NO BID $414.65 $328.50 $498.05 NO BID $424.01 $301.50 $414.65 NO BID $310.93 $396.62 NO BID

8" X 6" Tapping Sleeve-CI                     Ford 
#FAST-945X6A

2 NO BID $538.10 $323.99 $544.96 NO BID $401.88 $292.90 $538.09 NO BID $302.07 $375.90 NO BID

6" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve
5 NO BID $58.00 $59.20 $54.19 NO BID $58.50 $80.25 $82.02 NO BID $57.00 NO BID $78.55

12" x 7½" CI MJ Sleeve                         
4 NO BID $102.00 $115.36 $108.38 NO BID $117.00 $105.06 $156.55 NO BID $115.00 NO BID $129.46

12" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve
5 NO BID $151.00 $152.59 $142.77 NO BID $154.13 $155.60 $189.88 NO BID $150.25 NO BID $207.00

4" Macro Coupling                                 #261-
0560831

6 NO BID NO BID  $156.11 NO BID NO BID $179.29 $160.16 $175.00 NO BID $174.75 $156.52 $162.00

6" Macro Coupling                                     
#261-0760831

25 NO BID NO BID  B $198.59 NO BID NO BID $236.60 $211.37 $219.00 NO BID $229.69 $206.57 $208.00

8" Macro Coupling                                 #261-
0975831

25 NO BID NO BID  B $222.89 NO BID NO BID $267.92 $293.30 $248.00 NO BID $262.92 $233.92 $235.00

10" Macro Coupling                                       
#261-1190831

6 NO BID NO BID  B $289.62 NO BID NO BID $346.57 $309.60 $321.00 NO BID $336.82 $302.58 $305.00

12" Macro Coupling                                  
#261-1380831

6 NO BID NO BID  $346.79 NO BID NO BID $407.89 $364.35 $377.00 NO BID $399.89 $356.12 $358.00

VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME                                    
Shall Be Labeled Water

Valve Box Frame & Top
100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $93.00 NO BID NO BID $125.26 NO BID NO BID

Valve Box - Tyler 6850
10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $107.36 NO BID NO BID
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Valve Box Top #JB-8006
25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.95 NO BID NO BID $41.05 NO BID NO BID

2" CI Riser Square Valve Box              
#A8455200

100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $79.24 NO BID NO BID $26.32 NO BID NO BID

1" CI Riser for 5¼" Valve Box
50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.29 NO BID NO BID $7.37 NO BID NO BID

4" CI Riser for 5¼" Valve Box
25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.72 NO BID NO BID $16.63 NO BID NO BID

6" CI Riser for 5¼" Valve Box
25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.85 NO BID NO BID $23.63 NO BID NO BID

VALVES/FITTINGS

2" MJ In-line Valve                               
Mueller #A-2360-8

10 NO BID $195.60 $192.07 $188.50 NO BID $243.63 $192.28 $195.59 NO BID $238.00 NO BID $205.00

6" MJ In-Line Valve                                M&H 
4067-01

5 NO BID $409.00 $405.72 $381.00 NO BID $432.64 $388.45 $408.68 NO BID $497.68 NO BID $420.00

6" MJ Tapping Valve                               
Mueller #T-2360

2 NO BID $571.00 $569.00 $532.00 NO BID $604.18 $542.51 $570.72 NO BID $735.00 NO BID $590.00

10" MJ In-line Valve                                 
M&H 4067-01

1 NO BID $1,015.00 $998.90 $946.00 NO BID $1,084.70 $974.75 $1,014.80 NO BID $1,236.00 NO BID $1,020.00

6" MJ Flex Adapter Epoxy Coated
10 NO BID $126.00 $129.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $123.60 $135.00 NO BID $124.95 NO BID NO BID

8" x 8" x 6" MJ Tee
3 NO BID $115.00 $119.96 $105.06 NO BID $117.00 $105.00 $154.50 NO BID $101.30 NO BID $162.00

6" MJ Cap
5 NO BID $26.00 $27.79 $23.20 NO BID $25.88 $23.20 $38.38 NO BID $22.40 NO BID $35.00

6" Megalug Retainer for PVC
15 NO BID $25.00 $25.92 $22.53 NO BID $29.86 $26.80 $37.35 NO BID $24.16 NO BID $28.00

6" Megalug Retainer for DI/PVC
15 NO BID $20.00 $18.87 $22.53 NO BID $21.10 $19.10 $37.35 NO BID $19.11 NO BID $24.00

10" MJ Accessory Kit
6 NO BID $25.00 $27.76 $15.42 NO BID $27.57 $25.00 $25.50 NO BID $23.87 NO BID $45.00

12" MJ Accessory Kit
6 NO BID $26.00 $29.25 $16.64 NO BID $28.69 $26.00 $26.57 NO BID $24.84 NO BID $48.00

4" Transition Gasket
10 NO BID $3.50 $3.65 $3.00 NO BID $3.24 $3.25 $3.00 NO BID $2.84 NO BID $5.75
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6" Transition Gasket
50 NO BID $4.00 $4.10 $3.57 NO BID $3.94 $3.85 $3.80 NO BID $3.46 NO BID $7.00

1½" Brass Gate Valve                                  
Hammond 645

5 NO BID $63.65 $71.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.95 NO BID NO BID

2" Brass Gate Valve                                    
Hammond 645

20 NO BID $83.20 $90.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.00 NO BID NO BID

WATER METER BOX

Water Meter Box w/Lid
800 NO BID $26.55 $25.94 $26.84 NO BID $24.83 $26.56 NO BID NO BID $32.92 NO BID $28.00

Water Meter Box Lid Only
500 NO BID $10.60 $10.69 $11.05 NO BID $13.64 $10.92 NO BID NO BID $23.98 NO BID $12.25

PVC & DUCTILE WATER/SEWER PIPE

2" PVC Water Pipe
300 ft. NO BID $0.49 $0.49 $0.44 NO BID $0.47 $0.45 $0.50 NO BID $0.45 NO BID NO BID

4" PVC Water Pipe
200 ft. NO BID $1.65 $1.63 $1.44 NO BID $1.56 $1.43 $1.67 NO BID $1.48 NO BID NO BID

6" PVC Water Pipe
400 ft. NO BID $3.37 $3.29 $3.03 NO BID $3.20 $3.04 $3.35 NO BID $3.15 NO BID NO BID

8" PVC Water Pipe
100 ft. NO BID $5.68 $5.81 $5.10 * NO BID $5.63 $5.11 * $5.67 NO BID $5.33 NO BID NO BID

10" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe
26 ft. NO BID $5.50 $5.97 $6.13 NO BID $5.33 $4.90 $5.47 NO BID $5.14 NO BID NO BID

* = TIE BID @ $1.95 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $2.50 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $89.00 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $55.70 EACH

AWARDED BID

* = TIE BID @ $89.00 EACH
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DUPLICATE BID ITEM

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

* = TIE BID @ $94.00 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $48.65 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $49.35 EACH

* = TIE BID @ $5.14 EACH


	Sheet1

