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Description Quantity
Consolidated 

Pipe
G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe HD Supply Fortiline Hayes  Pipe CI Thornburg Bartlett

CON-SEAL

1-1/4" Con-Seal CS-102 50 rolls $13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.38 $14.08 $35.00 No Bid No Bid

MANHOLE CASTINGS W/LIDS            
(LABELED SANITARY SEWER)

Manhole Casting w/Lid                              
Traffic - #1150

20 $215.00 $195.50 No Bid $197.95 $205.21 $207.15 $237.75 $218.00 No Bid

MANHOLE CASTING RISERS

Manhole Casting Riser -   Solid 23" x 1" 10 $139.00 $129.55 No Bid No Bid $127.74 $130.97 $138.25 $147.00 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 23.25" x 1" 25 $139.00 $129.55 No Bid No Bid $127.74 $130.97 $138.25 $147.00 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser -   Solid 23" x 1.5" 25 $139.00 $129.55 No Bid No Bid $127.74 $130.97 $138.25 $147.00 No Bid

Manhole Casting Riser -   Solid 26" x 1" 15 $149.00 $139.40 No Bid No Bid $137.24 $140.70 $148.75 $157.00 No Bid

PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS

6" Romac Saddle #218-6664U 5 $95.00 $96.85 No Bid No Bid $92.81 $93.79 $93.75 No Bid No Bid

4" PVC x 4" PVC Fernco 5 $3.95 $3.69 No Bid No Bid $3.60 $3.64 $3.75 No Bid No Bid

4" DI x 4" PVC  Fernco 5 $4.50 $3.96 No Bid No Bid $3.89 $3.93 $3.95 No Bid No Bid

6" Cap Fernco 10 $5.50 $7.89 No Bid No Bid $2.42 $2.44 $6.45 No Bid No Bid

8" PVC x 8" PVC Fernco 15 $12.00 $11.99 No Bid No Bid $11.60 $11.97 $11.50 No Bid No Bid

6" SCH 40 x SCH 35 PVC Coupling 10 $12.00 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $10.67 $9.63 $10.90 No Bid No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC Coupling 10 $3.00 $2.65 No Bid No Bid $2.23 $2.14 $2.70 No Bid No Bid

6" SCH 40 PVC Coupling 10 $8.00 $8.28 No Bid No Bid $9.19 $8.79 $9.80 No Bid No Bid

4" x 6" SCH 35 PVC Adapter 10 $7.50 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $18.32 $5.84 $11.50 No Bid No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC 22.5⁰ 10 $10.00 $3.59 No Bid No Bid $5.17 $4.95 $5.95 No Bid No Bid

4" SCH 40 PVC Cap, SW 20 $7.00 $3.64 No Bid No Bid $4.85 $4.64 $3.30 No Bid No Bid

4" Cleanout, SCH 40 10 $8.00 $4.74 No Bid No Bid $3.67 $3.51 $26.30 No Bid No Bid

MANHOLE RISERS

Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 3 inches 15 $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.13 No Bid $78.00 No Bid No Bid

Infra-Riser Manhole Riser 4 foot x 3 inches 20 $124.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.76 No Bid $104.50 No Bid No Bid

HYMAX COUPLINGS

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    JULY 28, 2016 @  2:00 P.M.



2

Description Quantity
Consolidated 

Pipe
G&C Supply Volunteer Southern Pipe HD Supply Fortiline Hayes  Pipe CI Thornburg Bartlett

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    JULY 28, 2016 @  2:00 P.M.

5" HYMAX COUPLING                                  
#2000 -0638-260

10 No Bid $169.45 No Bid $169.40 $165.99 $169.45 $256.85 $280.00 No Bid

7" HYMAX COUPLING                                  
#2000-0847-260

10 No Bid $192.33 No Bid $192.34 $188.42 $192.34 $291.55 $192.00 No Bid

8" HYMAX COUPLING                                  
#2000-0984-260

20 No Bid $199.98 No Bid $200.34 $196.26 $200.35 $303.65 $200.00 No Bid

MARKER SIGNS

Marker Signs
100 No Bid $9.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.61

U-Channel Post, #2, Green, 8ft.
100 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.27

VALVE BOX / VALVE BOX FRAME

Valve Box Frame & Top 25 $39.00 $116.00 No Bid $92.85 $26.75 $96.81 $132.20 $105.00 No Bid

Valve Box Top #JB-8006 10 $105.00 $50.00 No Bid $28.57 $95.88 $29.79 $43.30 $109.45 No Bid

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS 
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