GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES

SEWER MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: AUGUST 4, 2015 @ 2:00 P.M.

Description Quantity Consl. Pipe G&C Supply Volunteer General Utility Walter Wood Southern Pipe HD Supply Fortiline Hayes Pipe Cl Thornburg
CON-SEAL
3/4" Con-Seal CS-102 125 rolls $8.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.23 $5.32 $5.54 $9.49 No Bid
1-1/4" Con-Seal CS-102 75 rolls $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.67 $9.57 $9.98 $20.28 No Bid
CS-212 - 8" Wide 25 rolls $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.33 $79.79 $97.22 $6.50 No Bid
MANHOLE CASTINGS W/LIDS
(LABELED SANITARY SEWER)
Ma”?f;fﬁgiﬂlnféé‘” Lid 25 $195.00 $197.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.94 $218.89 $209.57 $200.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting wiLid 15 $195.00 $197.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.94 $218.89 $209.57 $217.33 No Bid
Traffic - #1154
MANHOLE CASTING RISERS
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 23" x 1" 10 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $143.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 23.5" x 1" 25 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $131.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 23" x 1.5" 10 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $143.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 24" x 1" 20 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $163.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 26" x 1" 25 $141.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.77 $149.32 $142.25 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Solid 26" x 1.25" 10 $141.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.77 $149.32 $153.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Adj. 23" x 1.5" 5 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $160.00 No Bid
Manhole Casting Riser - Adj. 23.5" x 1.5" 5 $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.86 $138.59 $160.00 No Bid
PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS
4" Romac Saddle #218-4804U 5 $79.00 $74.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.72 $74.27 $74.73 $71.98
6" PVC x 6" PVC Fernco 5 $8.50 $7.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.21 $8.15 $10.25 $7.90
8" PVC x 8" PVC Fernco 15 $12.80 $11.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.63 $12.49 $13.15 $12.20
6" SCH 35 PVC 45° 5 $12.00 $10.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.93 $10.60 $10.76 $10.70
6" SCH 40 PVC 45° 10 $16.00 $17.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.25 $15.35 $22.38 $22.95
3/4" SCH 80 PVC Coupling, Socket x Socket 50 $1.75 $2.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.77 $1.90 $2.10 $1.45
3/4" SCH 80 PVC Adapter, Socket x FIPT 50 $1.80 $2.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $1.96 $2.26 $1.45
1" SCH 80 PVC Coupling 25 $1.80 $2.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 $1.96 $2.09 $1.55
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MANHOLE RISERS
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 3 inches 25 $56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.66 $45.36 $48.91 $45.00 No Bid
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 4 inches 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.88 $45.36 $39.87 No Bid
Concrete Manhole Riser 4 foot x 6 inches 25 $85.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.33 $49.48 $42.21 $65.00 No Bid
Infra-Riser 4 foot x 1 inch 25 $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.29 $38.96 $41.28 No Bid
Infra-Riser 4 foot x 1.5 inches 25 $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.14 $59.84 $58.60 No Bid
Infra-Riser 4 foot x 2 inches 25 $73.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.01 $80.76 $75.00 No Bid
Infra-Riser 4 foot x 3 inches 25 $108.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.29 $119.70 $109.22 No Bid
Infra-Riser 4 foot x 1 inch - 2 inches - Taper 10 $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.14 $59.84 $69.60 No Bid
Polyurethane Joint Sealant/Adhesive 50 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.93 $4.59 No Bid
HYMAX COUPLINGS
4" HYMAX COUPLING 20 $153.00 $133.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $131.25 $135.40 $138.31 $136.13 $135.40
#2000 -0563-260
6" HYMAX COUPLING 25 $205.00 $177.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $173.82 $179.32 $183.17 $176.35 $179.10
#2000-0768-260

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS (MIS-QUOTED - SHOULD HAVE BEEN $65.00)
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