CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: JULY 7, 2017 TIME: 2:00 P.M.

AWARDED BID
DESCRIPTION e “ope || oeason || werer || supeiy || sueeiy || sares || corrots || ewee | |KEROTEST|| MARECO || S5 || 'Sions || sions || wasten
BARREL LOCKS
Barrel Locks - Brooks #8509910 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 $2.60 No Bid No Bid $1.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.07
Barrel Lock Key - Blue 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.13 $56.40 No Bid No Bid $37.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.28
BLACK IRON FITTINGS
¥" x 2" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥" x 3" Nipple 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.08 No Bid No Bid $0.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 4" Nipple 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.35 No Bid No Bid $1.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥" x 10" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85 No Bid No Bid $3.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" 900 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 No Bid No Bid $1.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Cap 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.40 No Bid No Bid $1.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥" x 1" 90° Reducer 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.57 No Bid No Bid $3.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 2" Nipple 1200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.41 No Bid No Bid $1.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 4" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.90 No Bid No Bid $1.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Tee 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.27 No Bid No Bid $3.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Plug 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.91 No Bid No Bid $1.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Cap 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.70 No Bid No Bid $2.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1"x 1" x 1-1/4" Tee 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.48 No Bid No Bid $8.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 1-1/4" 90° Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.32 No Bid No Bid $5.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 1-1/2" 90° Reducer 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.96 No Bid No Bid $6.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/4" x 2" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.89 No Bid No Bid $1.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BLACK IRON FITTINGS CONT.
1-1/4" x 1-1/2" 90° Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.96 No Bid No Bid $6.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/4" Cap 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.24 No Bid No Bid $2.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid No Bid $2.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 1" Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.30 No Bid No Bid $8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 1-1/2" Reducer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.74 No Bid No Bid $7.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Leak Detector - Gallon 32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.25 No Bid No Bid $16.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Oatey 30212 Blue
Pipe Thread Sealant 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.95 No Bid No Bid $14.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Blue Monster - PTFE #76005 ' '
Pipe Thread Sealant Tape 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.65 No Bid No Bid $2.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Blue Monster-PTFE #70885 ' '
CAST IRON METER BAR
Cast Iron Meter Bar With Cast Integral
Swivels #6660-F - F-1x1 OEM (#CMB-1-1-| 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.30 No Bid $25.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
OEMCO-1)
Cast Iron Meter Bar
#MBST7-1 1-1/4-O1Z 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 No Bid $41.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SS-45LT-11/4-G
Extra 1" Insulating Coupling 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.97 No Bid $6.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extra 1v4" Swivel Nut 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.20 No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXCESS FLOW VALVES
Excess Flow Valves Series 700 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.40 $56.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves Series 1800 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.40 $56.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves Series 5500 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves Series 10000 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $335.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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METER VALVES
3/4" Meter Valve #H-11175 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.97 No Bid No Bid $14.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER VALVES- Contract
3/4" Meter Valve #H-11175 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.97 No Bid No Bid $14.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REGULATORS
Fisher HSR - 3/4" x 1" conn. 800 $48.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.25 $29.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
3/16" orifice, 5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
Fisher 627-R - 3/4” conn, 800 $131.37 || NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || No Bid
1/4" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring
GAS REGULATOR REPAIR PARTS
Fisher PRX Pilot Kit (RPRX00X0N22) 2 $398.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 2" EZR Regulator 3 $395.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 4" EZR Regulator 4 $507.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Amer'cagﬁii;i?o Repair Kit 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Amer'c(";%ﬁ%;li;)o Repair Kit 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Ame”(gg f;;igo Repair Kit 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
Ame”igg fssoc;s?)o Repair Kit 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
GAS REPAIR CLAMPS
1" x 6" Full Circle Clamp . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Mueller #231-06-0131 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.65 No Bid $47.35 $40.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ZM); Z”gr 2#5':0”8'_(():7"_%'263(;'&”1" 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.70 No Bid $49.32 $29.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || NoBid
GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS
3 n _ H
Dresser %:" Style 90 Self-Locking 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.25 No Bid No Bid $23.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || No Bid
Compression End Cap
3 n n
Dresser %:" x 6" Style 90 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.50 No Bid No Bid $42.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || No Bid
Self-locking, Compression Coupling
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| [l | e e el e | s
STEEL GAS PIPE- Contract
¥4" Steel Gas Pipe 80,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Steel Gas Pipe 2,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Steel Gas Pipe 40,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TAP TEES
¥" Tap Tee-#H-18102 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.65 No Bid No Bid $19.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Tap Tee-#H-17650 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $118.95 No Bid No Bid $103.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TAPECOAT
TAPECOAT 50 rls. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Roskote R28 5 Gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.90 No Bid No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP  (Labeled GAS)
Valve Box Frame & Top 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.10 $116.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD FLANGE
3/4" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.96 No Bid No Bid $14.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Cap, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.90 No Bid No Bid $18.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Cap, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.40 No Bid No Bid $10.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 90°, weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.75 No Bid No Bid $11.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 45°, weld 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.65 No Bid No Bid $11.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Tee, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.62 No Bid No Bid $25.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $16.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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WELD FLANGE CONT.
2" 4-hole Flange Kit 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.25 No Bid No Bid $8.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid $15.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Blind Flange 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid $13.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" x 2" Reducer, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid $25.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" x 3" Reducer, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid No Bid $20.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" 90°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.10 No Bid No Bid $24.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Cap, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $16.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES
3/4" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.50 No Bid No Bid $173.00 $102.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $191.50 No Bid No Bid $168.00 $112.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.00 No Bid $171.35 No Bid No Bid $137.68 $138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES -Contract
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.00 No Bid $171.35 No Bid No Bid $137.68 $138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Valve - Weld x Weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $320.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid $267.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LINE STOP FITTINGS
2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17155 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.25 No Bid No Bid $100.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17160 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.40 No Bid No Bid $112.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PRESSURE GAUGES
Pressure Gauge 0-5 2-1/2" Gauge,
1/4" Bottom Mount, All Stainless, Glycerin 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.11 No Bid No Bid $132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled
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PRESSURE GAUGES CONT.
Pressure Gauge 0-15 2-1/2" Gauge,
1/4" Bottom Mount, All Stainless, Glycerin 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.06 No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled
1/4" x 2" Nipple - Stainless Steel 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid $7.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" x 2" Nipple - Stainless Steel 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.65 No Bid No Bid $13.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adapter - Stainless Steel 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.98 No Bid No Bid $7.34 NoBid || NoBid || No Bid
1/4" NPT x 3/8" Compression
1/4" NPT Threaded Ball Valve
Stainless Steel, PTFE Seat 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.56 No Bid No Bid $78.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Parker B-series #4F-B6LJ-SSP
HART Dielectric Union
Stainless Steel, #D-3131-3-V-304 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $114.98 No Bid No Bid $133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2", Viton
ROTARY GAS METERS
Rotary Gas Meter (SM) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid ||$1,829.85|| NoBid No Bid No Bid $1,789.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid || NoBid || No Bid
Counter-drive version
MARKER SIGNS
Marker Signs - Gas 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.78 $9.50 No Bid
U-Channel Post, #2, Green, 8ft. 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.60 $12.60 No Bid
GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS
R-275/AC-250 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.46 $175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
R-415/AL-425 w/ 45 LT. conn. 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $216.50 $325.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AC-630/Sonix 600 w/ 45 LT. Conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $688.50 $945.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AL-800/Sonix 880 w/45 LT. conn. 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $903.50 $1,160.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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