CITY OF GALLATIN - DEPT. OF PUBLIC UTILITIES

BID OPENING -
UTILITY BILLS
AUGUST 2, 2013 @ 2:00 P.M.
AWARDED BID
COMPANY ITEM BID PRICE
Utility Bills No Bid
Past Due No Bid
Balentine Press #10 Bulk Rate Envelopes No Bid
175 Old Shackle Island Road #10 Blank Envelopes No Bid
Commerce Park, Suite 3 #9 Return Envelopes No Bid
Hendersonville, TN 37075 Night Drop Envelopes No Bid
Water Quality Report Envelopes No Bid
Gallatin Final Bill No Bid
Utility Bills $0.0164
Past Due $0.0164
#10 Bulk Rate Envelopes $0.0215
Pinnacle Business Products #10 Blank Envelopes $0.0215
3556 Cross Plains Road #9 Return Envelopes $0.017
White House, TN 37188 Night Drop Envelopes $0.056
Water Quality Report Envelopes $0.071
Gallatin Final Bill $0.0164
Utility Bills $0.023215
Past Due $0.0237714
Printworks #10 Bulk Rate Envelopes $0.03535
493 Cave Road #10 Blank Envelopes $0.04235
Nashville, TN 37210 #9 Return Envelopes $0.025385
Night Drop Envelopes $0.0508
Water Quality Report Envelopes $0.01466
Gallatin Final Bill $0.0544
Utility Bills No Bid
Past Due No Bid
#10 Bulk Rate Envelopes No Bid
Quality Printing Company #10 Blank Envelopes No Bid
141 East Eastland Avenue #9 Return Envelopes No Bid
Gallatin, TN 37066 Night Drop Envelopes No Bid
Water Quality Report Envelopes No Bid
Gallatin Final Bill No Bid
Utility Bills $0.01495
Past Due $0.01469
Sow the Seeds Ministries #10 Bulk Rate Envelopes $0.021
3556 Cross Plains Road #10 Blank Envelopes $0.021
White House, TN 37188 #9 Return Envelopes $0.016
Night Drop Envelopes $0.039941
Water Quality Report Envelopeq $0.06211

Gallatin Final Bill

$0.014481




	Sheet1

