
BID TABULATION
CITY OF GALLATIN
CONTRACT 111 - WOODVALE PUMP STATION, FORCE MAIN & INTERCEPTOR SEWERS

CITY OF GALLATIN
239 Hancock Street
Gallatin, TN  37066

BID DATE:  4/3/12

BID SECURITY BID BOND BID BOND
BIDDER AND GARRISON CONST SCOTT & RITTER W & O CONST CIVIL CONST JERRY B. YOUNG
ADDRESS 6960 Greensburg Rd. P.O. Box 749 P.O. Box 239 P.O. Box 685 2150 Philadelphia Rd.

Greensburg, KY  42743 Bowling Green, KY  42102 Livingston, TN  3870 Franklin, TN  37065 Lebanon, TN  37087
BASE BID UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM QUAN. UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
1 34 L.F. F & I 10" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 6'- 8' DEEP 43.75 1,487.50 129.00 4,386.00 40.00 1,360.00 64.00 2,176.00 58.62 1,993.08
2 61 L.F. F & I 10" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 8'-10' DEEP 52.55 3,205.55 130.00 7,930.00 45.00 2,745.00 66.00 4,026.00 57.28 3,494.08
3 2,247 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 0'- 6' DEEP 39.90 89,655.30 58.00 130,326.00 50.00 112,350.00 59.00 132,573.00 63.57 142,841.79

4 1,361 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 6'- 8' DEEP 49.95 67,981.95 59.00 80,299.00 55.00 74,855.00 62.00 84,382.00 55.38 75,372.18
5 680 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 8'-10' DEEP 57.15 38,862.00 60.00 40,800.00 60.00 40,800.00 63.00 42,840.00 57.94 39,399.20
6 184 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 10'-12' DEEP 64.45 11,858.80 61.00 11,224.00 65.00 11,960.00 65.00 11,960.00 66.08 12,158.72
7 246 L.F. F & I  8" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 0'- 6' DEEP 88.90 21,869.40 143.00 35,178.00 80.00 19,680.00 67.00 16,482.00 104.59 25,729.14
8 62 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 8'- 10' DEEP 122.55 7,598.10 137.00 8,494.00 100.00 6,200.00 70.00 4,340.00 119.57 7,413.34
9 62 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 10'- 12' DEEP 130.85 8,112.70 138.00 8,556.00 110.00 6,820.00 75.00 4,650.00 122.29 7,581.98

10 89 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 12'- 14' DEEP 141.80 12,620.20 139.00 12,371.00 120.00 10,680.00 82.00 7,298.00 131.72 11,723.08
11 76 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 14'- 16' DEEP 152.30 11,574.80 140.00 10,640.00 140.00 10,640.00 92.00 6,992.00 145.09 11,026.84
12 106 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 16'- 18' DEEP 161.05 17,071.30 141.00 14,946.00 160.00 16,960.00 108.00 11,448.00 159.81 16,939.86
13 148 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 18'- 20' DEEP 190.75 28,231.00 142.00 21,016.00 180.00 26,640.00 125.00 18,500.00 171.01 25,309.48
14 2 EA. F & I 12" x 6" SERVICE TEE 765.00 1,530.00 635.00 1,270.00 200.00 400.00 530.00 1,060.00 493.02 986.04
15 2 EA. F & I 6" SERVICE BENDS OR FITTINGS 120.00 240.00 20.00 40.00 75.00 150.00 30.00 60.00 73.09 146.18
16 50 L.F. F & I 6" PVC SERVICE LINE 28.10 1,405.00 23.00 1,150.00 20.00 1,000.00 35.00 1,750.00 25.89 1,294.50
17 1 EA. F & I 6” CLEAN OUT 365.00 365.00 150.00 150.00 200.00 200.00 210.00 210.00 164.64 164.64
18 2 EA. F & I REPLACEMENT 4’ DIA MANHOLE 2,915.00 5,830.00 3,010.00 6,020.00 2,000.00 4,000.00 2,600.00 5,200.00 2,216.73 4,433.46
19 1 EA. F & I CONNECTION TO EXISTING MANHOLE 1,675.00 1,675.00 1,130.00 1,130.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 1,350.00 1,350.00 641.41 641.41
20 19 EA. F & I STD. 4’ DIA. MANHOLE 1,975.00 37,525.00 2,070.00 39,330.00 1,500.00 28,500.00 2,340.00 44,460.00 2,817.19 53,526.61
21 30 V.F. F & I EXTRA DEPTH (OVER 6’) 340.00 10,200.00 153.00 4,590.00 250.00 7,500.00 275.00 8,250.00 191.12 5,733.60
22 16 EA. F & I MANHOLE WATERTIGHT FRAME & COVER 690.25 11,044.00 340.00 5,440.00 700.00 11,200.00 362.00 5,792.00 724.58 11,593.28
23 1 EA. F & I MANHOLE VENT ASSEMBLY 1,820.00 1,820.00 1,715.00 1,715.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 2,790.00 2,790.00 2,099.97 2,099.97
24 60 L.F. F & I 20” STEEL CASING BY OPEN CUT 127.90 7,674.00 137.00 8,220.00 120.00 7,200.00 215.00 12,900.00 135.56 8,133.60
25 4,800 L.F. F & I 10” SDR-26 PVC SEWER FORCE MAIN 16.65 79,920.00 22.50 108,000.00 36.00 172,800.00 32.00 153,600.00 22.14 106,272.00
26 60 L.F. F & I 10” CLASS 350 DUCTILE IRON FORCE MAIN (RESTRAINED) 79.95 4,797.00 131.00 7,860.00 46.00 2,760.00 84.00 5,040.00 66.91 4,014.60
27 2 EA. F & I COMBINATION AIR & VACUUM RELIEF VALVE 4,895.00 9,790.00 4,625.00 9,250.00 3,500.00 7,000.00 4,660.00 9,320.00 4,059.37 8,118.74
28 1 L.S. F & I PUMP STATION PER PLANS 524,895.00 524,895.00 509,495.00 509,495.00 517,000.00 517,000.00 542,565.00 542,565.00 560,970.71 560,970.71
29 1 L.S. ABANDON EXISTING PUMP STATION 9,500.00 9,500.00 2,830.00 2,830.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 8,535.00 8,535.00 1,818.95 1,818.95
30 550 LB. F & I D.I.M.J FITTINGS 17.10 9,405.00 7.00 3,850.00 6.00 3,300.00 8.00 4,400.00 15.61 8,585.50
31 200 TN F & I CRUSHED STONE 20.10 4,020.00 17.45 3,490.00 18.00 3,600.00 25.00 5,000.00 34.77 6,954.00
32 25 C.Y. F & I CLASS “B” CONCRETE 125.00 3,125.00 145.00 3,625.00 130.00 3,250.00 120.00 3,000.00 139.26 3,481.50
33 55 C.Y. F & I FLOWABLE FILL 100.00 5,500.00 85.00 4,675.00 120.00 6,600.00 88.00 4,840.00 106.46 5,855.30
34 180 S.Y. F & I PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT 67.00 12,060.00 27.00 4,860.00 50.00 9,000.00 45.00 8,100.00 35.66 6,418.80
35 1 L.S. F & I SEDIMENT & EROSION CONTROL 5,000.00 5,000.00 11,330.00 11,330.00 18,000.00 18,000.00 17,700.00 17,700.00 16,417.81 16,417.81

TOTAL BASE BID 1,067,448.60 1,124,486.00 1,151,150.00 1,193,589.00 1,198,643.97

BID BOND BID BOND

JAMES C. HAILEY & COMPANY
Consulting Engineers

7518 Highway 70 South, Suite 100
Nashville, TN 37221

Project No. 10162

BID BOND



BIDDER AND GARRISON CONST SCOTT & RITTER W & O CONST CIVIL CONST JERRY B. YOUNG
ADDRESS 6960 Greensburg Rd. P.O. Box 749 P.O. Box 239 P.O. Box 685 2150 Philadelphia Rd.

Greensburg, TN  42742 Bowling Green, KY  42102 Livingston, TN  3870 Franklin, TN  37065 Lebanon, TN  37087
ADJUSTMENT ITEMS: (for use with Pump Station Construction
Only) UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
C,Y. Rock (Mass Excavation) 40.00 20.00 100.00 19.00 18.00
C,Y. Rock (Trench Excavation) 65.00 175.00 100.00 58.00 18.00
C,Y. Earth Excavation 30.00 15.00 30.00 10.00 11.00
C,Y. Concrete (in place w/o forms) 125.00 200.00 250.00 130.00 300.00
C,Y. Concrete (in place including forms) 250.00 500.00 350.00 465.00 350.00
LB. Reinforcing Steel 3.00 5.00 1.00 1.75 8.00
TN. Crushed Stone or Gravel (in place) 22.00 25.00 20.00 23.00 38.00
C.Y. Engineer Earth Fill (in place) 35.00 25.00 40.00 15.00 35.00
L.F. Chain Link Fence 35.05 20.00 24.00 9.00 51.00

ALTERNATE EQUIPMENT 
PUMPING STATION - PUMPS

No Bid No Bid 48,000.00        250,000.00       No Bid
A. WILO-USA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C



BID SECURITY
BIDDER AND MOORE CONST M. G. HALL CLEARY CONST CHARLES DEWEESE
ADDRESS P.O. Box 691 P.O. Box 2863 2006 Edmonton Rd. P.O. Box 504

Clarksville, TN  37041 Cookeville, TN  38502 Tompkinsville, KY  42167 Franklin, KY  42135
BASE BID UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM QUAN. UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
1 34 L.F. F & I 10" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 6'- 8' DEEP 69.00 2,346.00 60.00 2,040.00 83.00 2,822.00 58.20 1,978.80
2 61 L.F. F & I 10" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 8'-10' DEEP 71.00 4,331.00 60.00 3,660.00 93.00 5,673.00 56.90 3,470.90
3 2,247 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 0'- 6' DEEP 71.00 159,537.00 105.00 235,935.00 66.00 148,302.00 58.35 131,112.45
4 1,361 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 6'- 8' DEEP 74.00 100,714.00 115.00 156,515.00 76.00 103,436.00 60.55 82,408.55
5 680 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 8'-10' DEEP 76.00 51,680.00 80.00 54,400.00 86.00 58,480.00 61.15 41,582.00
6 184 L.F. F & I 12" PVC SEWER PIPE @ 10'-12' DEEP 86.00 15,824.00 80.00 14,720.00 97.00 17,848.00 79.80 14,683.20
7 246 L.F. F & I  8" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 0'- 6' DEEP 103.00 25,338.00 120.00 29,520.00 104.00 25,584.00 90.60 22,287.60
8 62 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 8'- 10' DEEP 133.00 8,246.00 120.00 7,440.00 145.00 8,990.00 111.50 6,913.00
9 62 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 10'- 12' DEEP 144.00 8,928.00 150.00 9,300.00 155.00 9,610.00 125.80 7,799.60

10 89 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 12'- 14' DEEP 160.00 14,240.00 160.00 14,240.00 165.00 14,685.00 135.00 12,015.00
11 76 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 14'- 16' DEEP 165.00 12,540.00 160.00 12,160.00 175.00 13,300.00 152.85 11,616.60
12 106 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 16'- 18' DEEP 190.00 20,140.00 180.00 19,080.00 185.00 19,610.00 167.50 17,755.00
13 148 L.F. F & I 12" 401 LINED DUCTILE IRON  SEWER PIPE @ 18'- 20' DEEP 230.00 34,040.00 180.00 26,640.00 195.00 28,860.00 191.10 28,282.80
14 2 EA. F & I 12" x 6" SERVICE TEE 1,400.00 2,800.00 150.00 300.00 940.00 1,880.00 200.00 400.00
15 2 EA. F & I 6" SERVICE BENDS OR FITTINGS 177.00 354.00 50.00 100.00 100.00 200.00 15.00 30.00
16 50 L.F. F & I 6" PVC SERVICE LINE 47.00 2,350.00 20.00 1,000.00 52.00 2,600.00 26.50 1,325.00
17 1 EA. F & I 6” CLEAN OUT 295.00 295.00 350.00 350.00 420.00 420.00 330.00 330.00
18 2 EA. F & I REPLACEMENT 4’ DIA MANHOLE 1,765.00 3,530.00 3,500.00 7,000.00 6,000.00 12,000.00 2,620.00 5,240.00
19 1 EA. F & I CONNECTION TO EXISTING MANHOLE 1,530.00 1,530.00 750.00 750.00 1,550.00 1,550.00 1,100.00 1,100.00
20 19 EA. F & I STD. 4’ DIA. MANHOLE 2,120.00 40,280.00 2,000.00 38,000.00 2,000.00 38,000.00 1,400.00 26,600.00
21 30 V.F. F & I EXTRA DEPTH (OVER 6’) 165.00 4,950.00 150.00 4,500.00 200.00 6,000.00 200.00 6,000.00
22 16 EA. F & I MANHOLE WATERTIGHT FRAME & COVER 890.00 14,240.00 700.00 11,200.00 550.00 8,800.00 660.00 10,560.00
23 1 EA. F & I MANHOLE VENT ASSEMBLY 1,765.00 1,765.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,660.00 1,660.00 1,700.00 1,700.00
24 60 L.F. F & I 20” STEEL CASING BY OPEN CUT 160.00 9,600.00 88.00 5,280.00 110.00 6,600.00 145.00 8,700.00
25 4,800 L.F. F & I 10” SDR-26 PVC SEWER FORCE MAIN 36.00 172,800.00 30.00 144,000.00 38.00 182,400.00 34.00 163,200.00
26 60 L.F. F & I 10” CLASS 350 DUCTILE IRON FORCE MAIN (RESTRAINED) 62.00 3,720.00 60.00 3,600.00 85.00 5,100.00 84.00 5,040.00
27 2 EA. F & I COMBINATION AIR & VACUUM RELIEF VALVE 8,700.00 17,400.00 4,500.00 9,000.00 5,200.00 10,400.00 5,740.00 11,480.00
28 1 L.S. F & I PUMP STATION PER PLANS 508,000.00 508,000.00 496,260.00 496,260.00 570,000.00 570,000.00 683,200.00 683,200.00
29 1 L.S. ABANDON EXISTING PUMP STATION 11,800.00 11,800.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 8,500.00 8,500.00
30 550 LB. F & I D.I.M.J FITTINGS 5.90 3,245.00 1.00 550.00 4.00 2,200.00 5.00 2,750.00
31 200 TN F & I CRUSHED STONE 21.00 4,200.00 1.00 200.00 18.00 3,600.00 25.00 5,000.00
32 25 C.Y. F & I CLASS “B” CONCRETE 124.00 3,100.00 1.00 25.00 85.00 2,125.00 150.00 3,750.00
33 55 C.Y. F & I FLOWABLE FILL 130.00 7,150.00 1.00 55.00 75.00 4,125.00 90.00 4,950.00
34 180 S.Y. F & I PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT 106.00 19,080.00 1.00 180.00 62.00 11,160.00 45.00 8,100.00
35 1 L.S. F & I SEDIMENT & EROSION CONTROL 5,900.00 5,900.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 18,750.00 18,750.00

TOTAL BASE BID 1,295,993.00 1,325,000.00 1,344,520.00 1,358,610.50

BID BOND BID BOND BID BOND BID BOND



BIDDER AND MOORE CONST M. G. HALL CLEARY CONST CHARLES DEWEESE
ADDRESS P.O. Box 691 P.O. Box 2863 2006 Edmonton Rd. P.O. Box 504

Clarksville, TN  37041 Cookeville, TN  38502 Tompkinsville, KY  42167 Franklin, KY  42135
ADJUSTMENT ITEMS: (for use with Pump Station Construction
Only) UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
C,Y. Rock (Mass Excavation) 32.00 1.50 40.00 9.00
C,Y. Rock (Trench Excavation) 45.00 200.00 80.00 13.50
C,Y. Earth Excavation 8.00 15.00 10.00 6.00
C,Y. Concrete (in place w/o forms) 150.00 500.00 225.00 200.00
C,Y. Concrete (in place including forms) 275.00 500.00 450.00 650.00
LB. Reinforcing Steel 7.50 2.00 2.50 1.65
TN. Crushed Stone or Gravel (in place) 24.00 30.00 28.00 25.00
C.Y. Engineer Earth Fill (in place) 14.00 58.00 10.00 15.00
L.F. Chain Link Fence 40.00 35.00 30.00 25.00

ALTERNATE EQUIPMENT 
PUMPING STATION - PUMPS

No Bid No Bid 48,000.00        248,302.00       
A. WILO-USA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C

I, Matthew R. Tucker,  certify that the above Bid Tabulation reflects the actual Bids submitted with
errors corrected for Contract 111 - Woodvale Pump Station, Force Main & Interceptor Sewers


