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Description Qty Chris-More
Consolidated 

Pipe
G&C Supply Volunteer

Southern 
Pipe

Core & Main Badger Meter Hayes  Pipe CI Thornburg Fortiline

2" PLASTIC METER BOX & LID

2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $306.42 No Bid No Bid $358.00 $99.16 No Bid

BRASS WATER VALVES AND 
FITTINGS 

3/4" Coupling                                   
Ford #C44-33Q-NL

75 No Bid $17.00 $14.32 $14.08 $14.21 $14.28 No Bid $14.35 $13.87 $14.01

 1"  Coupling                                    
Ford #C44-44Q-NL

75 No Bid $18.50 $16.37 $16.11 $16.24 $16.34 No Bid $16.41 $15.87 $16.03

3/4" x 1" Coupling                            
Ford #C44-34Q-NL

15 No Bid $18.75 $16.63 $16.36 $16.49 $16.59 No Bid $16.67 $16.12 $16.28

3/4" Meter Coupling                           
Ford #C38-23-3-NL

100 No Bid $8.50 $9.26 $9.10 $9.20 $9.24 No Bid $9.30 $8.96 $9.06

1" Pack Joint Female Adapter          
Ford #C14-44Q-NL

25 No Bid $14.95 $16.78 $16.51 $16.64 $16.74 No Bid $16.85 $16.25 $16.42

1" Male Adapter                                   
Ford #C84-44Q-NL

50 No Bid $16.50 $13.92 $13.70 $13.80 $19.89 No Bid $13.95 $13.49 $13.63

2" Male Adapter                               
Ford #C84-77-NL

25 No Bid $66.40 $55.56 $54.68 $55.14 $55.43 No Bid $55.75 $53.85 $54.40

3/4" Meter Adapter                              
A-23-NL

50 No Bid No Bid $8.11 $7.99 $8.05 $8.09 No Bid $8.15 $7.87 $7.95

3/4" Meter Valve                                              
Ford #B43-232W-Q-NL

100 No Bid $43.35 $35.31 $34.77 $35.03 $35.23 No Bid $35.00 $34.23 $34.59

1" Meter Valve                                  
Ford #B43-344W-Q-NL

25 No Bid $79.00 $65.02 $63.98 $64.53 $64.87 No Bid $65.20 $63.06 $63.65

3/4" Curb Stop - IP x IP                                 
Ford #B11-233W-NL

25 No Bid $31.85 $26.43 $26.03 $26.23 $26.38 No Bid $26.50 $25.64 $25.90

1" Curb Stop - IP x Comp                   
Ford #B41-444W-Q-NL

50 No Bid $86.00 $71.65 $70.52 $71.11 $71.49 No Bid $71.10 $69.40 $70.15

3/4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp               
Ford #B44-233W-Q-NL

100 No Bid $40.60 $33.76 $33.24 $33.49 $33.69 No Bid $33.50 $32.74 $33.07

3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" Tee                        
Ford #T444-333Q-NL

50 No Bid $39.15 $34.64 $34.10 $34.37 $34.56 No Bid $34.75 $33.58 $33.93

2" x 6" Brass Nipple 25 No Bid $14.00 $19.09 $17.52 $15.46 $13.48 No Bid $14.00 $12.59 $13.29

2" x 12" Brass Nipple 5 No Bid $27.00 $37.62 $34.49 $30.47 $26.58 No Bid $27.00 $24.80 $26.16

2" Brass Coupling 10 No Bid $10.90 $15.59 $16.41 $13.83 $12.17 No Bid $13.65 $11.57 $10.65

3/4" x 1" Brass Bushing 15 No Bid $2.25 $3.06 $2.88 $2.63 $2.29 No Bid $2.55 $2.18 $2.36

3/4" x 7" Meter Resetter                      
Ford #V42-7W-NL

500 No Bid $81.00 $71.14 $68.34 $69.84 $70.21 No Bid $69.80 $66.79 $67.99

1" X 12" Meter Resetter                           
Ford #V44-12W-NL

15 No Bid $166.00 $137.56 $133.62 $136.52 $137.25 No Bid $137.95 $131.11 $132.93

2" Copper Setter                    
McDonald #720-715WNFF-770

25 No Bid $857.90 No Bid $657.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid $749.00 $643.95 $653.86

CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    September 13, 2018 @  2:00 P.M.
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Southern 
Pipe
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CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    September 13, 2018 @  2:00 P.M.

BRASS WATER VALVES AND 
FITTINGS CONT.

3/4" Corporation Stop                           
Ford #FB100-3-Q-NL

50 No Bid $44.00 $37.93 $37.32 $37.64 $1,829.39 No Bid $38.00 $36.75 $37.13

1" Corporation Stop                           
Ford #FB100-3-Q-NL

25 No Bid $57.95 $49.88 $49.08 $49.50 $1,244.16 No Bid $50.00 $48.34 $48.83

CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER

4" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid $13.25 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid $15.96

6" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $24.00 $44.52 No Bid $22.10 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid $26.60

12" x 18" x 20" 100 No Bid $35.00 $63.60 No Bid $32.40 No Bid No Bid $37.00 No Bid $39.36

COPPER - TYPE K

¾" Copper 2,400 ft. No Bid $2.75 $2.69 No Bid $2.54 $2.42 No Bid $3.18 $2.393 $3.74

1" Copper                                 1,200 ft. No Bid $3.50 $3.54 No Bid $3.27 $3.15 No Bid $4.14 $3.113 $4.86

INFRA-RISER VALVE BOX 
RISERS

1" x 18' x 20" 25 No Bid $23.50 No Bid No Bid $24.60 No Bid No Bid $29.50 No Bid $30.93

2" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $47.00 No Bid No Bid $49.21 No Bid No Bid $53.00 No Bid $61.87

3" x 18" x 20" 25 No Bid $71.00 No Bid No Bid $74.27 No Bid No Bid $79.00 No Bid $93.37

MUNICIPEX

3/4" Municipex 500 ft. No Bid $0.69 No Bid No Bid $0.67 $1.55 No Bid $1.85 $0.66 $1.88

1" Municipex 500 ft. No Bid $1.02 No Bid No Bid $0.97 $2.32 No Bid $2.95 $0.969 $2.81

2" Municipex 1,000 ft. No Bid $6.35 No Bid No Bid $6.03 $14.43 No Bid $16.50 $6.00 $17.50

REPAIR CLAMPS 

6" x 7½" Full Circle Clamp- CI                            
Ford #F1-724-75

10 No Bid $51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.85 No Bid $40.75 No Bid $48.49

8" x 12" Full Circle Clamp - CI                         
Ford #F1-939-125

5 No Bid $103.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.00 No Bid $77.00 No Bid $77.57

1" x 3" Patch Clamp                             
S-B #245-013203-000

5 No Bid $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.71 No Bid $7.25 No Bid $6.59

1" x 6" Patch Clamp                             
S-B #245-013206-000

5 No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.74 No Bid $13.25 No Bid $11.88

2" x 3" Patch Clamp                             
S-B #245-023803-000

5 No Bid $8.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.48 No Bid $9.00 No Bid $7.89
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CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
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REPAIR CLAMPS CONT.

1/2" Galv. Comp. Coupling                 
S-B #522-08400-003

5 No Bid $12.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.60 No Bid $12.50 No Bid $13.35

3/4" Galv. Comp. Coupling                    
S-B #522-10500-003

5 No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.67 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $15.52

2" Galv. Comp. Coupling                    
S-B #522-23800-003

10 No Bid $29.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.81 No Bid $29.50 No Bid $32.84

TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR 
SLEEVES AND SERVICE 

SADDLES

6" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC           
Ford #FC202-669-CC3

10 No Bid $62.50 No Bid No Bid $53.04 $42.31 No Bid $62.00 No Bid $64.11

8" x 3/4" Service Saddle - PVC           
Ford #FC202-871-CC3

10 No Bid $72.60 No Bid No Bid $60.79 $59.61 No Bid $70.50 No Bid $74.57

6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC              
Ford #FC202-669-CC4

5 No Bid $62.50 No Bid No Bid $53.04 $42.31 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $64.11

8" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC              
Ford #FC202-871-CC4

5 No Bid $72.60 No Bid No Bid $60.79 $59.61 No Bid $63.50 No Bid $74.57

6" X 2" Service Saddle - PVC               
Ford #FC202-669-IP7

5 No Bid $73.65 No Bid No Bid $57.23 $52.12 No Bid $54.00 No Bid $69.64

2" x 3/4" Service Saddle - CI           
Ford #FC202-250-CC3

10 No Bid $56.55 No Bid No Bid $41.00 $34.54 No Bid $37.00 No Bid $55.33

6" x 3/4" Service Saddle  - CI                        
Ford #FC202-760-CC3

30 No Bid $62.50 No Bid No Bid $53.04 $42.31 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $64.11

24" X 3/4" Service Saddle - CI                     
Ford #FC202-2650-CC3

3 No Bid $255.00 No Bid No Bid $137.64 $140.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $263.62

6" x 1" Service Saddle - CI             
Ford #FC202-760-CC4

10 No Bid $62.50 No Bid No Bid $53.04 $42.31 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $64.11

8" x 1" Service Saddle - CI              
Ford #FC202-979-CC4

5 No Bid $73.65 No Bid No Bid $60.79 $49.43 No Bid $52.50 No Bid $74.57

10" x 1" Service Saddle - CI                        
Ford #FC202-1075-CC4

5 No Bid $87.00 No Bid No Bid $73.41 $71.12 No Bid $75.50 No Bid $90.04

6" x 2" Service Saddle - CI                  
Ford #FC202-760-IP7

10 No Bid $74.85 No Bid No Bid $57.23 $52.12 No Bid $55.50 No Bid $69.64

8" x2" Service Saddle - CI            
Ford #FC202-979-IP7

5 No Bid $87.00 No Bid No Bid $65.39 $61.69 No Bid $71.00 No Bid $79.48

6" x 12" CI MJ Sleeve 10 No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid $41.25 $42.24 No Bid $46.50 No Bid $43.10

6" Macro Coupling                         
#261-0760831

25 No Bid $219.00 No Bid No Bid $234.21 $236.66 No Bid $207.75 $182.78 $231.83

8" Macro Coupling                               
#261-0975831

20 No Bid $248.00 No Bid No Bid $265.22 $267.99 No Bid $235.25 $206.98 $262.52

10" Macro Coupling                          
#261-0975831

4 No Bid $321.00 No Bid No Bid $343.11 $354.03 No Bid $351.00 $267.74 $339.58

6" Alpha Coupling                               
#ALPHA-A-7.00

20 No Bid $263.00 No Bid No Bid $280.63 $302.46 No Bid $251.00 $245.07 $277.77
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8" Alpha Coupling                      
#ALPHA-A-7.00

20 No Bid $298.00 No Bid No Bid $318.61 $343.41 No Bid $283.00 $278.50 $315.38

TAPPING SLEEVES, REPAIR 
SLEEVES AND SERVICE 

SADDLES CONT.
10" Alpha Coupling                                         

#ALPHA-A-7.00
10 No Bid $386.00 No Bid No Bid $412.15 $444.23 No Bid $394.50 $359.94 $407.97

VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME

Valve Box Frame & Top 25 No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid $98.97 $101.03 No Bid $52.00 No Bid $100.51

Valve Box Top -Only   #JB-8006 25 No Bid $109.00 No Bid No Bid $30.21 $29.90 No Bid $8.00 No Bid $30.36

VALVES AND DUCTILE IRON 
FITTINGS

2" MJ In-line Valve                      
Mueller #A-2360-8

5 No Bid $239.00 No Bid $245.04 $233.37 $245.66 No Bid $299.00 No Bid $248.55

6" Megalug Retainer for PVC/DI 25 No Bid $23.00 No Bid $22.56 $28.00 $34.33/$27.99 No Bid $23.50 No Bid $34.99

6" MJ Cap 5 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $19.85 $18.44 $19.87 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $19.67

6" MJ 45° 5 No Bid $40.00 No Bid $39.75 $36.88 $39.75 No Bid $41.50 No Bid $39.33

6" MJ Accessory Kit 25 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $14.93 $13.12 $14.15 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $14.00

6" Transition Gasket 50 No Bid $16.00 No Bid $3.20 $3.88 $3.03 No Bid $3.00 No Bid $3.00

16" Transition Gasket 10 No Bid $45.00 No Bid $41.96 $25.00 $39.75 No Bid $44.50 No Bid $26.04

3/4" Brass Gate Valve              
Hammond 645

5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.24 No Bid $62.00 No Bid $27.64

2" Brass Gate Valve                    
Hammond 645

25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.54 No Bid $181.00 No Bid $111.14

WATER METERS

5/8" X 3/4" Water Meter 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $208.00 No Bid

1" Water Meter 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $263.00 No Bid

2" Water Meter 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,276.00 No Bid

Fire Hydrant Meter 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,750.00 No Bid

WATER METER BOX

Water Meter Box and Lid 500 No Bid $35.00 No Bid $33.41 $28.13 $35.20 No Bid $35.50 $24.50 $29.90

Water Meter Box Lid Only 500 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $12.63 $12.48 $12.24 No Bid $17.00 $8.85 $11.34
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CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER MATERIALS BID OPENING  (RESULTS)

DATE:    September 13, 2018 @  2:00 P.M.

PVC AND DUCTILE 
WATER/SEWER PIPE

2" PVC Water Pipe 200 ft. No Bid $0.45 No Bid $0.48 $0.46 $0.43 No Bid No Bid $0.46 $0.66

6" PVC Water Pipe 800 ft. No Bid $3.15 No Bid $3.31 $3.05 $3.10 No Bid No Bid $3.25 $4.66

12" PVC Water Pipe 100 ft. No Bid $11.45 No Bid $12.88 $11.28 $11.52 No Bid No Bid $12.03 $17.32

4" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 130 ft. No Bid $0.88 No Bid $0.80 $0.82 $0.83 No Bid No Bid $0.87 $1.24

6" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 130 ft. No Bid $1.85 No Bid $1.78 $1.77 $1.79 No Bid No Bid $1.84 $2.68

8" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe 130 ft. No Bid $3.25 No Bid $3.20 $3.76 $3.19 No Bid No Bid $3.42 $4.80

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

LOW BIDDER
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