CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.

DESCRIPTION Gjt?lftrjl Kerotest HF?%ZS Experitec | | Tri-State Sogitgsrn De'\:;ron Su|_|!)[|f))ly S(js}iy Ed Young Ci?]ttjrisl.s Clgi?)zl. Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
BARREL LOCKS

Barrel Locks 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.54 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid

Barrel Lock Key - Blue 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.00 No Bid No Bid $49.90 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid
BLACK IRON FITTINGS

9" x 2" Nipple 150 $0.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.64 No Bid $0.84 $0.82 No Bid No Bid $0.65 No Bid No Bid

%" x 3" Nipple 500 $0.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.72 No Bid $0.95 $0.95 No Bid No Bid $0.74 No Bid No Bid

9" x 4" Nipple 350 $0.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.89 No Bid $1.18 $1.15 No Bid No Bid $0.91 No Bid No Bid

¥" x 10" Nipple 100 $2.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.48 No Bid $3.21 $3.07 No Bid No Bid $2.53 No Bid No Bid

4" 90° 50 $1.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.09 No Bid $1.18 $1.18 No Bid No Bid $1.12 No Bid No Bid

¥4" Plug 75 $0.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid $0.90 $0.90 No Bid No Bid $0.87 No Bid No Bid

¥4" Street 90° 15 $2.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.92 No Bid $2.01 $1.94 No Bid No Bid $1.93 No Bid No Bid

1" x 2" Nipple 1,200 $1.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.95 No Bid $1.23 $1.16 No Bid No Bid $0.96 No Bid No Bid

1" x 3" Nipple 25 $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $1.30 $1.24 No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid No Bid

1" x 4" Nipple 25 $1.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.24 No Bid $1.63 $1.55 No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid No Bid

1" x 5" Nipple 25 $1.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.47 No Bid $1.91 $1.84 No Bid No Bid $1.51 No Bid No Bid

1" x 6" Nipple 25 $1.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.74 No Bid $2.28 $2.16 No Bid No Bid $1.78 No Bid No Bid

1"Tee 600 $3.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.96 No Bid $3.19 $2.94 No Bid No Bid $3.05 No Bid No Bid

1" Plug 500 $0.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.86 No Bid $0.90 $0.90 No Bid No Bid $0.87 No Bid No Bid

1" 90° 100 $2.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.90 No Bid $2.04 $1.95 No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid

1" Cap 15 $1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $1.61 $1.59 No Bid No Bid $1.54 No Bid No Bid

1" x 4" 90° 25 $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.29 No Bid $2.45 $2.34 No Bid No Bid $2.35 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
General Hayes . . Southern MT HD G&C Equip. Consl. .
DESCRIPTION Utility Kerotest Pipe Experitec | | Tri-State Pipe Deason Supply Supply Ed Young Controls Pipe Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
134" x 2" Nipple 5 $1.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.44 No Bid $1.91 $1.95 No Bid No Bid $1.51 No Bid No Bid
134" x 1" 90° 50 $5.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.44 No Bid $5.80 $5.56 No Bid No Bid $5.56 No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" Nipple 25 $2.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.07 No Bid $2.77 $2.69 No Bid No Bid $2.18 No Bid No Bid
2" Tee 5 $10.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.96 No Bid $10.96 $10.96 No Bid No Bid $10.50 No Bid No Bid
2" x 1-1/2" 90° 10 $8.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.88 No Bid $8.40 $8.45 No Bid No Bid $8.06 No Bid No Bid
Leak Detector - Gallon . . . . . . . . . .
25 $21.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.32 $13.75 No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid
Oatey 30212 Blue
Pipe Dope - Rectorseal #5 25 $12.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.07 $13.45 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid
Slow Dry - Pints
CAST IRON METER BAR
Cast Iron Meter Bar . . . . . . . . . . .
wiswivels #6620-F - F-1x1 OEM 600 $26.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.87 $22.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extra 1" Insulating Coupling 150 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extra 1%4" Swivel Nut 150 $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXCESS FLOW VALVES
Excess Flow Valves - Series 700 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves - Series 1800 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLANGED VALVES
2" Valve - Fig. 143 (175 CWP) 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $174.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $164.75 No Bid No Bid
GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS
R-275 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.18 $72.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R-415 w/45 LT. Conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $208.14 $207.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AL-800 w/45 LT. conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $921.90 $878.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
General Hayes . . Southern MT HD G&C Equip. Consl. .
DESCRIPTION Utility Kerotest Pipe Experitec | | Tri-State Pipe Deason Supply Supply Ed Young Controls Pipe Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
GAS REGULATORS
Fisher HSR - " x 1" conn. 3/16" orifice, ), No Bid No Bid No Bid $106.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.75 $28.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
Fisher 627 R4Cf‘ps°i‘;”s”brilég orifice, 15 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.14 | $118.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 289H4'_4125 pls i;c’“”" relief, 10 No Bid No Bid NoBid  $148.03 | $150.00 = No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-299-H 2" Body, Dual
Registration 1/2" orifice, 1.0-3.25 psig 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $529.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $564.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid
spring
GAS REGULATOR REPAIR PARTS
Fisher 161EBH Pilot 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $654.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EB-2 Pilot Kit 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EB-3 Pilot Kit 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EB-4 Pilot Kit 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EBH Pilot Kit 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $272.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 2" EZR Regulator 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repsggﬁ'lta‘t‘mEZR Relief 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $273.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repsggﬁ'ltaforEZR Relief 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $544.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS
o/ .
Dresser %" Style 90 Self Locking 75 $20.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.95 No Bid No Bid $15.90 No Bid No Bid
Compression End Cap
LINE STOP FITTINGS
2" Line Stop Fitting #H-17155 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $108.80 No Bid No Bid $115.00 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
General Hayes . . Southern MT HD G&C Equip. Consl. .
DESCRIPTION Utility Kerotest Pipe Experitec | | Tri-State Pipe Deason Supply Supply Ed Young Controls Pipe Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
MARKER SIGNS
Marker Signs 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50
U-Channel Post, #2, Green, 8 ft. 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00
MARKING PAINT
Marking Paint - Safety Yellow 25 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.88 No Bid $23.16 $24.60 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22.68 No Bid
Marking Paint- Safety Blue 20 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.88 No Bid $23.16 $24.60 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22.68 No Bid
Marking Paint -Safety Green 10 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.88 No Bid $23.16 $24.60 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22.68 No Bid
Marking Paint - White 25 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.88 No Bid $23.16 $24.60 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $22.68 No Bid
METER VALVES
¥," Meter Valve 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.88 No Bid No Bid $15.55 No Bid No Bid
PRESSURE GAUGES
Pressure Gauge 0-5 2-%2" Gauge, ¥4"
Bottom Mount, All Stainless, Glycerin 15 $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled
Pressure Gauge 0-15 2-%%" Gauge, %"
Bottom Mount, All Stainless, Glycerin 20 $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled
Pressure Gauge 0-160 4" Gauge, %4"
Bottom Mount, All Stainless, Glycerin 10 $102.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Filled
Pressure Gauge 0-200 4" Gauge, %4"
Bottom Mount, All Stainless, 1PSI 5 $190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $485.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Increments, Mirror Dial, Glycerin Filled
1/4" x 2" Nipple - Stainless Steel 40 $2.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/4" x 4" Nipple - Stainless Steel 10 $2.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1/4" Bushing - Stainless Steel 15 $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
General Hayes . . Southern MT HD G&C Equip. Consl. .
DESCRIPTION Utility Kerotest Pipe Experitec | | Tri-State Pipe Deason Supply Supply Ed Young Controls Pipe Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
1/2" x 1/4" Bushing - Stainless Steel 15 $2.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" x 1/4" Bushing - Stainless Steel 5 $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 1/4" Bushing - Stainless Steel 5 $4.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" x 1/2" Bushing - Stainless Steel 10 $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/4" Plug - Stainless Steel 50 $1.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/4" Threaded Ball Valve - Stainless 10 $50.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel, 1/4 Turn, Female x Female
3/4" Threaded Ball Valve - Stainless 10 $66.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel, 1/4 Turn, Female x Female
1/4” Compression Ball Valve - Stainless |, $170.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Steel, 1/4 Turn
1/4" Adapter - MIPT x Compression 10 $6.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stainless Steel
1/4" Coupling - Stainless Steel 10 $10.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compression x Compression
ROTARY GAS METERS
2" Rotary Gas Meter (2M) 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  $1,23255  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid  $1,680.00  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Counter-drive version
STEEL GAS PIPE
¥," Steel Gas Pipe 8,400 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid
1" Steel Gas Pipe 210 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid
2" Steel Gas Pipe 210 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.93 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Bare Steel Gas Pipe 105 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid No Bid
1" Bare Steel Gas Pipe 105 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid
2" Bare Steel Gas Pipe 210 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.80 No Bid No Bid
3/4" Black Iron Pipe 150 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.45 No Bid No Bid
1" Black Iron Pipe 150 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.05 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
DESCRIPTION Gjt?l?trjl Kerotest H;{)ZS Experitec | | Tri-State So;itgsrn De'\a/gon Suﬁgly Sﬁéﬁy Ed Young CI(E)?]L::EI'S Clgigzl. Dixie Pkg. Vulcan
TAP TEES
¥," Tap Tee-#H-18102 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.42 No Bid No Bid $19.60 No Bid No Bid
2" Tap Tee-#H-17650 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid
VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP
(Labeled GAS)
Valve Box Frame & Top 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $114.43 No Bid $99.50 $114.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES
1" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid $114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $132.50 No Bid No Bid
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 $192.00 $142.00 No Bid No Bid $184.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $226.90 No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid
METER VALVES- Contract
3/4" Meter Valve 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.88 No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid
STEEL GAS PIPE- Contract
¥," Steel Gas Pipe 40,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.35 No Bid No Bid
1" Steel Gas Pipe 1,200 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid
2" Steel Gas Pipe 15,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.93 No Bid No Bid
4" Steel Gas Pipe 6,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.45 No Bid No Bid
2" Powercrete Steel Gas Pipe 400 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.86 No Bid No Bid
4" Powercrete Steel Gas Pipe 400 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.68 No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES - Contract
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 40 $192.00 $142.00 No Bid No Bid $179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $208.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 $325.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid $310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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DATE: June 18, 2014 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
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WELD FLANGE
1" Cap, weld 50 $20.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.85 No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole weld neck flange 125 $14.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.60 No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating 25 $4.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid
2" Cap, weld 100 $10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.40 No Bid No Bid
2" Tee, weld 75 $22.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.10 No Bid No Bid
2" 90°, weld 100 $10.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.85 No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" Reducer, weld 50 $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.25 No Bid No Bid
2" x 1" Reducer, weld 25 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.32 No Bid No Bid
2" x 1-1/2" Reducer, weld 10 $17.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.05 No Bid No Bid
2" Nipple, Weld x Thread 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid
4" Cap, weld 10 $16.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.90 No Bid No Bid
4" 90°, weld 5 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.45 No Bid No Bid

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS
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