CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: SEPTEMBER 6, 2018 TIME: 2:00 P.M.

DESCRIPTION EXPERITEC TT\/'I'ESTTQFI E SOL;TF',ERN MT DEASON | | CORE & MAIN | | G&cC SuppLY EDSXSE;\'G EC%L,J\I'TPQASII_\'ST NS e 0 || KEROTEST MA'T,LEC'CO"
BARREL LOCKS
Barrel Locks - Brooks #8509910 1000 No Bid No Bid $2.09 No Bid $1.95 $2.49 No Bid No Bid $2.10 No Bid No Bid
Barrel Lock Key - Blue 7 No Bid No Bid $40.67 No Bid $40.13 $53.16 No Bid No Bid $38.50 No Bid No Bid
BLACK IRON FITTINGS
¥4" x 3" Nipple 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.23 No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 4" Nipple 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.53 No Bid No Bid $1.21 No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 6" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.23 No Bid No Bid $1.74 No Bid No Bid
¥" x 10" Nipple 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.27 No Bid No Bid $3.26 No Bid No Bid
¥4" 90° 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.39 No Bid No Bid $1.23 No Bid No Bid
¥4" Plug 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.09 No Bid No Bid $1.02 No Bid No Bid
¥." Cap 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.56 No Bid No Bid $1.48 No Bid No Bid
¥" Coupling 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.87 No Bid No Bid $1.76 No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 1" 90° Reducer 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.88 No Bid No Bid $2.76 No Bid No Bid
1" x 2" Nipple 1500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.60 No Bid No Bid $1.30 No Bid No Bid
1" x 3" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.74 No Bid No Bid $1.34 No Bid No Bid
1" x 4" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.19 No Bid No Bid $1.70 No Bid No Bid
1" x 5" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.58 No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid No Bid
1" x 6" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.29 No Bid No Bid $2.36 No Bid No Bid
1" Tee 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.69 No Bid No Bid $3.52 No Bid No Bid
1" Plug 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.05 No Bid No Bid $1.02 No Bid No Bid
1" 90° 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.41 No Bid No Bid $2.29 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: SEPTEMBER 6, 2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M.

TRI-STATE SOUTHERN ED YOUNG EQUIPMENT CONSOLIDATED MARIE CO.,
DESCRIPTION EXPERITEC METER PIPE MT DEASON CORE & MAIN G&C SUPPLY SALES CONTROLS PIPE KEROTEST INC.
BLACK IRON FITTINGS CONT.
1"x 1" x 1-Y4" Tee 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.56 No Bid No Bid $8.20 No Bid No Bid
Leak Detector - Gallon Oatey 30212 Blue 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.54 No Bid No Bid $16.80 No Bid No Bid
Pipe Thread Sealant . . . . . . . . .
Blue Monster - PTEE#76005 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.68 No Bid No Bid $14.05 No Bid No Bid
Pipe Thread Sealant Tape . . . . . . . . .
Blue Monster - PTEE#70885 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid No Bid $2.60 No Bid No Bid
EXCESS FLOW VALVES
Excess Flow Valves  Series 700 400 No Bid $63.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.16 $58.50 No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves Series 1800 25 No Bid $63.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.16 $58.50 No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves  Series 5500 10 No Bid $422.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $423.89 $565.00 No Bid No Bid
LINE STOP FITTINGS
4" Line Stop Fitting #H-17260 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $689.89 No Bid $695.00 No Bid No Bid
CAST IRON METER BAR
Cast Iron Meter Bar With Cast Integral Swivels
#6660-F - F-1x1 OEM 500 No Bid $26.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89 No Bid $25.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(#CMB-1-1-OEMCO-1)
Cast Iron Meter Bar
#MBST7-1 1-1/4-0O1Z 50 No Bid $41.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.87 No Bid $33.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SS-45LT-11/4-G
GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS
R-275/AC-250 250 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
R-415/AL-425 w/ 45 LT. conn. 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $340.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AC-630/Sonix 600 w/ 45 LT. conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $956.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER VALVES- Contract
¥" Meter Valve #H-11175 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.61 No Bid No Bid $14.93 No Bid No Bid
STEEL GAS PIPE- Contract




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: SEPTEMBER 6, 2018

TIME: 2:00 P.M.

TRI-STATE SOUTHERN ED YOUNG EQUIPMENT | | CONSOLIDATED MARIE CO.,
DESCRIPTION EXPERITEC N=TER e MT DEASON | | CORE & MAIN | | G&C SUPPLY SLES CORTROILE DIPE KEROTEST e
¥," Steel Gas Pipe 40,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 No Bid No Bid
1" Steel Gas Pipe 2,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.19 No Bid No Bid
2" Steel Gas Pipe 10,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.96 No Bid No Bid
GAS REGULATORS
H - 3 n n
Fisher HSR - 94" x 1" conn. 250 $50.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.10 $31.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/16" orifice, 5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
. Fisher 627-R - 2" conn. 10 $380.75 $295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y4" orifice, 15 - 40 psig spring
[Fisher €S400 - 2" conn. 10 $307.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $423.61 $242.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" orifice, 1.4 - 2.9 psig spring
GAS REGULATOR REPAIR PARTS
Fisher PRX Pilot Kit (RPRX00X0N12) 5 $356.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EB Pilot Kit #R161X000012 5 $177.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 2" EZR Regulator . . i . . . . . . .
#18B85D7X032 5 $229.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 4" EZR Regulator . . i . . . . . . .
#18B5952X222 5 $315.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR CLAMPS
¥" x 3" Patch Clamp Mueller #231-03-0105 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.94 $6.84 No Bid No Bid $26.10 No Bid No Bid
¥" x 6" Patch Clamp Mueller #231-06-0105 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.35 $12.77 No Bid No Bid $46.93 No Bid No Bid
1" x 3" Patch Clamp Mueller #231-03-0131 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.54 $7.48 No Bid No Bid $27.43 No Bid No Bid
3" x 12" Full Circle Clamp . . . . . . . .
Mueller #500-12-0297 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.45 $102.89 No Bid No Bid $62.32 No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS
3 n _ H
Dresser 72" Style 90 Self-Locking 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.75 No Bid No Bid $18.23 No Bid No Bid
Compression End Cap
TAP TEES
¥4" Tap Tee-#H-18102 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.42 No Bid No Bid $22.10 No Bid No Bid
2" Tap Tee-#H-17650 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.64 No Bid No Bid $113.35 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: SEPTEMBER 6, 2018 TIME: 2:00 P.M.

DESCRIPTION EXPERITEC TT\/'I'ESTTQFI E SOL;TF',ERN MT DEASON | | CORE & MAIN | | G&cC SuppLY EDSXSE;\'G EC%L,J\I'TPQASII_\'ST NS e 0 || KEROTEST MA'T,LEC'CO"
VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP
(Labeled GAS)
Valve Box Frame & Top 25 No Bid No Bid $124.74 No Bid $126.04 $133.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid No Bid
WELD FLANGE
¥4" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89 No Bid No Bid $14.10 No Bid No Bid
1" Cap, weld 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89 No Bid No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid
1" 90°, weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.83 No Bid No Bid $12.10 No Bid No Bid
2" Cap, weld 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.12 No Bid No Bid $10.95 No Bid No Bid
2" 90°, weld 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.59 No Bid No Bid $11.52 No Bid No Bid
2" 45°, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.48 No Bid No Bid $11.40 No Bid No Bid
2" Tee, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.47 No Bid No Bid $25.25 No Bid No Bid
3" Cap, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.23 No Bid No Bid $11.90 No Bid No Bid
4" Cap, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.05 No Bid No Bid $16.10 No Bid No Bid
6" 90°, weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.23 No Bid No Bid $59.00 No Bid No Bid
8" Cap, weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.90 No Bid No Bid $42.10 No Bid No Bid
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