CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 2, 2015 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
DESCRIPTION GE#EE_@' WVCIO_BEDR HAYES PIPE| | EXPERITEC S'-IFE'IFE STHRN PIPE||MT DEASON| | HD SUPPLY SUGF(’?LPCI:_Y ED YOUNG (Ejg_L#:_ Cg:;SEL' DIXIE PKG. | |KERO -TEST MA'T,'\E:.CO" PPG \/SVTLIEI_ITXVI\:I’\SI
EXCESS FLOW VALVES
Excess Flow Valves  Series 700 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.70 No Bid $54.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.60 $54.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Excess Flow Valves Series 1800 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.70 No Bid $54.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.60 $54.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS DIAPHRAGM METERS
R-275 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
R-415 w/45 LT. Conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $213.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AC-630 w/45 LT. conn. 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $783.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AL-800 w/45 LT. conn. 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $902.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER VALVES- Contract
3/4" Meter Valve 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.46 No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER VALVES
3/4" Meter Valve 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.46 No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
STEEL GAS PIPE- Contract
¥4" Steel Gas Pipe 60,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Steel Gas Pipe 2,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Steel Gas Pipe 20,000 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Powercrete Steel Gas Pipe 400 ft. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TAP TEES
¥" Tap Tee-#H-18102 700 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.36 No Bid No Bid $19.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Tap Tee-#H-17650 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.75 No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REGULATORS
Fisher HSR - 94" x 1" conn. 3/16" orifice, | No Bid No Bid No Bid $146.88 $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.5" - 8.5" wc spring
Fisher 627'%2{“;;3%”:[;“143" orifice, 15- | gog No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.74 $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP
(Labeled GAS)
Valve Box Frame & Top 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $113.26 No Bid $118.09 $112.00 No Bid No Bid $122.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES -Contract
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $168.50 No Bid $142.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 2, 2015 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
GENERAL || WALTER TRI G&C EQUIP. CONSL. MARIE CO., SHERWIN
DESCRIPTION inphe Woon | |[HAYES PIPE|| EXPERITEC || (X ||STHRN PIPE(|MT DEASON| [HD SUPPLY || (=0~ || EDYOUNG || S oPE DIXIE PKG. ||KERO -TEST e PPG Ll ams
4" Valve - Weld x Weld 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $275.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $303.15 No Bid $275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD VALVES
3/4" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.50 No Bid $129.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $204.81 No Bid $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Valve - Weld x Weld 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.72 No Bid $130.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.50 No Bid $114.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Valve - Weld x Weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid $141.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $168.50 No Bid $152.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ROTARY GAS METERS
2" Rotary Gas Meter (2M) 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,232.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,462.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Counter-drive version
2" Rotary Gas Meter (3M) 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,376.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,535.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Counter-drive version
Rotary Gas Meter (5M) 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,772.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,827.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Counter-drive version
ROTARY GAS METER SETS
2M/3M Meter Set 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,792.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,692.95 No Bid $1,825.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5M Meter Set 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,857.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,895.95 No Bid $1,895.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLANGED VALVES
2" Valve - Fig. 143 (175 CWP) 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $171.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS
— .
Dresser %" Style 90 Self Locking 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compression End Cap
MARKING PAINT
Marking Paint - Safety Yellow 15 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 $4.19
Marking Paint- Safety Blue 10 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 $4.19
Marking Paint -Safety Green 5 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 $4.19
Marking Paint - White 25 cases No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid $2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 $4.19
WELD FLANGE
3/4" Cap, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 90°, weld 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Cap, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 2, 2015 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
DESCRIPTION GE#EF[_’?L WVCIO_ZEDR HAYES PIPE| | EXPERITEC S'ITE'IFE STHRN PIPE||MT DEASON| | HD SUPPLY SUGF(’?LPCLY ED YOUNG Eﬁ_l#:_ CgINPISEL' DIXIE PKG. | |KERO -TEST MA'T,'\lEC.CO" PPG \?VTLIEI_ITXVALII\SI
2" Cap, weld 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 90°, weld 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 45°, weld 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 3/4" Reducer, weld 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Nipple, Weld x Thread 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" 90°, weld 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BLACK IRON FITTINGS
¥" x CL Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.68 No Bid $0.79 $0.77 No Bid No Bid $0.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 3" Nipple 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.82 No Bid $0.95 $0.92 No Bid No Bid $0.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 4" Nipple 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.02 No Bid $1.19 $1.13 No Bid No Bid $1.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 6" Nipple 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.44 No Bid $1.68 $1.62 No Bid No Bid $1.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.12 No Bid $1.18 $1.15 No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥" Plug 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.86 No Bid $0.56 $0.89 No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Cap 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.27 No Bid $1.34 $1.29 No Bid No Bid $1.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x CL Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid $1.14 $1.11 No Bid No Bid $1.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 2" Nipple 1,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.07 No Bid $1.25 $1.20 No Bid No Bid $1.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 3" Nipple 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.13 No Bid $1.31 $1.27 No Bid No Bid $1.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 4" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.42 No Bid $1.65 $1.59 No Bid No Bid $1.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 5" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.66 No Bid $1.93 $1.84 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x 6" Nipple 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.97 No Bid $2.29 $2.19 No Bid No Bid $2.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Tee 750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.04 No Bid $3.22 $3.06 No Bid No Bid $3.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Plug 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.86 No Bid $0.92 $0.88 No Bid No Bid $0.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 90° 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.93 No Bid $2.05 $1.97 No Bid No Bid $2.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Street 90° 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid $2.86 $2.75 No Bid No Bid $3.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" x %" 90° 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.33 No Bid $2.47 $2.38 No Bid No Bid $2.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" x 1" 90° 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.53 No Bid $5.84 $5.61 No Bid No Bid $6.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" Tee 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.13 No Bid $6.48 $6.21 No Bid No Bid $6.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 2, 2015 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
GENERAL || WALTER TRI G&C EQUIP. CONSL. MARIE CO., SHERWIN
DESCRIPTION LIy Woop | |HAYES PIPE|| EXPERITEC || = ©_ ||STHRN PIPE||MT DEASON| [HD SUPPLY || ("0 || EDYOUNG || 2 oIPE DIXIE PKG. | |[KERO -TEST Ne. PPG WILLIAMS
2"x 4" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.90 No Bid $3.38 $3.23 No Bid No Bid $3.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" x 6" Nipple 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.93 No Bid $4.56 $4.37 No Bid No Bid $4.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Cap 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.05 No Bid $4.28 $4.25 No Bid No Bid $4.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Leak Detector - Gallon 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.76 $13.25 No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oatey 30212 Blue
Pipe Dope - Rectorseal #5 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.29 $12.50 No Bid No Bid $15.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Slow Dry - Pints
TAPECOAT
TAPECOAT 36 rls. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Roskote R28 10 Gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BARREL LOCKS
Barrel Locks 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.53 No Bid $1.40 $1.70 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Barrel Lock Key - Blue 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.00 No Bid $36.74 $49.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR CLAMPS
3/4* X 3" Full Circle Clamp 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.31 $22.50 No Bid $24.13 $27.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mueller #231-03-0105
1" X 3" Full Circle Clamp . . . . . . . . . . . . .
No B No B No B No B No B No B . . . .
Mueller #231-03-0131 5 o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid o Bid No Bid $29.79 $23.50 No Bid $25.53 $29.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAST IRON METER BAR
Cast Iron Meter Bar 800 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.87 $22.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/swivels #6620-F - F-1x1 OEM ' ’
Extra 1" Insulating Coupling 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.94 No Bid $6.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extra 14" Swivel Nut 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.24 No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REGULATOR REPAIR PARTS
Fisher 161EBH Pilot 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $489.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 6358EB Pilot Kit 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $236.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 161EBH Pilot Kit 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $282.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 2" EZR Regulator 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $176.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repair Kit 4" EZR Regulator 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repsgg}jltaforEZR Relief 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher Repsgg}jltaforEZR Relief 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $277.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ULTRASONIC GAS METERS




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

GAS MATERIALS BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: JULY 2, 2015 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
DESCRIPTION GE#EE_?(L WVCIO_BEDR HAYES PIPE| | EXPERITEC S'-IFE'IFE STHRN PIPE||MT DEASON| | HD SUPPLY SUGF(’?LPCLY ED YOUNG (E:ﬁ_l#;’_ CgINPISEL' DIXIE PKG. | |KERO -TEST MAT,'\E:.CO" PPG VSV|I_|LELRIXVI\1|’\SI
Sonix 2000/3000 Meter & Accessories No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,604.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" SICK 23M Meter & Accessories No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,477.95 No Bid No Bid
6" SICK 35M Meter & Accessories No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,437.25 No Bid No Bid

LOW BIDDER

DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS

TIE BID AT $54.25 - AWARDED TO MT DEASON AT $54.20
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