
COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate $1.91

American Development Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
821 William D. Jones Blvd. PAC 20 BF No Bid
Fayetteville, TN  37334-2760 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.84
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Brenntag Mid-South Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.295
1405 Highway 136 West PAC 20 BF No Bid
Henderson, KY  42420 Bleach, 12.5% $1.295

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.164
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Cabot Norit Americas Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3200 University Avenue PAC 20 BF $0.750
Marshall, TX 75670 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Chemtrade Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
90 East Halsey Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Parsippany, NJ  07054 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
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JULY 11, 2019 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.
Did Not Submit Product Sample For Plant Testing.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

C.I. Thornburg Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3333 Hydes Ferry Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Nashville, TN  37218 Bleach, 12.5% $1.90

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.6959
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

CORECHEM Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
4320 Greenway Drive PAC 20 BF No Bid
Knoxville, TN  37918 Bleach, 12.5% $1.51

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.1194
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.17

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Gulbrandsen Technologies Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.214
2 Main Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Clinton, NJ  08809 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
4321 West 6th Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Lawerence, KS 66049 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

JULY 11, 2019 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.
Did Not Submit Product Sample For Plant Testing.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Marubeni Speciality Chemicals Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
10 Bank Street, Suite 740 PAC 20 BF No Bid
White Plains, NY  10606 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.43
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Shannon Chemical Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 376 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Malvern, PA  19355 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

SNF Polydyne Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
1 Chemical Plant Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Riceboro, GA  31323 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.22
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Univar Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
200 Dean Sievers Place PAC 20 BF No Bid
Morrisville, PA  19067 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

JULY 11, 2019 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.
Did Not Submit Product Sample For Plant Testing.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

USALCO Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.225
2601 Cannery Avenue PAC 20 BF No Bid
Baltimore, MD  21226 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Minteck Resources Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3725 Pentagon Blvd. PAC 20 BF No Bid
Suite 100 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Beavercreek, OH 45431 High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid

Lime Kiln Dust $59.75
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

The Dycho Company Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
412 Meridian Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Niota, TN  37826 Bleach, 12.5% $1.75

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.89
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.05

Sodium Silicofluoride
Sodium Phosphate

Poly Aluminum Chloride
PAC 20 BF

Bleach, 12.5%
High Grade Evaporated Salt

Lime Kiln Dust
Clarifloc Polymer

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide
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Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.
Did Not Submit Product Sample For Plant Testing.
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