
COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate $1.61

American Development Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
821 William D. Jones Blvd. PAC 20 BF No Bid
Fayetteville, TN  37334-2760 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.54
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Brenntag Mid-South Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.295
1405 Highway 136 West PAC 20 BF $0.649
Henderson, KY  42420 Bleach, 12.5% $1.265

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.147
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Chemtrade Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.255
90 East Halsey Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Parsippany, NJ  07054 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Cheney Lime & Cement Company, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 160 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Allgood, AL  35013 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Failed Laboratory or Plant Trial Testing.
Did Not Submit Product Sample For Plant Testing.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Evoqua Water Technologies, LLC Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2650 Tallevast Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Sarasota, FL 34243-3912 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.17

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Mintek Resources, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2440 Dayton Xenia Road, Suite D PAC 20 BF No Bid
Beavercreek, OH  45434 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $57.24
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Norit Americas, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3200 University Avenue, Trailer A PAC 20 BF $0.75
Marshall, TX  75670 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate $1.49

Shannon Chemical Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 376 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Malvern, PA  19355 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

SNF Polydyne, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
One Chemical Plant Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Riceboro, GA 31323 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $0.730
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Solenis, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3 Beaver Valley Road, Suite 500 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Wilmington, DE  19803 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $0.85
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.539
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

CORECHEM Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
4320 Greenway Drive PAC 20 BF No Bid
Knoxville, TN  37918 Bleach, 12.5% $1.42

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.1145
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Hawkins, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2381 Rosegate PAC 20 BF No Bid
Roseville, MN  55113 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.2740
4321 West 6th Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Lawerence, KS 66049 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

C.I. Thornburg Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3333 Hydes Ferry Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Nashville, TN  37218 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Oxbow Activated Carbon Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2535 Jason Court PAC 20 BF $0.73
Oceanside, CA  92056 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

GEO Speciality Chemicals Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
9213 Arch Street Pike PAC 20 BF No Bid
Little Rock, AR  72206 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Did Not Submit Product Sample For Testing.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Thatcher Chemicals of Florida Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 489 PAC 20 BF $0.729
Deland, FL  32721 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Chemrite, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
5202 Belle Wood Court, Suite 104 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Buford, GA  30518 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $49.80

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Lhoist North America of Alabama Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3309 Highway 31 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Calera, AL  35040 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $80.00

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Aulick Chemical Solutions Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
111 Patton Court PAC 20 BF No Bid
Nicholasville, KY  40356 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.07

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Did Not Meet Bid Specifications.
Product Did Not Complete Plant Trial.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Univar Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
200 Dean Sievers Place PAC 20 BF No Bid
Morrisville, PA  19067 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.1438
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Standard Purification Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
551 North Highway 41 PAC 20 BF $0.677
Dunnellon, FL  34432 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Gulbrandson Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.155
2 Main Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Clinton, NJ  08809 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride
Sodium Phosphate

Poly Aluminum Chloride
PAC 20 BF

Bleach, 12.5%
High Grade Evaporated Salt

Lime Kiln Dust
Clarifloc Polymer

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 24, 2017 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

Product Failed Laboratory or Plant Trial Testing.
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