
COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate $1.61

American Development Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
821 William D. Jones Blvd. PAC 20 BF No Bid
Fayetteville, TN  37334-2760 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.52
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Brenntag Mid-South Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.295
1405 Highway 136 West PAC 20 BF No Bid
Henderson, KY  42420 Bleach, 12.5% $1.15

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Chemtrade Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.189
90 East Halsey Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Parsippany, NJ  07054 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Cheney Lime & Cement Company, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 160 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Allgood, AL  35013 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $50.00
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 9, 2016 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

** DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - PRODUCT WAS NOT PLANT EVALUATED



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Evoqua Water Technologies, LLC Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2650 Tallevast Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Sarasota, FL 34243-3912 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.09

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Mintek Resources, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
2440 Dayton Xenia Road, Suite D PAC 20 BF No Bid
Beavercreek, OH  45434 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $59.00

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Norit Americas, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3200 University Avenue, Trailer A PAC 20 BF $0.75
Marshall, TX  75670 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate $1.67

Shannon Chemical Corporation Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
P.O. Box 376 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Malvern, PA  19355 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 9, 2016 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

** DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

SNF Polydyne, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
One Chemical Plant Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Riceboro, GA 31323 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer C-6266 - $0.81 / CE-1736 - $0.86
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Solenis, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3 Beaver Valley Road, Suite 500 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Wilmington, DE  19803 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $0.92
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Greenway Products Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
4320 Greenway Drive PAC 20 BF No Bid
Knoxville, TN  37918 Bleach, 12.5% $1.65

High Grade Evaporated Salt $0.112
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Hawkins, Inc. Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.2045
2381 Rosegate PAC 20 BF No Bid
Roseville, MN  55113 Bleach, 12.5% $0.90

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.32

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 9, 2016 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

** DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - PRODUCT WAS NOT PLANT EVALUATED
** DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS - VENDOR DECLINED BID (BID PRICE WAS FOR FULL TANKER LOADS)



COMPANY ITEM BID
Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Kemira Water Solutions Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
4321 West 6th Street PAC 20 BF No Bid
Lawerence, KS 66049 Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide No Bid

Sodium Silicofluoride $0.66
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

C.I. Thornburg Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
3333 Hydes Ferry Road PAC 20 BF No Bid
Nashville, TN  37218 Bleach, 12.5% $1.40

High Grade Evaporated Salt No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.95
Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide $2.40

Sodium Silicofluoride
Sodium Phosphate

Poly Aluminum Chloride
PAC 20 BF

Bleach, 12.5%
High Grade Evaporated Salt

Lime Kiln Dust
Clarifloc Polymer

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide
Sodium Silicofluoride
Sodium Phosphate

Poly Aluminum Chloride
PAC 20 BF

Bleach, 12.5%
High Grade Evaporated Salt

Lime Kiln Dust
Clarifloc Polymer

Liquid Calcium Nitrate - Bioxide

GALLATIN PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MAY 9, 2016 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID

** DID NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS
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