CITY OF GALLATIN - DEPT. OF PUBLIC UTILITIES

BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS

JUNE 19, 2014 @ 2:00PM
* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
4321 West 6th Street Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Lawrence, KS 66049-3692 Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.217
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid
American Development Corporation Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
821 William D. Jones Blvd. Sodium Phosphate $1.61
Fayetteville, TN 37334-2760 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas $0.1975
Brenntag Mid-South Sodium Silicofluoride $0.50
1405 Highway 136 West Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Henderson, KY 42420 Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.3000
PAC 20 BF $0.8400
Bleach, 12.5% $1.32
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer $1.65
Chlorine Gas No Bid
Mintek Resources, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
2440 Dayton Xenia Road, Suite D Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Beavercreek, OH 45434 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust $58.96
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid

TENTATIVE LOW BID - PENDING PLANT TRIAL AND EVALUATION
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COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid
Delta Chemical Corporation Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
USALCO, LLC Sodium Phosphate No Bid
2601 Cannery Avenue Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
Baltimore, MD 21226 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid
Norit Americas, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3200 University Avenue, Trailer A Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Marshall, TX 75670 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF $0.86
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid
SNF Polydyne, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
P.O. Box 279 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
One Chemical Plant Road Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
Riceberg, GA 31323 PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.19

Chlorine Gas $0.34
C.l. Thornburg Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3333 Hyde Ferry Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Nashville, TN 37218 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid

Bleach, 12.5% $1.40
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - DEPT. OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS
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* AWARDED BID

COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid
Greenway Products Sodium Silicofluoride $0.512
4320 Greenway Drive Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Knoxville, TN 37918 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid

Bleach, 12.5% $1.06
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
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