
COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Bear Technical Sales Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
2133 Tarver Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Burleson, TX  76028 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Bio Conversion Technology Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
163 Northcutt Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Ellijay, GA  30540 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.22
Chlorine Gas $0.1895

Brenntag Mid-South Sodium Silicofluoride $0.48
1405 Highway 136 West Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Henderson, KY  42420 Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.2950

PAC 20 BF $1.67
Bleach, 12.5% $1.37
Lime Kiln Dust $190.50

Clarifloc Polymer $1.59
Chlorine Gas $0.199

C.I. Thornburg Company Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3333 Hydes Ferry Road Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Nashville, TN  37218 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% $1.45
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
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COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Delta Chemical Corporation Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
USALCO, LLC Sodium Phosphate No Bid
2601 Cannery Avenue Poly Aluminum Chloride $0.290
Baltimore, MD  21226 PAC 20 BF No Bid

Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas $0.2142

DPC Enterprises Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
Sodium Phosphate No Bid

Chattanooga, TN  37406 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
PAC 20 BF No Bid

Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Dycho Company, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride $0.565
412 Meridian Street, Suite 412 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Niota, TN  37826 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF $1.42
Bleach, 12.5% $1.18
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Mintek Resources, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
2440 Dayton Xenia Road, Suite D Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Beavercreek, OH  45434 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid

Lime Kiln Dust $57.25
Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
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VENDOR'S BID CONTAINED A MINIMUM ORDER QUANTITY THAT IS THE MAXIMUM CAPACITY OF THE OUR STRORAGE.



COMPANY ITEM BID
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Norit Americas, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
3200 University Avenue, Trailer A Sodium Phosphate No Bid
Marshall, TX  75670 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF $0.79
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid

Pristine Water Solutions Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
1570 South Lakeside Drive Sodium Phosphate $1.61
Waukegan, IL  60085 Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid

PAC 20 BF No Bid
Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer No Bid
Chlorine Gas No Bid

SNF Polydyne, Inc. Sodium Silicofluoride No Bid
P.O. Box 279 Sodium Phosphate No Bid
One Chemical Plant Road Poly Aluminum Chloride No Bid
Riceberg, GA 31323 PAC 20 BF No Bid

Bleach, 12.5% No Bid
Lime Kiln Dust No Bid

Clarifloc Polymer $1.25
Chlorine Gas

Sodium Silicofluoride
Sodium Phosphate

Poly Aluminum Chloride
PAC 20 BF

Bleach, 12.5%
Lime Kiln Dust

Clarifloc Polymer

CITY OF GALLATIN - DEPT. OF PUBLIC UTILITIES
BID OPENING - CHEMICALS - WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANTS

SEPTEMBER 19, 2012 @ 2:00PM
 * AWARDED BID


	Bid Tab - Chemicals 2013
	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3


