CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- | [CONSOLT D Southern VT HAYES | [EQUIP_ | [ED_ TR T GEO. E WALTER DIXE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE DATED G&cC VOLUNT. | | suppLY | |Pipe DEASON VvRC | |BADGER| |PIPE coNTRO | [Young | |sTATE | |[THNBRG | |cos BOOTH | |[JorDAN | [woop | |acp PKG
BRASS WATER VALVES & FITTINGS
75 No Bid 10.05 9.36 9.29 10.40 9.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.50 No Bid No Bid
¥" Pack Joint Coupling #C44-33Q $ $ $ $ ¢ $ $ $
v X 1;;305032"1”;23“'0“”9 10 No Bid $11.10 $10.87 $10.79 $11.65 $10.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.22 No Bid No Bid
1}2?;';32;%“’"”9 30 No Bid $10.95 $10.71 $10.62 $11.30 $10.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid
Fsc/)“r';j'\;ectggczgug"”g 200 No Bid $6.70 $5.00 $4.95 $6.70 $4.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.60 No Bid No Bid
Fsc/)“r';j'\;ectggczgug"”g 250 No Bid $12.70 $6.06 $6.00 $12.68 $5.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.80 No Bid No Bid
. j;;j“;ectg;izug"”g 20 No Bid $18.05 $7.48 $7.41 $18.10 $7.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.40 No Bid No Bid
KK Pac';gf&”;glez*ngAdapte’ 5 No Bid $8.85 $8.08 $8.01 $9.10 $7.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid
KK Pa;'gfdogég"fgzgdapter 125 No Bid $8.25 $7.69 $7.62 $8.50 $7.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.65 No Bid No Bid
r P""CF"Ofg';tC';":"i 4’30""‘“6' 30 No Bid $9.75 $9.11 $9.03 $10.00 $8.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.25 No Bid No Bid
2" Pac'; gr(g”; C'\’E'f“:e;dapte’ 100 No Bid $41.70 $33.22 $32.95 $44.00 $32.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.31 No Bid No Bid
¥4" Pack Joint Meter Valve 250 No Bid $25.05 $23.09 $22.91 $25.03 $22.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.94 No Bid No Bid
Ford #B43-232W-Q
1" Pack Joint Meter Valve 10 No Bid $46.05 $42.51 $42.16 $46.06 $41.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.75 No Bid No Bid
Ford #B43-344W-Q
1’2;532;1“1""2‘1'&( P 5 No Bid $21.20 $17.30 $17.15 No Bid $17.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.45 No Bid No Bid
i CF“CEE’ ds?;g'zl‘ 'zzg\ffmp 100 No Bid $22.15 $20.47 $20.29 $22.16 $20.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid
#4" Curb Stop - Comp x Comp 20 No Bid $54.05 $22.08 $21.90 $23.93 $21.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.80 No Bid No Bid
Ford #B44-233W-G
1"FCO‘:;b#‘°é‘ff ;’E\;‘V'P 5 No Bid $33.05 $42.09 $41.74 $33.04 $41.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.25 No Bid No Bid
r CE;‘: f;‘é%';’;\?v"mp 10 No Bid $38.95 $46.86 $46.48 $39.00 $46.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.42 No Bid No Bid
%X z‘;r’éﬁ;‘fﬁ‘;gggt Tee 75 No Bid $23.10 $22.65 $22.47 $23.10 $22.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.45 No Bid No Bid
%X Z“Or’é ;5 "ﬂ‘ 23%’5 Wye 25 No Bid $19.75 $19.37 $19.21 $19.75 $19.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.75 No Bid No Bid
For;/“;fr’(')‘f's 2 25 No Bid $18.95 $11.80 $11.46 No Bid $11.62 ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.25 No Bid No Bid
. 10 No Bid $9.95 $9.09 $8.33 $10.70 $8.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.20 No Bid No Bid
144" x 4" Brass Nipple
. 5 No Bid $9.85 $8.93 $8.16 $10.50 $7.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.45 No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" Brass Nipple
2'x 6" Brass Nipple 150 No Bid $17.85 $17.26 $15.84 $20.00 $15.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.83 No Bid No Bid
. 10 No Bid $35.00 $34.23 $31.13 $40.00 $30.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.10 No Bid No Bid
2" x 12" Brass Nipple
. . 25 No Bid $1.65 $1.60 $1.36 $1.80 $1.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.78 No Bid No Bid
¥2" x 2" Brass Bushing
. 25 No Bid $2.25 $2.43 $2.02 $2.75 $2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid No Bid
¥4" x 1" Brass Bushing
. 5 No Bid $5.95 $4.15 $3.45 $4.65 $3.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.60 No Bid No Bid
1¥4" x 1" Brass Bushing




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- | [CONSOLI D Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED TRI [oiR GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. | | suppLY | |Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | |YOouNG | |sTATE THNBRG CGS BOOT JORDAN | |wooD GCP PKG
4" Brass 90° 10 No Bid $2.85 $3.01 $2.49 $3.40 $2.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.34 No Bid No Bid
4
o Brass 45° 15 No Bid $19.00 $16.53 $18.74 $18.50 $14.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.30 No Bid No Bid
o Brass 90° 50 No Bid $15.00 $15.02 $12.44 $16.85 $13.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.25 No Bid No Bid
o Brass Tee 5 No Bid $19.75 $20.80 $17.23 $23.35 $18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid
. 15 No Bid $2.50 $2.43 $2.00 $2.75 $2.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid No Bid
¥4" Brass Coupling
. 5 No Bid $3.95 $3.70 $3.04 $4.10 $3.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.10 No Bid No Bid
1" Brass Coupling
2" Brass Coupling 15 No Bid $13.15 $12.94 $10.66 $14.50 $11.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.32 No Bid No Bid
v XFz'rg":\tZrzRf\i/e“er 350 No Bid $48.40 $46.01 $45.63 $48.35 $45.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.60 No Bid No Bid
KK Xth; ';f\‘jfzr T;\fve“er 10 No Bid $52.40 $48.23 $47.83 $52.35 $47.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.17 No Bid No Bid
1" Copper Setter 15 No Bid $94.05 No Bid $101.49 $194.00 $86.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald #18-410WX
McDoni; dcﬁ?gg—e?rlis\lnl(\elrFF—W 0 25 No Bid $396.30 No Bid $418.67 $396.25 $465.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $447.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $426.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
%Fggiﬁgtl'gg OSéOp 50 No Bid $26.00 $24.81 $24.59 $25.97 $24.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.86 No Bid No Bid
1”@?&";’;“&%33"’ 40 No Bid $34.20 $32.62 $32.35 $34.20 $32.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.64 No Bid No Bid
2" Pac“é%”;g‘;‘;e;;(’“p“”g 40 No Bid $82.40 $62.63 $62.12 $82.38 $61.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.34 No Bid No Bid
REPAIR CLAMPS
6" x 12" Full Circle Clamp -PVC 5 No Bid $57.90 $90.00 No Bid $59.80 $64.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $105.92 | | No Bid No Bid
S-B #226-066312-000
8"x 12" Full Circle Clamp -PVC 15 No Bid $68.30 $105.00 No Bid $70.50 $77.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $125.00 | | No Bid No Bid
S-B #226-086312-000
12" x 12" Full Circle Clamp -PVC 5 NoBid | $103.15 | $147.00 No Bid $106.00 $114.34 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $126.00 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $135.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $175.16 | | No Bid No Bid
S-B #226-127512-000
6" g?éi;“é'_gg;i‘)%g%g‘c' 25 No Bid $36.75 $56.16 No Bid $37.50 $40.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.20 No Bid No Bid
6" x 12" Full Circle Clamp-Cl . . . ) . . . . . . . . .
S-B #226-069012-000 5 No Bid $58.75 $90.00 No Bid $60.60 $65.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $107.50 No Bid No Bid
1%" x 3" Patch Clamp . . . . . . . . . . . .
S-B #245-016603-000 5 No Bid $4.60 $5.28 $5.26 $4.80 $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.20 No Bid No Bid
2" x 3" Patch Clamp . . . . . . . . . . . .
S-B #245-023803-000 10 No Bid $5.40 $6.20 $5.26 $5.65 $5.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.30 No Bid No Bid
Siigggf‘o‘gg 8%?880 10 No Bid $9.70 $11.22 $10.53 $10.23 $10.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.20 No Bid No Bid
¥4" Galv. Comp. Coupling : ) ) . . . . . . . . . .
15 No Bid 13.80 9.96 6.32 11.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.00 No Bid No Bid
S-B #522-010500-003 $ $ & $ $ $ $
2" Galv. Comp. Coupling 25 No Bid $28.40 $20.53 $17.89 $24.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid
S-B #522-23800-003
PVC and DUCTILE WATER/SEWER PIPE
100 ft. No Bid $1.65 $1.76 $1.74 $1.63 $1.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.55 No Bid No Bid

4" PVC Water Pipe




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- CONSOLI HD Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED_ TRI Cl GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. SUPPLY Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | |[YOUNG STATE THNBRG CGS BOOT JORDAN WOOD GCP PKG
. 600 ft. No Bid $2.55 $3.75 $3.70 $3.46 $3.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.30 No Bid No Bid
6" PVC Water Pipe
. 200 ft. No Bid $5.95 $6.35 $6.72 $5.87 $5.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.60 No Bid No Bid
8" PVC Water Pipe
. 100 ft. No Bid $13.15 $13.90 $13.72 $12.87 $12.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.40 No Bid No Bid
12" PVC Water Pipe
. . 60 ft. No Bid $15.50 No Bid $16.33 $16.33 $14.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid
6" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, CL 52
. . 60 ft. No Bid $34.00 No Bid $32.11 $32.10 $27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.07 No Bid No Bid
10" Ductile Iron Water Pipe, CL 52
. 26 ft. No Bid $5.75 $6.08 $6.00 $5.61 $5.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.36 No Bid No Bid
10" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe
. 26 ft. No Bid $8.25 $8.73 $8.61 $8.05 $7.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.70 No Bid No Bid
12" SCH 35 PVC Sewer Pipe
VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME (Labeled
Water)
100 No Bid $86.00 $92.00 $101.05 $100.00 $87.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Valve Box Frame & Top
25 No Bid $95.00 $30.00 No Bid $30.00 $26.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Valve Box Top #JB-8006
. 100 No Bid $89.00 $97.00 No Bid No Bid $74.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $131.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Cl Riser Square Valve Box #A8455200
. 25 No Bid $17.60 $7.31 $7.37 $19.70 $9.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" ClI Riser for 5%" Valve Box
. 50 No Bid $21.30 $8.33 $8.68 $17.20 $11.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CI Riser for 5%4" Valve Box
. 50 No Bid $24.10 $9.41 $9.21 $26.90 $14.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Cl Riser for 5%." Valve Box
. 5 No Bid $37.05 $13.55 $16.63 $41.50 $21.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Cl Riser for 5%4" Valve Box
. 10 No Bid $49.10 $16.13 $23.63 $52.00 $25.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Cl Riser for 5%." Valve Box
VALVES/FITTINGS
iﬂu“gﬁ’;r"#::]‘;;’g‘(')"g 30 NoBid | | $179.00 No Bid $186.80 | $178.70 $188.77 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $195.00 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | | $200.00 | | No Bid No Bid
6" MJ In-line Valve 5 NoBid | | $395.00 No Bid $377.20 | $377.25 $381.12 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $384.50 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | | $406.00 | | No Bid No Bid
Mueller #A-2360-20
8" MJ In-ling Valve 5 NoBid | | $629.00 No Bid $600.25 | $600.83 $606.63 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $612.50 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $646.30 | | No Bid No Bid
Mueller #A-2360-20
. 15 No Bid $36.00 $28.44 $19.87 $31.75 $58.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.25 No Bid No Bid
6" Megalug Retainer for PVC
. 15 No Bid $31.00 $19.75 $15.72 $27.50 $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.61 No Bid No Bid
6" Megalug Retainer for DI
. 5 No Bid $1,095.00 $822.50 $763.62 $943.00 $685.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $815.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $843.15 No Bid No Bid
36" Megalug Retainer for DI
10 No Bid $105.50 $87.75 $97.89 $79.95 $100.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.00 No Bid No Bid
6" MJ Foster Adapter Epoxy Coated
5 No Bid $144.00 $126.00 $133.97 $145.00 $138.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.00 No Bid No Bid
8" MJ Foster Adapter Epoxy Coated
. 75 No Bid $14.95 $15.84 $15.16 $16.95 $14.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.36 No Bid No Bid
6" MJ Accessory Kit
. 25 No Bid $17.20 $17.95 $17.18 $19.20 $16.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.55 No Bid No Bid
8" MJ Accessory Kit
. 5 No Bid $305.00 $300.00 No Bid $324.00 $281.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid $306.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $313.09 No Bid No Bid
36" MJ Accessory Kit




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- CONSOLI HD Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED_ TRI Cl GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. SUPPLY Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | |YOUNG STATE THNBRG CGS BOOT! JORDAN WOOD GCP PKG
. 25 No Bid $5.00 $2.60 $3.54 $3.95 $3.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.10 No Bid No Bid
6" Transition Gasket
25 No Bid No Bid $72.95 $32.82 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Brass Gate Valve Hammond 645
COLD WATER METERS
. 300 No Bid $43.00 No Bid No Bid $43.20 $34.69 No Bid No Bid $29.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5/8" x 3/4" Displacement
. 10 No Bid $122.00 No Bid No Bid $89.00 $117.34 No Bid No Bid $89.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Displacement
2" Displacement 20 No Bid $315.00 No Bid No Bid $336.00 $270.40 No Bid No Bid $334.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $390.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PLASTIC METER BOX
. . 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $266.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid $258.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Plastic Meter Box & Lid
COPPER TYPE K
%" Copper 3,000 ft. No Bid $3.80 $3.40 $3.64 $3.74 $3.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 No Bid No Bid
4
1" Copper 1,200 ft. No Bid $4.95 $5.20 $4.73 $4.84 $4.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.14 No Bid No Bid
2" Copper 320 ft. No Bid $13.75 $14.49 $12.70 $13.05 $13.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.80 No Bid No Bid
PVC WATER & SEWER FITTINGS
15 No Bid $4.50 $3.23 $3.26 $3.68 $2.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid
4" PVC x 4" PVC Fernco
10 No Bid $4.50 $3.23 $3.26 $3.68 $2.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid
4" CL x 4" PVC Fernco
5 No Bid $11.00 $8.13 $8.20 $9.26 $6.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid
6" CL x 4" PVC Fernco
5 No Bid $9.50 $6.93 $6.98 $7.88 $6.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.60 No Bid No Bid
6" CL x 6" PVC Fernco
6" Romac Saddle 15 No Bid $89.00 $90.23 $86.35 $72.39 $84.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid $91.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $88.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.50 No Bid No Bid
4" SCH 40 PVC Cap, SW 10 No Bid $4.70 $4.26 $3.51 $5.59 $4.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.45 No Bid No Bid
. 15 No Bid $3.50 $3.12 $2.58 $4.10 $3.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid No Bid
4" SCH 40 PVC Coupling
. 5 No Bid $10.95 $9.89 $8.14 $12.98 $10.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.67 No Bid No Bid
6" SCH 40 PVC Coupling
6" x 4" SCH 40 PVC Bushing 5 No Bid $11.50 $10.24 $8.42 $13.44 $11.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.12 No Bid No Bid
6" SCH 40 PVC Cap, SW 10 No Bid $11.50 $10.20 $8.40 $13.39 $11.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 No Bid No Bid
6" Cleanout SCH 35 PVC, SW 5 No Bid $27.00 $10.36 $11.78 ‘ $16.00 $9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.10 No Bid No Bid
& Scs'szefxglﬁiapte“ 50 No Bid $2.40 $1.90 $1.58 $2.20 $1.79 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.35 No Bid No Bid
2 choigef\;ilﬁiapte“ 15 No Bid $12.10 $9.74 $8.07 ‘ $11.10 $9.15 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid $8.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid
2" SCH 80 PVC Coupling 15 No Bid $4.25 $3.36 $2.79 $3.75 $3.16 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid $3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.15 No Bid No Bid

Socket x Socket




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- | [CONSOLT HD | [Southern MT HAYES | [EQUIP_ [ [ED. TR T GEO. = WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE DATED ce&c | |voLunt.| | suppLy | [Pipe peason | | VRc | |BADGER| [piPE conTRO| |Young | [sTaTE | |THNBRG | |cos BOOT! JORDAN | |woob | |acp PKG
TAPPING SLEEVES AND SERVICE
SADDLES
2" x %" Service Saddle - PVC 10 No Bid $37.30 $35.44 $38.78 $37.30 $33.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.44 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-250-CC3 B
6" x %4 Service Saddle - PVC 15 No Bid $41.20 $45.18 $45.92 $41.17 $43.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.56 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-669-CC3
6" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC 10 No Bid $41.20 $45.18 $45.92 $41.17 $43.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.56 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-669-CC4
6" x 2" Service Saddle - PVC 15 No Bid $49.35 $48.24 $54.08 $49.35 $46.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-669-IP7
8" x 2" Service Saddle - PVC 5 No Bid $57.45 $58.09 $61.22 $57.44 $55.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.29 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-871-IP7
10" x %" Service Saddle -PVC 2 No Bid $57.85 $65.05 $64.29 $57.80 $62.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.23 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-1075-CC3
12" x 1" Service Saddle - PVC 2 No Bid $67.30 $74.32 $74.49 $67.00 $71.13 No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.23 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-1275-CC4
6" x %" Service Saddle - Cl 10 No Bid $41.20 $45.55 $45.92 $41.17 $43.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.00 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-760-CC3
6" x 1" Service Saddle - CI . . . . . . . . . . . .
Ford #FC202-760-0CA 5 No Bid $41.20 $45.55 $45.92 $41.17 1 $43.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.00 No Bid No Bid
6" x 2" Service Saddle - Cl 10 No Bid $49.35 $49.00 $54.08 $49.34 $46.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.90 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-760-IP7
8" x 2" Service Saddle - Cl 5 No Bid $57.45 $58.71 $63.27 $57.44 $56.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.00 No Bid No Bid
Ford #FC202-979-IP7
5 No Bid $79.00 $68.11 $34.86 $36.80 $34.14 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $34.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.80 No Bid No Bid
6" x 7%" Cl MJ Sleeve
10 No Bid $98.00 $79.20 $45.53 $49.07 $45.52 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $57.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid
6" x 12" Cl MJ Sleeve
5 NoBid | | $141.00 | | $115.50 $74.46 $80.50 $74.50 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $84.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.53 No Bid No Bid
8" x 12" Cl MJ Sleeve
56" x 24" C1 M3 Sleeve 2 NoBid | | $2,050.00 | | $1,997.80 | | $1,326.19| | $1,420.00| $1,326.18 | No Bid No Bid NoBid | |$1,712.95 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | |$1,430.00| | No Bid No Bid
6 Macro Coupling 15 No Bid No Bid $199.00 | | $195.61 | | $215.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $217.85 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $177.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Macro Coupling 10 No Bid No Bid $22365 | | $221.51 | | $246.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $246.75 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
. 2 No Bid No Bid $340.00 | | $337.22 | | $375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $375.55 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $303.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Macro Coupling
HYMAX COUPLINGS
_ 15 NoBid | | $185.00 | | $169.00 | | $247.96 | | $187.00 $168.25 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $213.00 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $174.50 | | No Bid No Bid
6" Hymax Coupling
_ 15 NoBid | | $209.00 | | $191.00 | | $280.80 | | $212.00 $190.54 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $241.25 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $197.60 | | No Bid No Bid
8" Hymax Coupling
FLUSHING HYDRANTS
Flushing Hydrant 25 NoBid | | $335.00 | $306.90 | $307.31 | | $317.80 $342.30 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $316.10 | | No Bid No Bid No Bid $315.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $339.50 | | No Bid No Bid
WATER METER BOX & LID
_ 200 No Bid $29.50 $28.60 $30.58 $34.45 $43.13 No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $69.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid No Bid
Water Meter Box w/Lid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- | [ CONSOLT HD | [Southern T HAYES [ |EQUIP_ | [ED TR Tr GEO. £ WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE | | DATED cac | |voLunt.| | suppLy | |Pipe peason | | vrRe | |BADGER| |PIPE conTrO| |youns | |sTATE | [THNBRG | |ces BOOTH | |JorDAN | [woop | |acp PKG
VALVE BOX FRAME & TOP labeled
SEWER
25 NoBid | | $98.00 $93.00 $98.97 | | $100.00 $87.75 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $135.00 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid
Valve Box Frame & Top
Valve Box Top 10 NoBid | | $45.00 $30.00 No Bid $30.50 $26.53 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $52.00 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid
CONCRETE VALVE BOX RISER
4 18" x 20" 100 NoBid | | $13.90 $20.99 No Bid $13.95 $12.25 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $14.10 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | $12.00 | NoBid
6y 16" x 20" 200 NoBid | | $22.00 $25.00 No Bid $22.95 $20.50 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $23.25 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | $1400 | NoBid
X X
12"y 18" % 20" 150 NoBid | | $32.00 $27.95 No Bid $34.95 $31.10 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $3550 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | $1800 | NoBid
18"y 16" % 20" 50 NoBid | | $34.00 $30.00 No Bid $36.95 $32.79 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $37.75 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | $2200 | NoBid
INFRA-RISER Valve Box Risers
2 % 18" x 20 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" x 18" x 20" 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
X X
CON-SEAL
1 Con-seal 50 rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
+ Con-
MANHOLE CASTINGS AND LIDS(Labeled
Sanitary Sewer)
N 5 NoBid | | $205.00 | | $204.96 | | $203.16 | | $206.00 |  $186.73 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $195.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
Manhole Casting w/Lid Traffic - #1150
MANHOLE CASTING RISERS
Ma”hcz"; ;Z‘ft;(”lgl/R;s‘;[‘SO"d 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $102.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
- 2
Ma”ho'ez;a:tl”f/gXR'lﬁe"So"d 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $102.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
2
Ma”ho'zesls‘?}i“gg Fj('if;"‘so“d 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $102.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
4 2
Ma”ho'zesls‘?}i“gg Fj('if;"‘so“d 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $102.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
2 2
Manhole C;‘;f';‘gls'ielr;’*dlusmb'e 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | $102.00 | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid
2
BARREL LOCKS
Sarrel Locke 600 No Bid $3.95 $3.30 No Bid $1.67 No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid $1.75 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid
5 NoBid | | $49.50 $46.00 No Bid $60.00 No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $62.50 | | NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid
Barrel Lock Key-Blue
EXCESS FLOW VALVES
175 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | $52.95 | NoBid | | $54.50 No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid

Excess Flow Valve




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT
WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)
DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.

CHRTS- | TCONSOL HD | [Southern T HAYES | [EQUIP._ T [ED. TRI ol GED. = WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE DATED cac | |voLunt.| | suppLy | |Pipe peason | | vrc | |BADGER| |PiPE conTrO | [young | [sTAaTE | |THNBRG | |Cos BOOT JORDAN | |woob | |acp PKG
GAS REGULATORS
Fisher HSR - %éxsf';vccoggr'i r?ém" orifice, 5.5 459 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $55.42 | | NoBid | | NoBid | $21.18 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher HSR1_53/;5)(;;;05”&{:'9/16" orifice, 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | | $55.42 | | No Bid No Bid $21.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 62175‘2 ; Z;gcc;::n Z“" orifice, 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $10519 | NoBid | | NoBid | $122.66 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher 5-209-H 2" Body, Dual Registration %”) g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $609.71 | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
orifice, 3.25-6.0 psig spring
Fisher 5-209-H 2” Body, Dual Registration %”) g No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $621.95 | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
orifice, 1.0-3.25 psig spring
Fisher 2891“;‘;2%"5%0””' Relief 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $400.86 | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-302-H - %;CBSO;?’HZ“" orifice, 5.5"-8.5"| 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $199.94 | No Bid NoBid | $244.72 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-302-H ‘pg'gBSO;?’ng“" orifice, 1.5-3.0 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $242.08 | No Bid NoBid | $244.72 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-202-H F)ZSI;ZS?’IEQ’S orifice, 2.0-5.0 | 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $772.65 | No Bid NoBid | $230.35 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-302 11/2"WBC°:F3)’”1ﬁ‘;O”ﬁce' 55"-85" 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $16854 | No Bid NoBid | $235.99 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fisher S-302 1" Sggr{;“" orifice, 1.5 - 3.0 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $210.68 | No Bid NoBid | $235.99 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS METERS
R-O75 300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
R-415 w/45 LT.conn.
VALVE BOX/VALVE BOX FRAME (Labeled
GAS)
75 NoBid | | $145.00 | | $109.00 No Bid No Bid $107.14 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid |* $69.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Valve Box Frame & Top
Valve Box T 25 No Bid $61.00 $45.00 No Bid No Bid $45.91 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid | | $62.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
alve box 1op
BLACK IRON FITTINGS
' 2 Nipple 50 No Bid $0.80 $0.99 No Bid No Bid $0.52 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.88 No Bid No Bid
A
% 3 Nipple 200 No Bid $0.92 $1.12 No Bid No Bid $0.59 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid No Bid
/A
x4 Nipple 200 No Bid $1.12 $1.40 No Bid No Bid $0.73 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.24 No Bid No Bid
A
i Cap 15 No Bid $1.27 $1.94 No Bid No Bid $1.06 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.25 No Bid No Bid
7\
00 15 No Bid $1.14 $1.20 No Bid No Bid $0.93 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.11 No Bid No Bid
7\
1% 2" Nipple 400 No Bid $1.20 $1.49 No Bid No Bid $0.77 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.31 No Bid No Bid
3 N 25 No Bid $1.27 $1.55 No Bid No Bid $0.82 NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.93 No Bid No Bid
x 3" Nipple
1 4" Nipple 10 No Bid $1.58 $1.96 No Bid No Bid $1.01 NoBid | | NoBid | | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.72 No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- | [ CONSOLT HD Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED. TRI TL GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. | | suPPLY | [Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | |YOUNG | |STATE THNBRG CGS BOOT JORDAN | |woobD GCP PKG
1 x 6" Nipple 20 No Bid $2.21 $2.67 No Bid No Bid $1.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.40 No Bid No Bid
T 200 No Bid $3.05 $3.06 No Bid No Bid $2.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid No Bid
ee
1" Plug 175 No Bid $0.87 $0.99 No Bid No Bid $0.73 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.59 No Bid No Bid
1 o0 50 No Bid $1.96 $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.93 No Bid No Bid
5 No Bid $4.98 $4.95 No Bid No Bid $4.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.91 No Bid No Bid
1%" x 1" Reducer
- 15 No Bid $4.25 $4.50 No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.18 No Bid No Bid
2
1% Coupling 10 No Bid $3.96 $3.95 No Bid No Bid $3.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid
2
1% Plug 10 No Bid $1.98 $2.05 No Bid No Bid $1.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid
2
19" x 6" Nipple 15 No Bid $3.26 $3.97 No Bid No Bid $2.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.56 No Bid No Bid
2
L4 1" 900 20 No Bid $5.58 $5.52 No Bid No Bid $4.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid
2
25 No Bid $16.50 $12.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.25 No Bid No Bid
Leak Detector - Gallon Oatey 30212 Blue
Pipe g%\): Bsecé?;f:al #5 15 No Bid $12.00 $10.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.20 No Bid No Bid
CASING VENT MARKER POSTS
. 50 No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Casing Vent Marker Posts - Gas
. 10 No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Test Station - Gas
Curb Marker - Blue 50 No Bid $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
"Water Valve" w/Arrow
Curb Marker - Green 25 No Bid $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
"Sewer Manhole" w/Arrow
Curb Marker - Yellow 100 No Bid $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
"Gas Valve" w/Arrow
MARKER SIGNS
. 75 No Bid No Bid $11.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Marker Signs- Gas
75 No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
U-Channel Post, #2, Green, 8 ft.
MARKING PAINT
. . 35 cases No Bid No Bid $26.88 No Bid $29.28 $23.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 $34.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.40 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid $29.40
Marking Paint - Safety Yellow
. . 20 cases No Bid No Bid $26.88 No Bid $29.28 $23.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 $34.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.40 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid $29.40
Marking Paint - Safety Blue
. . 10 cases No Bid No Bid $26.88 No Bid $29.28 $23.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 $34.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.40 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid $29.40
Marking Paint - Safety Green
. . _ 20 cases No Bid No Bid $26.88 No Bid $29.28 $23.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 $34.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.40 No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid $29.40
Marking Paint - White
METER VALVES
150 No Bid $16.50 $14.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

¥," Meter Valve




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- CONSOLI HD Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED_ TRI Cl GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. SUPPLY Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | |[YOUNG STATE THNBRG CGS BOOT JORDAN WOOD GCP PKG
STEEL GAS PIPE
. 4,200 ft. No Bid $3.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
¥4" Steel Gas Pipe
PRESSURE GAUGES
Pressure Gauge 0-200 4" Gauge ¥4" Bottom
Mount, All Stainless, 1PSI Increments, Mirror 5 No Bid $138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dial, Glycerin Filled
Pressure Gauge 0-600 4" Gauge ¥4" Bottom
Mount, All Stainless, 1PSI Increments, Mirror 5 No Bid $138.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dial, Glycerin Filled
Pressure Gauge 0-1,000 4" Gauge %4"
Bottom Mount, All Stainless, 1PSI 5 No Bid $142.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Increments, Mirror Dial, Glycerin Filled
3/8" SS Compression Dielectric Union
1- Parker 6-8 DEBTA-SS 25 No Bid $118.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-Parker 6-6 HBZ-SS
1-Parker 8-6 HBZ-SS
3/8" OD 304 stainless steel, Seamless tubing,| 30 f, No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0.035 wall, 5-10 foot pieces
Needle Valve - 3000 psig ¥4" FPT
Connection, PTFE Seat and Seal, Stainless 20 No Bid $38.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Body
1" x 14" Stainless Steel Reducer 20 No Bid $12.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b o s . 20 No Bid $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Y4" x 3" Stainless Steel Nipple
) 20 No Bid $3.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" Stainless Steel Plug
GAS REPAIR CLAMPS
2" x 7%" Full Circle Clamp Mueller #500-07- 5 No Bid $37.25 $46.20 No Bid $29.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.05 No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0235
2"x 12" Full Circle gz'gg“p Mueller #500-12- 5 No Bid $54.50 $77.00 No Bid $47.50 No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid NoBid | | $79.95 No Bid No Bid $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3"x 12" Full Circle %'zaggp Mueller #500-12- 2 No Bid $68.00 $93.50 No Bid $44.50 No Bid NoBid | | NoBid | | NoBid NoBid | | $88.80 No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GAS REPAIR COUPLINGS
— = =
Dresser %" Style 90 Self-Locking, 75 No Bid $15.25 $12.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Compression End Cap
TAP TEES
100 No Bid $20.50 $18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Tap Tee - #H-18102
10 No Bid $112.00 $94.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" Tap Tee - #H-17650
TAPECOAT -H35, GRY-2, 2"x75' rolls
TAPECOAT 96 rolls No Bid $20.00 $23.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




CITY OF GALLATIN - UTILITY DEPARTMENT

WATER/GAS MATERIAL BID OPENING (RESULTS)

DATE: July7,2011 TIME: 2:00 P.M.
CHRIS- CONSOLI HD Southern MT_ HAYES EQUIP. ED_ TRI Cl GEO. E WALTER DIXIE
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY MORE DATED G&C VOLUNT. SUPPLY Pipe DEASON VRC BADGER| |PIPE CONTRO | [YOUNG STATE THNBRG CGS BOOT! JORDAN | |WOOD GCP PKG
Roskote. R28 7 gallons No Bid $42.00 $34.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELD FLANGE
75 No Bid $16.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.19 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.65 No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole weld neck flange
. 75 No Bid $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.60 No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit
. . 75 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" 4-hole Flange Kit, Insulating

2" 90°. weld 50 No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid
2" Cap, weld 75 No Bid $11.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.80 No Bid No Bid
o Tee. weld 15 No Bid $29.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.25 No Bid No Bid
25 No Bid $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.60 No Bid No Bid

2" x 3/4" Reducer, weld

ROTARY GAS METERS
. 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,143.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2" Rotary Gas Meter (2M) counter version

2" Rotary Gas M\féfsriéi'\") counter-drive 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $969.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $685.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rotary Gas Meter (8C)

ROTARY GAS METER SET ‘

5M Meter Set 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,572.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

* DOES NOT MEET BID SPECIFICATIONS
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